© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W W NNNNNNDNNNNDNERRRPR R B P P R
P O © 0 N O 00 WNZEPEPO®©ONOOONWNNPR O

SENATE AMENDMENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210

Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

CHAMBER ACTI ON
Senat e House

Senator Latval a noved the foll owi ng anendnent to anendnent
(690828) :

Senate Amendment (with title amendment)
On page 193, between lines 30 and 31

i nsert:

Section 146. Section 399.001, Florida Statutes, is
created to read

399.001 Short title and purpose.--This chapter nmay be

cited as the "Elevator Safety Act." The purpose of this

chapter is to provide for the safety of life and |linb and to

promote public safety awareness. The use of unsafe and

defective lifting devices inposes a substantial probability of

serious and preventable injury and exposes enpl oyees and the

public to unsafe conditions. The prevention of these injuries

and the protection of enployees and the public fromunsafe

conditions is in the bhest interest of the public. Elevator

personnel perform ng work covered by the Florida Building Code

nmust possess docunented training or experience or both and be

famliar with the operation and safety functions of the

1
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O M WDN PP

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0~ WNIEREPRO O ONOOOO M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

conponents and equi pnent. Trai ning and experience incl udes,

but is not linmted to, recognizing the safety hazards and

perforning the procedures to which they are assigned in

conformance with the requirenents of the Florida Building

Code. This chapter establishes the mni nrum standards for

el evat or personnel

Section 147. Section 399.01, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.01 Definitions.--As used in this chapter, the

term
(1) "Alteration" neans any change or addition to the
vertical conveyance egdiptrent ot her than mai ntenance, repair,

or replacenent.

(2) "Certificate of conpetency" neans a docunent
i ssued by the division which evidences the conpetency of a
person to construct, install, inspect, maintain, or repair any
vertical conveyance etevatoer

(3) "Certificate of operation" neans a docunent issued

by the departnent which indicates that the conveyance has had

the required safety inspection and tests and that fees have

been paid as provided in this chapter

(4) "Conveyance" neans an el evator, dunbwaiter

escal ator, noving sidewal k, platformlift, and stairway
chairlift.

(5) "Departnent" neans the Departnent of Business and
Pr of essi onal Regul at i on. that—authori+zes—an—etevator—owrer—to

I I ey . I I I
I I i i I I I . T

reguirerents—of—this—chapter—

6) (4 "Division" neans the Division of Hotels and

Restaurants of the Departnent of Business and Professional

2
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRRPR B
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BN WNIERERLO O ®ONOOOO M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

Regul ati on.
(7) 5y "Elevator” means one of the follow ng
nmechani cal devi ces:

(a) A hoisting and | owering nechani sm equipped with a
car and platformthat noves in guide rails and serves two or
nore landings to transport naterial or passengers or both.

(b) An escalator, which is a power-driven, inclined
conti nuous stairway used for raising or |owering passengers.

(c) A dunbwaiter, which is a hoisting and | owering
nechani sm equi pped with a car of limted size which noves in
guide rails and serves two or nore | andings.

(d) A noving walk, which is a type of
passenger-carryi ng device on which passengers stand or wal k
and in which the passenger-carrying surface renains parallel
toits direction of notion and is uninterrupted.

(e) Aninclined stairway chairlift, which is a device
used to transport physically handi capped persons over
architectural barriers.

(f) An inclined or vertical wheelchair lift, which is
a device used to transport wheel chair handi capped persons over
architectural barriers.

(8) "Escalator" neans an installation defined as an

escalator in the Florida Buil ding Code.

(9) "Existing installation" neans an installation

defined as an "installation, existing" in the Florida Building
Code.

(10) "Elevator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee"

neans the conmittee appointed by the Secretary of the

Departnent of Busi ness and Professional Regul ation.

(11) "Private residence" nmeans a separate dwelling or

a separate apartnent in a nultiple dwelling which is occupied

3
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

by menbers of a single-fanily unit.

etevator—
(12) A "Servi ce mmi ntenance contract" neans a

contract that provides for routine exam nation, |ubrication
cl eani ng, adjustnent, replacenent of parts, and perfornmance of
appl i cabl e code-required safety tests such as on a traction
el evator and annual relief pressure test on a hydraulic
el evator and any ot her service, repair, and mai ntenance
sufficient to ensure the safe operation of the elevator

(13) "Tenporarily dormant conveyance" neans a

conveyance whose power supply has been di sconnected by

renovi ng fuses and pl aci ng a padl ock on the nmainline

di sconnect switch in the "OFF" position. The car is parked and

the hoi stway doors are in the closed and | atched position. A

wire seal is installed on the mainline disconnect switch by a

certificate of conpetency elevator inspector. This

installation may not be used again until it has been put in

safe running order and is in condition for use. Annua

i nspections shall continue for the duration of the tenporarily

dormant status by a certificate of conpetency el evator

i nspector. The tenporarily dormant status is renewable on an

annual basis and may not exceed a 5-year period. The inspector

shall file a report with the chief el evator inspector

describing the current conditions. The wire seal and padl ock

may not be renoved for any purpose without permnission fromthe

el evator inspector.

(14) "Tenporary operation pernmit" neans a document

i ssued by the departnent which pernits the tenporary use of a

nonconpl i ant vertical conveyance as provided by rule.

4
6:13 PM 05/ 03/ 01 s2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

(15) "Registered el evator conpany" neans an entity

regi stered with and authorized by the division enpl oyi ng

persons to construct, install, inspect, nmaintain, or repair

any vertical conveyance. Each regi stered el evator conpany nust

annually register with the division and mai ntain genera

liability insurance coverage in the mini numanounts set by the

di vi si on.
(16) "Certified elevator inspector" is a natura

person registered with and aut horized by the division to

construct, install, inspect, nmaintain, or repair any vertica

conveyance, after having properly acquired the qualified

el evator inspector credential fromthe National Association of

El evator Safety Authorities. Such person shall remain so

aut hori zed by the division only upon providi ng annual proof of

conpl etion of 8 hours of continuing education and the

gual i fied el evator inspector credential remains in good

standing with the National Association of Elevator Safety

Authorities. A licensed nechani cal engi neer whose |license is

in good standing may be authorized as a certified el evator

i nspector by the division. Each certified el evator inspector

nmust annually register with the division and maintain genera

liability insurance coverage in the mini numanounts set by the

di vi si on.
(17) "Certified elevator technician" neans a natura

person authorized by the division to construct, install

mai ntain, or repair any vertical conveyance, after havi ng been

i ssued an elevator certificate of conpetency by the division

Each certified elevator technician nmust annually register with

the division and maintain general liability insurance coverage

in the mni num anounts set by the division

(18) "Elevator hel per" nmeans a natural person

5
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BM WNIEREPRO O ®NOOOO M WN PR O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

perforning work under the direct supervision of a certified

el evator inspector or an el evator technician to construct,

install, maintain, or repair any vertical conveyance.

(19) "Elevator certificate of conpetency" neans a

credential issued by the division to any individual natura

person successfully conpleting an exam nati on as prescribed by

rule and paying a fee of $50. Such credential shall be valid

for and expire at the end of 1 year, and nmay be renewed by the

di vi si on when the division receives proof of the el evator

certificate of conpetency holder's conpletion of 8 hours of

conti nui ng education and a renewal fee of $50.

All other building transportation terns are defined in the

current Florida Building Code.
Section 148. Section 399.02, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

399.02 General requirenents.--

(1) The Elevator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee
th—vi-stort shall devel op and subnmit to the Division of Hotels
and Restaurants reconmendations regarding revisions to the

el evator safety code so that it is the sane as or sinilar to
the | atest versions of ASME Al17.1, ASME Al17.3, and ASME A18. 1.
Fl orida Buil ding Conmmi ssion for consideration an el evator

safety code, which, when adopted within the Florida Building
Code, applies to the installation, relocation, or alteration
of an elevator for which a permt has been issued after
Cctober 1, 1990, and which nust be the sane as or sinmlar to
the latest revision of "The Safety Code for Elevators and
Escal ators ASME Al17.1."

(2) This chapter covers the design, construction

operation, inspection, testing, maintenance, alteration, and

6
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

repair of the foll owi ng equi pnent and its associated parts and

hoi st ways:
(a) Hoisting and | owering nechani sns equi pped with a

car or platformwhich nove between two or nore | andings. This

equi pnent includes, but is not linmted to, elevators, platform

lifts, and stairway chairlifts.

(b) Power-driven stairways and wal kways for carrying

persons between | andi ngs. This equi pnment includes, but is not

limted to, escalators and novi ng wal ks.

(c) Hoisting and | owering nechani sns equi pped with a

car which serves two or nore landings and is restricted to the

carrying of material by its limted size or linmted access to

the car. This equipnent includes, but is not limted to,

dunmbwai ters, material lifts, and dunbwaiters with

automati c-transfer devices.

(3) Equi pnent not covered by this chapter includes,

but is not limted to:

(a) Personnel hoists and material hoists within the
scope of ASME Al10, as adopted by the Florida Buil ding Code.

(b) Man lifts within the scope of ASME A90.1, as
adopted by the Florida Buil di ng Code.

(c) Mbobile scaffolds, towers, and platforns within the
scope of ANSI A92, as adopted by the Florida Building Code.

(d) Powered platforns and equi pnent for exterior and

interior maintenance within the scope of ASME A120.1, as
adopted by the Florida Buil di ng Code.

(e) Conveyors and rel ated equi prent within the scope
of ASME B20.1, as adopted by the Florida Buil ding Code.

(f) Cranes, derricks, hoists, hooks, jacks, and slings
within the scope of ASME B30, as adopted by the Florida
Bui | di ng Code.

6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

(g) Industrial trucks within the scope of ASME B56, as
adopted by the Florida Buil di ng Code.
(h) Portable equi pnent, except for portable escal ators

that are covered by the Florida Buil ding Code.

(i) Tiered or piling machines used to nove naterials

to and from storage | ocated and operating entirely within one

story.
(j) Equipnent for feeding or positioning nmaterials at

nmachi ne tools and printing presses.

(k) Skip or furnace hoists.

(1) Wharf ranps.

(m Railroad car lifts or dunpers.

(n) Line jacks, false cars, shafters, noving

platfornms, and sinilar equi pment used for installing an

el evator by a contractor licensed in this state.

(o) Automated people novers at airports.

(p) Elevators in television and radi o towers.

(q) Hand-operated dunbwaiters.

(r) Sewage punp station lifts.

(s) Autonohile parking lifts.

(t) Equipnent covered ins. 1.2 of the Elevator Safety

Code.

(u) Elevators, inclined stairway chairlifts, and

inclined or vertical wheelchair lifts located in private

resi dences.

6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRRPR B R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BN WNIEREPRO O ®NOO O M WN PR O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

(4) 3 Each el evator shall have a serial nunber

assi gned by the departnent divisioen painted on or attached to
the elevator car in plain view and also to the driving
nechani sm This serial nunber shall be shown on all required
certificates and pernits.

(5)t4)y(a) The construction permtholder is responsible
for the correction of violations and deficiencies until the
el evator has been inspected and a certificate of operation has
been i ssued by the departnent eivistenr. The construction
permtholder is responsible for all tests of new and altered
equi pnent until the elevator has been inspected and a
certificate of operation has been issued by the departnent
thi-vi-sion

(b) The el evator owner is responsible for the safe
operation and proper mmintenance of the elevator after it has
been inspected and a certificate of operation has been issued
by the departnent divisionr. The responsibilities of the
el evator owner may be assigned by | ease.

(c) The elevator owner shall report to the departnent
thi—vi-stort 60 days before the expiration of the certificate of
operati on whether there exists a service nmintenance contract,
with whomthe contract exists, and the details concerning the
provi sions and inplenentation of the contract which the
depart nment eivi-ston requires. The departnent eivisten shal
keep the nanes of conpanies with whomthe contract exists
confidential pursuant to the public records exenption provided
ins. 119.14(4)(b)3. This annual contract report nust be made
on fornms supplied by the departnent eiwisiofr. The el evator

9
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BM WNIEREPRO O ®NOOOO M WN PR O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

owner nust report any nmaterial change in the service

nmai nt enance contract no fewer than 30 days before the
effective date of the change. The departnent eivisten shal
det erm ne whether the provisions of the service naintenance
contract and its inplenentation ensure the safe operation of
t he el evator.

(6) £5); The departnment diviston is enmpowered to carry
out all of the provisions of this chapter relating to the

i nspection and regul ation of elevators and to enforce the

provi sions of the Florida Building Code whiech—govern—etevators
I . . I . e . o I
I " et I . f e
(7) 6> The El evator Safety Technical Advisory
Conmi tt ee divistonr shall annually review the provisions of the
Safety Code for Elevators and Escal ators ASVME Al7.1, ASME
Al18.1,or other rel ated nodel codes and anendnents thereto,

concurrent with the update of the Florida Building Code and

reconmend to the Florida Building Cormission revisions to the
Florida Building Code to naintain the protection of the public
health, safety, and welfare

Section 149. Section 399.03, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.03 Design, installation, and alteration of
conveyances etevators. --

10
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

(1) A conveyance covered by this chapter may not be

erected, constructed, installed, or altered within buildings

or structures unless a permit has been obtained fromthe

departnent before the work is comenced. When any materi al

alteration is nade, the device nust conformto applicable

requi renents of the Florida Building Code for the alteration

A pernit required hereunder may not be issued except to a

person, firm or corporation holding a current el evator

contractor's license issued under this chapter. A copy of the

permt nust be kept at the construction site at all tines

while the work is in progress.

(2) The departnent shall provide by rule for permt

application requirenments and permt fees.

(3) Pernits may be revoked for the foll owi ng reasons:

(a) There are any fal se statenents or

m srepresentations as to the material facts in the

application, plans, or specifications on which the pernit was

based.
(b) The permit was issued in error and not in

accordance with the code or rules.

(c) The work detail ed under the pernit is not being

perforned in accordance with the provisions of the

application, plans, or specifications or with the code or

conditions of the permt.

(d) The construction pernitholder to whomthe pernmt

was issued fails or refuses to conply with a stop work order

(4) A pernmt expires if:

(a) The work authorized by the permit is not conmrenced

within 6 nonths after the date of issuance, or within a

shorter period of tine as the departnment nay specify at the

time the pernmit is issued.

11
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

(b) The work is suspended or abandoned for a period of

60 days, or such shorter period of tine as the departnent nay

specify at the tinme the pernit is issued, after the work has

been started. For good cause, the departnent may allow a

di scretionary extension for the foregoi ng peri od.

(5) Al new conveyance installations nust be perforned

by a person to whoma license to install or service a

conveyance has been issued. Subsequent to installation, the

licensed person, firm or conpany nust certify conpliance with

the applicable sections of this chapter and the Florida

Bui | di ng Code. Before any vertical conveyance is used, except

those in a private residence it nust be inspected by a

| icensed inspector not enployed or associated with the

el evator construction pernithol der and certified as neeting

the safety provisions of the Florida Building Code. Upon

successful inspection, the owner or |essee nust apply to the

departnent for a certificate of operation fromthe departnent.

A fee as prescribed in this chapter nust be paid for the

certificate of operation. It is the responsibility of the

| icensed el evator construction pernmitholder to conplete and

submit a first-tinme registration for a new installation

Vertical conveyances, including stairway chairlifts, and

inclined or vertical wheelchair lifts located in private

residences are not required to obtain a certificate of

operati on under this chapter

(6) Acertificate of operation expires July 31 of each

year and nust be renewed prior to continued use of the

conveyance. A certificate of operation nust be clearly

di spl ayed on or in each conveyance or in the nachi ne roomfor

use by and for the benefit of inspectors and code enforcenent

personnel. Certificates of operation nay only be renewed for

12
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BN WNIERERPRO O O-NODOO M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

vertical conveyances having a current satisfactory inspection

(7) The permitholder shall notify the departnent, in

witing, at |least 7 days before conpletion of the work and

shall, in the presence of a licensed el evator inspector not

associ ated with or enployed by the installing conpany or

contractor, subject the newy installed, relocated, or altered

portions of the elevator to tests required to show that the

el evator neets the applicable provisions of the Florida
Bui | di ng Code.
(8) 1)y Each elevator shall conply with the edition of

the Florida Building Code or Elevator Safety Code that was in

effect at the tine of receipt of application for the
construction pernit for the elevator

(9) 2y Each alteration to, or relocation of, an
el evator shall conply with the edition of the Florida Building
Code or Elevator Safety Code that was in effect at the tine of

receipt of the application for the construction permt for the
alteration or relocation.

(10) 3 Wien any change is made in the classification
of an elevator, the elevator shall conmply with all of the
requi rements of the version of the Florida Building Code or
El evator Safety Code that were in effect at the tine of

receipt of the application for the construction permt for the
change in classification

Section 150. Section 399.049, Florida Statutes, is
created to read

399.049 Certificate of conpetency.--

(1) SUSPENSI ON OR REVOCATI ON OF LI CENSE OR CERTI FI CATE
OF COVPETENCY. - - The departnent nmay suspend or revoke a |icense

or certificate of conpetency issued under this chapter or

i npose an adnministrative penalty of up to $1,000 per violation

13
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRRPR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0~ WNIEREPRO O ®NOOD O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

upon any licensee or certificateholder who commits any one or

nore of the foll owing violations:

(a) Any false statenent as to a naterial nmatter in the

appl i cati on.

(b) Fraud, msrepresentation, or bribery in securing a

license or certificate of conpetency.

(c) Failure to notify the departnent and the

certificate-of-operation holder of a conveyance covered by

this chapter that is not in conpliance with the provisions of

the el evator safety code incorporated into the Florida
Bui | di ng Code.

(d) Violation of any provision of this chapter

(2) DI SClPLINARY ACTION. --Any disciplinary action
taken under this chapter nmust conply with chapter 120 and any

rul es adopted thereunder
Section 151. Section 399.061, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

399. 061 Inspections; correction of deficiencies.--
(1)(a) Al elevators or other conveyances subject to

this chapter nust be annually inspected by a certified

el evator inspector through a third-party inspection service,

or by a nunicipality or county under contract with the

di vi sion, pursuant to s. 399.13. If the elevator or other

conveyance i s by—athird-—party—itnspection—service—ecertifred—as
a—ttat-Hed—etevator—tnspeetor—or nmi ntai ned pursuant to a

servi ce mmi ntenance contract continuously in force, it shal

be i nspected at | east once every 2 years by a certified

el evator inspector who is not enpl oyed by or otherw se

associ ated with the nai ntenance conpany; however, if the

el evator is not an escalator or a dunbwaiter, serves only two

adj acent floors, and is covered by a service nai ntenance

14
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

contract, an inspection is not required so long as the service

contract remains in effect. A statenment verifying the

exi stence, performance, and cancellation of each service
mai nt enance contract nust be filed annually with the division

as prescribed by rule. AH—etevators—coveredby—a—service

(b) The division may inspect an el evator whenever
necessary to ensure its safe operation or when a third-party

i nspection service is not available for a routine inspection

(2) The division may shatH enploy state el evator
i nspectors to conduct the inspections as required by
subsection (1) and may charge an inspection fee for each

i nspection in an anpbunt sufficient to cover the costs of that

i nspection, as provided by rule. Each state el evator inspector

shall hold a certificate of conpetency issued by the division
(3) \Whenever the division determines fromthe results
of any inspection that, in the interest of the public safety,
an elevator is in an unsafe condition, the division nmay sea
the el evator or order the discontinuance of the use of the
el evator until the division determ nes by inspection that such
el evator has been satisfactorily repaired or replaced so that
the el evator may be operated in a safe manner
(4) \When the division determnes that an elevator is
in violation of this chapter, the division may issue an order
to the elevator owner requiring correction of the violation
Section 152. Section 399.07, Florida Statutes, is

15
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRRPR B R
P O © 0 ~N O OB~ WNIEREPRO O ®ONOOOO M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

amended to read:

399.07 Certificates of operation; tenporary operation
permts; fees.--

(1)(a) Acertificate of operation nay not be issued
until the elevator conpany supervisor signs an affidavit
stating that the el evator conpany supervisor directly
supervi sed construction or installation of the elevator

(b) The certificate of operation is valid for a period
of 1 year unless sooner suspended or revoked. The departnent
thi—vi-stort shall by rule adopt a fee schedule for the renewal of
certificates of operation. The renewal period conmences on
August 1 of each year

(c) The certificate of operation nust be posted in a
conspi cuous | ocation on the elevator and nust be franmed with a
transparent cover.

(d) The departnent division shall charge an annual fee
for issuance of a certificate of operation in anount to be set
by rul e. Thefeernust—be—set—by+ruteinran—arount—hot—to
exceet—$1060for—an—etevator—not—covered—by—a service
maintenance—contract—or—$50Ffor—an—elevator—covered-by—=a
serviee—aintenance—ecohtraect. However, a renewal application
for a certificate of operation filed with the departnment after

expiration date of the certificate nust be acconpanied by a
del i nquency fee of $50 in addition to the annual renewal fee
and any other fees required by |aw. The fees nust be deposited
into the Hotel and Restaurant Trust Fund.

(2)(a) The departnent divistoenr nmay i ssue a tenporary
operation permt authorizing the tenporary use of an el evator
during installation or alteration to an el evator conpany or
general contractor acting as a general agent of an el evator
conpany. A tenporary operation permt nmay not be issued unti

16
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRRPR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BN WNIEREPRO O ®NO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

the el evator has been inspected by a state el evator inspector
and tested under contract |oad; the hoistway is fully

encl osed; the hoistway doors and interlocks are installed; the
car is conpletely enclosed, including door or gate and top

all electrical safety devices are installed and properly
functioning; and term nal stopping equipnent is in place for a
safe runby and proper clearance. Wen a car is provided with
a tenporary enclosure, the operating neans nust be by constant
pressure push-button or lever-type switch. The car may not
exceed the mnimum safe operating speed of the elevator, and

t he governor tripping speed nust be set in accordance with the
operating speed of the el evator

(b) A tenporary operation permt nust be issued for a
period not to exceed 30 days. The pernit nmay be renewed at
the discretion of the departnent division

(c) When a tenporary operation pernmt is issued, the
permt, together with a notice bearing a statenent that the
el evator has not been finally approved by a state el evator
i nspector, nust be conspicuously posted in the elevator

(d) The departnent division shall charge a fee, set by
rule in an amount not greater than $100, for each tenporary
operation permt. The fee nust be deposited in the Hotel and
Rest aurant Trust Fund.

(3) The certificate of operation shall contain the
text of s. 823.12, relating to the prohibition against snoking
in elevators.

(4) In addition to subsection (3), the designation "NO
SMXKI NG' along with the international synbol for no snoking
shal | be conspicuously displayed within the interior of the
el evator in the plain view of the public.

(5) Except as authorized by a tenporary operation

17
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRRPR B R
P O © 0 ~N O UM WNIEREPRO O ®ONO®DOO M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

permt, the operation or use of any newy install ed,

rel ocated, or altered elevator is prohibited until the

el evator has passed the tests and inspections required by this
chapter and a certificate of operation has been issued.

(6) The departnent eiwi-stoft nay suspend any
certificate of operation if it finds that the elevator is not
in conpliance with this chapter or of rules adopted under this
chapter. The suspension remains in effect until the
depart nent ei~wi-ston determi nes, by inspection, that the
el evat or has been brought into conpliance.

Section 153. Section 399.10, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.10 Enforcenment of law.--1t shall be the duty of
t he departnent divisionr to enforce the provisions of this
chapter. The departnent ¢i~visionr shall have rul emaki ng
authority to carry out the provisions of this chapter

Section 154. Section 399.105, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.105 Adninistrative fines.--

(1) Any person who fails to conply with the reporting
requirements of s. 399.02 or with the reasonabl e requests of
t he departnent ¢i-vision to deterni ne whether the provisions of
a service mmintenance contract and its inplenentation assure
safe el evator operation is subject to an adninistrative fine
not greater than$l, 000$560 in addition to any other penalty
provi ded by | aw

(2) Any person who conmences the operation
installation, relocation, or alteration of any elevator for
which a permt or certificate is required by this chapter
wi t hout havi ng obtained fromthe departnent divisitoen the
permt or certificate is subject to an adm nistrative fine not

18
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O DN PP

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

greater than$l, 000$566 in addition to any other penalty
provided by law. No fine may be inposed under this subsection
for commencing installation without a construction pernmit if
such permt is issued within 60 days after the actua
conmencenent of installation.

(3) An elevator owner who continues to operate an
el evator after notice to discontinue its use is subject to an
adnmi ni strative fine not greater than$l, 000$566 for each day
the el evator has been operated after the service of the
notice, in addition to any other penalty provided by |aw.

(4) An elevator owner who fails to conply with an
order issued under s. 399.061(4) within 60 days after its
i ssuance is subject, in addition to any other penalty provided
by law, to an adm nistrative fine set by the departnent
eivistenr in an anpbunt not to exceed$l, 000$5686.

(5) Al administrative fines collected shall be
deposited into the Hotel and Restaurant Trust Fund.

Section 155. Section 399.106, Florida Statutes, is
created to read

399.106 Elevator Safety Techni cal Advisory
Conmittee. --

(1) The Elevator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee

is created within the Departnent of Business and Prof essi ona

Regul ati on, Division of Hotels and Restaurants, consisting of

seven nenbers to be appoi nted by the Secretary of the

Departnent of Busi ness and Professional Regul ation as foll ows:

one representative froma nmajor el evator nanufacturing conpany

or its authorized representative; one representative from an

el evator servicing conpany; one representative froma building

desi gn profession; one representative of the general public;

one representative of a local government in this state; one

19
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN P

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BM WNIEREPRO O ®NOOOO M WN PR O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

representative of a building ower or manager; and one

representative of labor involved in the installation,

nmai nt enance, and repair of elevators. The purpose of the

Conmittee is to provide technical assistance to the division

in support of protecting the health, safety, and welfare of

the public; to give the division the benefit of the comittee

nenbers' know edge and experience concerning the industries

and i ndi vi dual businesses affected by the |laws and rul es

admi ni stered by the division

(2) The committee nenbers shall serve staggered terns

of 4 years to be set by rule without salary, but nay receive

fromthe state expenses for per diemand travel. The

conm ssion shall appoint one of the nenbers to serve as chair.

(3) The committee shall neet and organi ze not |ater

than 45 days prior to the convening of the 2002 Legi sl ature.
This committee termn nates Decenber 31, 2003
(4) The committee nmay consult with engineering

authorities and organi zati ons concerned with standard safety

codes for reconmendations to the departnent regarding rul es

and regul ati ons governi ng the operation, nmintenance,

servicing, construction, alteration, installation, or

i nspection of vertical conveyances subject to this chapter

Section 156. Section 399.11, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.11 Penalties.--

(1) Any person who violates any of the provisions of
this chapter or the rules of the departnent eivisionr is guilty
of a m sdeneanor of the second degree, punishable as provided
ins. 775.082 or s. 775.083.

(2) Any person who falsely represents hinself or
hersel f as credential ed under this chapter ahoetder—of—=a

20
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BN WNIEREPRO O ®ONODOO M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

certiHecate—of—conpetency—+ssuetpursvant—to—5—399-045 i s
guilty of a m sdeneanor of the second degree, punishable as
provided in s. 775.082 or s. 775.083.

Section 157. Section 399.125, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399. 125 Reporting of elevator accidents or incidents;

penal ties.--Wthin 5 working days after any accident or
i ncident occurring in or upon any elevator, the certificate of

operation holder shall report the accident or incident to the

di vision on a forum prescribed by the division. Failure to

timely file this report is a violation of this chapter and

will subject the certificate of operation hol der whitch

to an administrative fine, to be inposed by the division, in
an anount not to exceed$l, 000$566.

Section 158. Section 399.13, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.13 Delegation of authority to nmunicipalities or
counties.--

(1) The departnent ei-vi-sioft nay enter into contracts
with municipalities or counties under which such
muni cipalities or counties will issue construction pernits,
tenporary operation permts, and certificates of operation
will provide inspection of elevators; and will enforce the

21
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O WDN PP

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BM WNIEREPRO O ®NOOOO M WN PR O

SENATE AMENDVENT
Bill No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

appl i cabl e provisions of the Florida Building Code, as
required by this chapter. Each such agreenent shall include a
provision that the nmunicipality or county shall maintain for
i nspection by the departnent divistor copies of al
applications for pernits issued, a copy of each inspection
report issued, and proper records show ng the nunber of
certificates of operation issued; shall include a provision
that each required inspection be conducted by the holder of a
certificate of conpetency issued by the departnent eivision
and may include such other provisions as the departnent
th—vi-stort deens necessary.

(2) The departnent divi-stoft nay nake i nspections of
el evators in such nunicipality or county for the purpose of
determi ning that the provisions of this chapter are being net
and may cancel the contract with any nmunicipality or county
whi ch the departnent divist+onr finds has failed to conply with
such contract or the provisions of this chapter. The
anmendnents to chapter 399 by this act shall apply only to the
installation, relocation, or alteration of an el evator for
which a permt has been issued after Cctober 1, 1990.

Section 159. Sections 399.045 and 399.05, Florida
Statutes, are repeal ed

(Redesi gnat e subsequent sections.)

=—=============== T | T L E A MENDMENT ===============
And the title is anended as foll ows:
On page 204, line 10, after the sem col on

i nsert:

22
6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

SENATE AMENDVENT
No. CS for SB 2210
Anmendnment No. Bar code 531594

creating s. 399.001, F.S.; creating the

"El evator Safety Act"; anending s. 399.01

F.S.; defining terms; anending ss. 399. 02,
399.03, F.S.; providing regulatory standards
for elevators and simlar conveyances;
providing for pernmits for construction or
alteration of elevators and simlar

conveyances; creating s. 399.049, F.S.
providing for licenses and certificates of
conpet ency; providing for disciplinary action
anmending s. 399.061, F.S.; providing for annua
i nspections and fees; anending ss. 399. 07,

399. 10, 399.105, F.S.; revising adm nistrative
fines and fee-setting procedures; conformng
provisions; creating s. 399.106, F.S.; creating
the El evator Safety Technical Advisory
Committee; providing for its nenbership and
authority; anmending s. 399.11, 399.125, 399.13,
F.S.; conformng provisions; repealing s.

399. 045, F.S., which provides for a certificate
of conpetency; repealing s. 399.05, F.S., which
provides for construction pernits;

23

6:13 PM 05/03/01 $2210clc-1920a




