ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

1

2 An act relating to business regul ation

3 anending s. 509.032, F.S.; providing for annua
4 rat her than biannual inspections of transient

5 and nontransi ent apartnents; revising notice

6 and license requirenments for tenporary food

7 service events; amending s. 509.039, F.S.

8 revising requirenents for testing and

9 certification of food service nmanagers;

10 anmending s. 509.251, F.S.; excluding certain
11 fees fromthe nmaxi nrum aggregate |icense fee for
12 public food service establishnments; anending s
13 509.291, F.S.; providing for increased

14 coordi nation and consultation anong the

15 Secretary of Business and Professiona

16 Regul ati on, the Division of Hotels and

17 Restaurants, and the advisory council; anending
18 s. 509.302, F.S.; increasing the annual fee

19 collected for the purpose of funding the
20 Hospitality Education Program anending s
21 399.01, F.S.; revising and renoving
22 definitions; requiring that el evator service
23 nmai nt enance contracts be nmade available to the
24 Depart nent of Business and Professiona
25 Regul ati on upon request for oversight purposes;
26 revising qualifications for an el evator
27 certificate of conpetency; anending s. 399.02,
28 F.S.; providing that each el evator owner is
29 responsi ble for inspections and correction of
30 code deficiencies; elinnating a requirenent
31 that the departnent review service nai ntenance

1
CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

1 contracts and deterni ne whether they ensure

2 safe operation; anending s. 399.03, F.S.

3 revising requirenents relating to the design

4 installation, and alteration of conveyances;

5 provi di ng additional requirenments for issuance

6 of elevator permts; revising reporting

7 requi renments; providing requirenents for

8 tenporary operation inspections; anending s.

9 399.049, F.S.; revising grounds for suspension
10 or revocation of certification or registration
11 anending s. 399.061, F.S.; elimnating the
12 requi renment that annual inspections be
13 conducted through third-party inspection
14 services; revising reporting requirenents
15 relating to service mai ntenance contracts;

16 revising requirenents relating to the

17 correction of violations; anmending s. 399. 07,

18 F.S.; extending the period of validity of

19 certificates of operation from1l to 2 years;

20 revising fee provisions to conform anending s.

21 399. 105, F.S.; providing administrative fines

22 for violations relating to reporting, operating

23 a seal ed elevator, and conplying with

24 correction orders; elimnating a restriction on

25 the i ssuance of an administrative fine relating

26 to conmencing installation without a

27 construction pernit; anending s. 399.106, F.S.

28 correcting a reference; anending s. 399. 125,

29 F.S.; elimnating the requirenent to report

30 el evator incidents; anmending s. 399.13, F.S.

31 allowing nunicipalities or counties that assune
2

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNRPLO O N D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

el evator inspection duties to hire private

i nspectors to conduct inspections; anending s.
509.036, F.S.; conforming a reference; anendi ng
ss. 471.003, 471.0035, 471.005, 471.007,
471.013, 471.015, 471.019, 471.0195, 471.021
471.023, 471.025, 471.027, 471.031, 471.033,
471.037, F.S.; revising provisions applying to
regi stered professional engineers to apply to

| i censed professional engineers; anending s.
210.08, F.S.; providing nethods other than a
bond for deal ers, agents, or distributing
agents to guarantee tax paynent to the Division
of Al coholic Beverages and Tobacco of the
Depart nent of Business and Prof essi onal

Regul ation; providing an effective date.

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

Section 1. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) and
par agraph (c) of subsection (3) of section 509.032, Florida
Statutes, are anended to read

509.032 Duties.--

(2) I NSPECTI ON OF PREM SES. - -

(a) The division has responsibility and jurisdiction
for all inspections required by this chapter. The division
has responsibility for quality assurance. Each |licensed
establ i shnent shall be inspected at |east biannually, except
for transient and nontransient apartnents, which shall be

i nspected at |least annually,and shall be inspected at such

other tinmes as the division deternmnes is necessary to ensure
the public's health, safety, and welfare. The division shal

3

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

establish a systemto deternine inspection frequency. Public
| odging units classified as resort condomi niuns or resort

dwel lings are not subject to this requirenent, but shall be
made available to the division upon request. [If, during the

i nspection of a public |odging establishnment classified for
renting to transient or nontransient tenants, an inspector
identifies vulnerable adults who appear to be victinms of
neglect, as defined in s. 415.102, or, in the case of a
building that is not equi pped with automatic sprinkler

systens, tenants or clients who nmay be unable to sel f-preserve
in an energency, the division shall convene neetings with the
foll owi ng agenci es as appropriate to the individual situation
the Departnent of Health, the Departnent of Elderly Affairs,
the area agency on aging, the local fire marshal, the landlord
and affected tenants and clients, and other rel evant

organi zations, to develop a plan which inproves the prospects
for safety of affected residents and, if necessary, identifies
alternative living arrangenents such as facilities |icensed
under part |l or part IIl of chapter 400.

(3) SANI TARY STANDARDS; EMERGENCI ES; TEMPORARY FOOD
SERVI CE EVENTS. - - The divi sion shall

(c) Administer a public notification process for
tenmporary food service events and distribute educationa
mat erials that address safe food storage, preparation, and
servi ce procedures.

1. Sponsors of tenporary food service events shal
notify the division not less than 3 days prior to the
schedul ed event of the type of food service proposed, the tine
and | ocation of the event, a conplete list of food service
vendor s vendor—ewners—and—operaters participating in the eaeh

event, the nunber of individual food service facilities each

4

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed
1| vendor will operate at the event,and the identification
2 | nunber of each food service vendor's current |icense as a
3 | nuwbers—of—att public food service establishnent or tenporary
4 | food service event |icensee estabtshrents—partiecrpating—in
5| each—event. Notification may be conpleted orally, by
6 | tel ephone, in person, or in witing. A public food service
7 | establishnment or food service vendor may not use this
8 | notification process to circunvent the |license requirenents of
9| this chapter.
10 2. The division shall keep a record of al
11| notifications received for proposed tenporary food service
12 | events and shall provide appropriate educational materials to
13 | the event sponsors, including the food-recovery brochure
14 | devel oped under s. 570.0725.
15 3.a. A public food service establishnment or other food
16 | service vendor nust obtain one of the followi ng classes of &
17| license fromthe division: an individual |icense, for a fee of
18 | no nore than $105, for each tenporary food service event in
19 | which it participates; or an annual license, for a fee of no
20 | nore than $1,000, that entitles the licensee to participate in
21| an unlimted nunber of food service events during the |license
22 | period. The division shall establish |icense fees, by rule,
23| and may linmt the nunber of food service facilities a |licensee
24 | may operate at a particular tenporary food service event under
25| a single license.
26 b. Public food service establishnents hol di ng current
27 | licenses fromthe division may operate under the regul ations
28 | of such a license at tenporary food service events of 3 days
29 | or less in duration
30 Section 2. Section 509.039, Florida Statutes, is
31 | anended to read

5

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

509. 039 Food service nanager certification.--It is the
duty of the division to adopt, by rule, food safety protection
standards for the training and certification of all food
servi ce managers who are responsible for the storage,
preparation, display, or serving of foods to the public in
establ i shnents regul ated under this chapter. The standards

adopted by the division shall be consistent with the Standards

for Accreditation of Food Protection Manager Certification

Prograns adopted by the Conference for Food Protection. These

standards are to be adopted by the division to ensure that,
upon successfully passing a test, approved by the Conference

for Food Protection,a manager of a food service establishnent

shal | have denpnstrated a know edge of basic food protection
practices. The division may contract with an organi zation

offering a training and certification programthat conplies

with division standards and results in a certification

recogni zed by the Conference for Food Protection Fhese

e dbs—shal—al hi el

atthorizes—pri-vate—or—pubtec—agenreires to conduct an approved
test and certify all test the results ef—thesetests to the

di vision. O her organizations offering prograns that neet the

sane requirenents nay al so conduct approved tests and certify

all test results to the division. The division may charge the

organi zation it contracts with a fee of not nore than $5 per

certified test to cover the adm nistrative costs of the

di vision for the food service nmanager training and
certification program fhe—feefor—thetest—shatt—not—exceed

$50— Al nanagers enployed by a food service establishnment

nmust have passed an approved this test and received a
certificate attesting thereto. Mnagers have a period of 90
days after enployment to pass the required test. The ranking

6

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

of food service establishnents is also preenpted to the state;
provi ded, however, that any |ocal ordi nances establishing a
ranki ng systemin existence prior to Cctober 1, 1988, nay
remain in effect.

Section 3. Subsections (1) and (2) of section 509. 251,
Fl ori da Statutes, are anended to read

509. 251 License fees.--

(1) The division shall adopt, by rule, a schedul e of
fees to be paid by each public |odging establishnent as a
prerequisite to issuance or renewal of a |icense. Such fees
shall be based on the nunber of rental units in the
establ i shnent. The aggregate fee per establishnment charged any

public | odging establishnment but shall not exceed $1, 000;

however, the fees described in paragraphs (a) and (b) nmay not

be included as part of the aggregate fee subject to this cap

Resort condomi niumunits within separate buildings or at
separate | ocations but nmanaged by one licensed agent may be
conbined in a single license application, and the division
shall charge a license fee as if all units in the application
are in a single licensed establishnent. Resort dwelling units
may be licensed in the sane manner as condom niumunits. The
fee schedule shall require an establishnment which applies for
an initial license to pay the full license fee if application
is made during the annual renewal period or nore than 6 nonths
prior to the next such renewal period and one-half of the fee
if application is nmade 6 nonths or less prior to such period.
The fee schedul e shall include fees collected for the purpose
of funding the Hospitality Education Program pursuant to s.
509. 302, which are payable in full for each application
regardl ess of when the application is submtted.

7

CODING:Words st+ieken are del etions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(a) Upon naking initial application or an application
for change of ownership, the applicant shall pay to the
division a fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in
addition to any other fees required by I aw, which shall cover
all costs associated with initiating regulation of the
est abl i shrent .

(b) Alicense renewal filed with the division within
30 days after the expiration date shall be acconpanied by a
delinquent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in
addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by
law. A license renewal filed with the division nore than 30
but not nore than 60 days after the expiration date shall be
acconpani ed by a delinquent fee as prescribed by rule, not to
exceed $100, in addition to the renewal fee and any other fees
required by | aw

(2) The division shall adopt, by rule, a schedul e of
fees to be paid by each public food service establishnent as a
prerequisite to issuance or renewal of a license. The fee
schedul e shall prescribe a basic fee and additional fees based
on seating capacity and services offered. The aggregate fee
per establishnment charged any public food service
establ i shnent may not exceed $400; however, the fees described

i n paragraphs (a) and (b) may not be included as part of the

aggregate fee subject to this cap. The fee schedul e shal

require an establishnent which applies for an initial |icense
to pay the full license fee if application is made during the
annual renewal period or nore than 6 nonths prior to the next
such renewal period and one-half of the fee if application is
made 6 nonths or less prior to such period. The fee schedule
shal |l include fees collected for the purpose of funding the

Hospital ity Education Program pursuant to s. 509. 302, which

8

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

are payable in full for each application regardl ess of when
the application is submtted.

(a) Upon naking initial application or an application
for change of ownership, the applicant shall pay to the
division a fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in
addition to any other fees required by | aw, which shall cover
all costs associated with initiating regulation of the
est abl i shrent .

(b) Alicense renewal filed with the division within
30 days after the expiration date shall be acconpanied by a
delinquent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in
addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by
law. A license renewal filed with the division nore than 30
but not nore than 60 days after the expiration date shall be
acconpani ed by a delinquent fee as prescribed by rule, not to
exceed $100, in addition to the renewal fee and any other fees
required by | aw

Section 4. Subsection (2) of section 509.291, Florida
Statutes, is anended, and subsections (5) and (6) are added to
sai d section, to read:

509. 291 Advisory council. --

(2) The purpose of the advisory council is to pronote
better relations, understandi ng, and cooperation between such
i ndustries and the division; to suggest neans of better
protecting the health, welfare, and safety of persons using
the services offered by such industries; to give the division
the benefit of its know edge and experience concerning the
i ndustries and individual businesses affected by the | aws and
rul es adninistered by the division; and to pronote and
coordi nate the devel opnent of prograns to educate and train

9

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

personnel for such industries; and to perform such other

duties as prescribed by | aw

(5) The secretary and the division shall periodically

review with the advisory council the division's budget and

financial status for the purpose of maintaining the financial

stability of the division. The council shall nake

reconmendations, when it deens appropriate, to the secretary

and the division to ensure that adequate funding |l evels from

fees, penalties, and other costs assessed by the division and

paid by the industries it regul ates are nmintained.

(6) The division shall provide to the advisory counci

each year an annual internal audit of the financial records of

the Hospitality Educati on Program for the purpose of

permitting the advisory council to deternine conpliance with
the provisions of s. 509.072(2).

Section 5. Subsection (3) of section 509.302, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

509.302 Director of education, personnel, enploynent
duti es, conpensation.--

(3) Al public |odging establishnents and all public
food service establishnments |icensed under this chapter shal
pay an annual fee of no nore than$10$6 which shall be
i ncluded in the annual |icense fee and which shall be used for
t he sol e purpose of funding the Hospitality Education Program

Section 6. Section 399.01, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.01 Definitions.--As used in this chapter, the
term

(1) "Alteration" neans any change or addition to the
vertical conveyance ot her than mai ntenance, repair, or
repl acenent.

10

CODING:Words st+ieken are del etions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N O O M WDN P

W WNNNNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

verti-cat—econveyance

(2)3) "Certificate of operation” neans a document
i ssued by the departnent which indicates that the conveyance
has had the required safety inspection and tests and that fees
have been paid as provided in this chapter

(3) t4)y "Conveyance" neans an el evator, dunbwaiter
escal ator, noving sidewal k, platformlift, or anrd stairway
chairlift.

(4) 5y "Departnment” neans the Department of Business
and Prof essional Regul ation

(5)¢6) "Division" means the Division of Hotels and
Restaurants of the Departnent of Business and Professional
Regul ati on.

(6) 7 "Elevator"” means one of the follow ng
nmechani cal devi ces:

(a) A hoisting and | owering nechani sm equipped with a
car and platformthat noves in guide rails and serves two or
nore landings to transport naterial or passengers or both.

(b) An escalator, which is a power-driven, inclined
conti nuous stairway used for raising or |owering passengers.

(c) A dunbwaiter, which is a hoisting and | owering
nechani sm equi pped with a car of limted size which noves in
guide rails and serves two or nore | andings.

(d) A noving walk, which is a type of
passenger-carryi ng device on which passengers stand or wal k
and in which the passenger-carrying surface renains parallel
toits direction of notion and is uninterrupted.

11

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(e) Aninclined stairway chairlift, which is a device
used to transport physically handi capped persons over
architectural barriers.

(f) An inclined or vertical wheelchair lift, which is
a device used to transport wheel chair handi capped persons over
architectural barriers.

escatator—in—theFtortdaBuitdi-ng—Code

(7)£9)r "Existing installation"” nmeans an installation
defined as an "installation, existing" in the Florida Building
Code.

(8) 16y "El evator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee"
neans the conmittee appointed by the secretary of the
Depart nent of Business and Professional Regul ation.

(9) )y "Private residence" neans a separate dwelling
or a separate apartnent in a multiple dwelling which is
occupi ed by nenbers of a single-famly unit.

(10) £32) "Servi ce mmi ntenance contract"” neans a
contract that provides for routine exam nation, lubrication
cl eani ng, adjustnent, replacenent of parts, and perfornmance of
appl i cabl e code-required safety tests such as on a traction
el evator and annual relief pressure test on a hydraulic
el evator and any ot her service, repair, and mai ntenance
sufficient to ensure the safe operation of the elevator. A

servi ce mmi ntenance contract shall be made avail abl e upon

request of the departnent for purposes of oversight and

noni t ori ng.

(11) (33) "Tenporarily dormant conveyance" neans a
conveyance whose power supply has been di sconnected by
renovi ng fuses and pl aci ng a padl ock on the nainline
di sconnect switch in the "OFF" position. The car is parked,

12

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

and the hoi stway doors are in the closed and | atched position
A wire seal is installed on the mainline disconnect switch by
a certified eertifiecate—of——conpetency el evator inspector. This
conveyance iastatHatioen nay not be used again until it has
been put in safe running order and is in condition for use.
Annual inspections shall continue for the duration of the
tenmporarily dormant status by a certified eertifieate—of
conpetency el evator inspector. The tenporarily dornmant status
is renewabl e on an annual basis and nmay not exceed a 5-year
period. The inspector shall file a report with the departnment
chi-ef—etevator—inspeetor describing the current conditions.
The wire seal and padl ock may not be renoved for any purpose
Wi t hout perm ssion fromthe departnent etevator—inspeetor.
(12) (34) "Tenporary operation inspection permt" neans
an inspection perforned by a certified elevator inspector, the

successful passage of a—decurent—issued—bythe—departrent

which permts the tenporary use of a nonconpliant vertica

conveyance as provided by rule.

(13) (15) "Regi stered el evator conpany” neans an entity
regi stered with and authorized by the division enpl oyi ng
persons to construct, install, inspect, maintain, or repair
any vertical conveyance. Each registered el evator conpany nust
annually register with the division and mai ntain genera
liability insurance coverage in the mni num anounts set by
rul e the—division.

(14) 26> "Certified elevator inspector"” is a natura
person registered with and aut horized by the division to

construct, install, inspect, nmaintain, or repair any vertica
conveyance, after having properly acquired the qualified
el evator inspector credential as prescribed by the Anerican

Soci ety of Mechani cal Engineers. Each certified el evator

13

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed
1| inspector nust annually register with the division and provide
2 | fromtheNat+onal—Associati-on—of—Hevator—Safety—-Authorities—
3 | Sueh—person—shat—r+erar—so—authorizetd—by—the—divistorn—onty
4 | uvponr—proeviding—anndat proof of conpletion of 8 hours of
5| continuing education, proof that anrd the qualified el evator
6 | inspector credential renmains in good standing, and proof of
7 | wirth—theNat+onal—Associati-on—of—Hevator—Safety—-Authorities—
8 | AH—censedrechantecal—engineer—whose—+Hcense—+s—+n—good
9 | standing—ray—be—authorizetd—as—a—certi-Hed—elevator—inspector

10 | by—the—diviston—Each—certified—etevator—inspector—ust

11 | anndaHy—register—with—the—divistor—and—raintatn genera

12 | liability insurance coverage in the mni numanounts set by the

13 | divi sion.

14 (15)¢+#)- "Certified elevator technician" neans a

15| natural person authorized by the division to construct,

16 | install, maintain, or repair any vertical conveyance, after

17 | having been issued an elevator certificate of conpetency by

18 | the division. Each certified elevator technician nmust annually

19 | register with the division and be covered by marnatata genera

20| liability insurance coverage in the mni num anounts set by the

21 | divi sion.

22 (16) (38) "El evator hel per" means a natural person

23 | perform ng work under the direct supervision of an el evator

24 | certificate of conpetency hol der a—certified—etevator

25 | iaspector—or—an—elevator—teechnieiran to construct, install

26 | maintain, or repair any vertical conveyance.

27 (17) 19> "Elevator certificate of conpetency” neans a

28 | credential issued by the division to any individual natura

29 | person successfully conpleting an exam nation as prescribed by

30| rul e and payi ng a nonrefundabl e fee of $50. Such credenti al

31| shall be valid for and expire at the end of 1 year, and nay be
14

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

renewed by the division when the division receives proof of
the elevator certificate of conpetency holder's conpletion of
8 hours of continuing education froma provider approved by

t he departnent and a nonrefundabl e renewal fee of $50. The

departnment shall adopt by rule criteria for providing approval

and procedures for continuing education reporting.

(a) An elevator certificate of conpetency may be

issued only if the applicant neets the foll ow ng requirenents:

1. Four years' work experience in the construction

nmai nt enance, service, and repair of conveyances covered by

this chapter. This experience shall be verified by current or

previously registered el evator conpanies as required by the

di vi si on.
2. One of the foll ow ng:

a. Proof of conpletion and successful passage of a

written exam nation administered by the division or a provider

approved by the division under standards it adopted by rule.

b. Proof of conpletion of an apprenticeshi p program

for el evator nechani cs which has standards substantially

equi val ent to those found in a national training program for

el evator nechanics and is registered with the Bureau of

Apprenticeship and Training of the United States Departnent of

Labor or a state apprenticeship authority.

c. Proof of licensure or certification by a state or

local jurisdiction in the United States having standards

substantially equal to or nore stringent than those of this

chapter.
(b) A licensed nechani cal engi neer whose license is in

good standing nay be granted an el evator certificate of

conpet ency.

15

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed
1| All other building transportation terns are defined in the
2| current Florida Building Code.
3 Section 7. Subsections (1) and (5) of section 399. 02,
4| Florida Statutes, are anended to read
5 399.02 General requirenents.--
6 (1) The Elevator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee
7 | shall develop and subnit to the Director of Hotels and
8 | Restaurants proposed regardifig revisions to the el evator
9| safety code so that it is the sane as or sinmlar to the | atest
10 | editi ons wersi+ons of ASME Al7.1, ASME Al7.3, and ASME AlS8. 1.
11 (5)(a) The construction permtholder is responsible
12 | for the correction of violations and deficiencies until the
13 | el evator has been inspected and a certificate of operation has
14 | been issued by the departnent. The construction pernithol der
15 ] is responsible for all tests of new and al tered equi prnent
16 | until the elevator has been inspected and a certificate of
17 | operation has been issued by the departnent.
18 (b) The el evator owner is responsible for the safe
19 | operation, ant¢t proper maintenance, and inspection and
20 | correction of code deficiencies of the elevator after it—has
21 | been—inspected—and a certificate of operation has been issued
22 | by the departrment. The responsibilities of the el evator owner
23 | may be assigned by | ease.
24 te)—The—etevator—owner—shat—report—to—the—departrient
25 | 66—days—before—the—expiration—of—the—certiftecate—of—operation
26 | whether—there—exists—aservicemantenrance—contract—wth—whem
27 I . ’ ey I L . I -
28 . . ey bt I
29 | reguires—The—departent—shatH—keep—the nares—of —conpanies
30 DU I . i ol I
31 | pubtie—+ecords—exenption—providetd—in—s—11914(4)(b)y3—TFhis

16

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8 Section 8. Section 399.03, Florida Statutes, is

9 | anended to read:

10 399.03 Design, installation, and alteration of

11 | conveyances. - -

12 (1) A conveyance covered by this chapter may not be
13 | erected, constructed, installed, or altered wthin buildings
14 | or structures until untess a pernit has been obtained fromthe
15 | depart nent before—the—work—+s—conmrenced. Pernits nust be

16 | applied for by a registered el evator conpany and may only be
17 | granted upon recei pt and approval of an application to be nade
18 | on a formprescribed by the departnent, acconpani ed by proper
19| fees and a sworn statement froman agent of the registered
20 | el evator conpany that the plans neet all applicable el evator
21| safety and building codes. Permits nay be granted only to
22 | regi stered el evator conpani es in good standi ng. When any
23| material alteration is nade, the alterati on deviee nust
24 | conformto applicable requirenments of the Florida Building
25| Code and the provisions of this chapter fer—the—atteration—A
26 | perairt—reguredhereunder—aynot—be—+sstued—except—to—a
27 ¢ . holdi I
28 | eontractor—s—tH-ecense—+ssued—under—this—chapter. A copy of the
29 | permit and plans nust be kept at the construction site at al
30| times while the work is in progress and until a certificate of
31| operation is issued.

17

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNRPLO O N D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(2) The departnent shall provide by rule for permt
application requirenments and permt fees.

(3) Pernits may be revoked for the foll ow ng reasons:

(a) There are any fal se statenments or
m srepresentations as to the material facts in the
application, plans, or specifications on which the pernit was
based.

(b) The permit was issued in error and not in
accordance with the code or rules.

(c) The work detailed under the pernit is not being
perforned in accordance with the provisions of the
application, plans, or specifications or with the code or
conditions of the permt.

(d) The construction pernitholder to whomthe permt
was issued fails or refuses to conply with a stop-work order

(4) A pernit expires if:

(a) The work authorized by the permit is not comrenced
within 6 nonths after the date of issuance, or within a
shorter period of tine as the departnment nay specify at the
time the pernit is issued.

(b) The work is suspended or abandoned for a period of
60 days, or such shorter period of tinme as the departnent nay
specify at the tinme the pernit is issued, after the work has
been started. For good cause, the departnent may allow a
di scretionary extension for the foregoi ng period.

(5) Al new conveyance installations nust be perforned

by a registered el evator conpany persen—to—whomatHcense—+to
tnstaH—or—serviecea——conveyancehasbeen—issued—Subsequent—to
iastatHation,—thetHcensed—person—fi+rm—or—conpanyfust
certi-fy—conptance—wth—the—appticableseetions—of—this
chapter—and—the+Horida—DBuitding—Cotde. Before any vertica

18

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

conveyance i s used, except those in a private residence, it
nmust be inspected by a certified el evator H-eensed i nspector

not enpl oyed, 6+ associ ated, or having a conflict of interest

with the el evator construction permthol der or el evator owner

and certified as neeting the safety provisions of the Florida
Bui | di ng Code, including the performance of all required

safety tests. The certified elevator inspector shall provide

the original copy of the inspection report to the departnment

within 5 days after the inspection. A certificate of operation

may not be issued until the pernitholder provides an affidavit

si gned by the construction supervisor attesting that the

supervi sor directly supervised the construction or

installation of the el evator. Upen—stueceesstul—inspeetion—the
e
. . Cbedi "
I ot I e F o .
I i  tre 1 el .

bl I I b T . . .
fer—a—rnewinstatHat+oen—\Verti cal conveyances, incl uding

stairway chairlifts, and inclined or vertical wheelchair lifts

| ocated in private residences are not required to obtain a
certificate of operation under this chapter

(6)tH At the departnent's request, and to facilitate

oversight and nonitoring,the permthol der shall notify the

19

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOOUu D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

departnment of the schedul ed final inspection date and tine for

purposes of acquiring a certificate of inspection—na—witing-
I I bet et 4 I - shat—i

(7) 8y Each elevator shall conply with the edition of
the Florida Building Code or Elevator Safety Code that was in
effect at the tine of receipt of application for the
construction pernit for the el evator

(8){9)y Each alteration to, or relocation of, an
el evator shall conply with the edition of the Florida Building
Code or Elevator Safety Code that was in effect at the tine of
receipt of the application for the construction permt for the
alteration or relocation.

(9) €36y When any change is made in the classification
of an elevator, the elevator shall conmply with all of the
requi rements of the version of the Florida Building Code or
El evator Safety Code that were in effect at the tine of
receipt of the application for the construction permt for the
change in classification

(10)(a) The tenporary use of an elevator during

installation or alteration is authorized for a period of 30

days after the conpletion of a satisfactory tenporary

operation inspection. An additional 30-day period of tenporary

use is authorized fromthe date of conpletion of each

addi tional satisfactory tenporary operation inspection. A

satisfactory tenporary operation inspection nust satisfy the

following criteria: the elevator is tested under contract

20

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

| oad; the hoistway is fully encl osed; the hoi stway doors and

interlocks are installed; the car is conpletely encl osed,

i ncludi ng door or gate and top; all electrical safety devices

are installed and properly functioning; and terninal stopping

equi pnent is in place for a safe runby and proper clearance.

When a car is provided with a tenporary encl osure, the

operati ng neans nust be by constant pressure push-button or

| ever-type switch. The car nay not exceed the m ni num safe

operating speed of the el evator, and the governor tripping

speed nust be set in accordance with the operating speed of

t he el evat or.

(b) Tenporary use is authorized only when a

satisfactory tenporary operation inspection report, conpleted

within the last 30 days, by a certified el evator inspector,

and a notice prescribed by the departnent, bearing a statenent

that the elevator has not been finally approved by a certified

el evator inspector, are conspi cuously posted in the el evator
Section 9. Section 399.049, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:
399.049 Disciplinary action €ertificate—of
conpetency. - -
(1) SUSPENSHON-ORREVOCATHON-OFLHCENSE-OR-CERTH--CATE
OF—CAOVWPETENEY-——The departnent may suspend or revoke an
el evator inspector certification, an el evator conpany
regi stration, an el evator a—+iecense—or certificate of
conpetency, or an elevator certificate of operation issued

under this chapter or inpose an administrative penalty of up
to $1, 000 per violation upon any registered el evator conpany

H-ecensee or certificatehol der who commits any one or nore of
the follow ng violations:

21

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(a) Any false statement as to a material matter in an
the application for registration, certification, or any pernit

or certificate issued under this chapter

(b) Fraud, msrepresentation, or bribery in the

practice of the profession secturing—atH-ecense—or——certifiecate
of—conpetency.

(c) Failure by a certified elevator inspector to
provi de te—notify the departnment and the certificate of
operation holder with a copy of the inspection report within 5

days after the date of any inspection perfornmed after the
initial certificate of operation is issued ef—a—conveyance

w o I I . . . T

- ey I : o w I
L orid e e

(d) Violation of any provision of this chapter

(2) DHSEHPEHINARY-ACH-ON—ANy di sciplinary action
taken under this chapter nmust conply with chapter 120 and any

rul es adopted thereunder

Section 10. Section 399.061, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399. 061 |Inspections; service naintenance contracts;

correction of deficiencies.--
(1)(a) Al elevators or other conveyances subject to

this chapter nust be annually inspected by a certified

el evat or inspector throtgh—athira—party—inspection—servicer-

or by a municipality or county under contract with the
di vi si onypursuant to s. 399.13. |If the el evator er—other

22

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N O O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

conpany—however—+f—the—etevator is not an escalator or a

dunbwai ter, serves only two adjacent floors, and is covered by
a service maintenance contract, an inspection is not required
so long as the service contract remains in effect. Astatenent
e I . ’ F ’ I Lot F I
. . befited " T
i Cbedt Lo

(b) A statenent verifying the existence and

perfornance of each service maintenance contract nmust be filed

at least annually with the division and as prescribed by rule.

Cancel | ati on of a service mmi ntenance contract nust be
reported to the division as prescri bed by rul e. The—ti-vi-sion
. I I . F
. I i . . . .
L ablet . . .

(2) The division may enpl oy state el evator inspectors

to inspect an el evator whenever necessary to ensure its safe

operation. The division may al so enploy state el evator

i nspectors to conduct any the inspections as required by this
chapt er subseetten—{Ijand may charge a an—inspeection fee for
each inspection in an anount sufficient to cover the costs of
that inspection, as provided by rule, when a private certified

el evator inspector is not avail able. Each state el evator

i nspector shall be properly qualified as a certified el evator

i nspect or hetd—a—certi-Hcate—of—conpetency—i+ssued—by—the
i ision.
(3) \Whenever the division determines fromthe results

of any inspection that, in the interest of the public safety,
an elevator is in an unsafe condition, the division nay sea
the el evator or order the discontinuance of the use of the

el evator until the division deternmines by inspection that such

23

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®Uu D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

el evator has been satisfactorily repaired or replaced so that
the el evator may be operated in a safe manner

(4) \When the division determnes that an elevator is
in violation of this chapter or the Florida Building Code, the

di vision may issue an order to the el evator owner requiring
correction of the violation and rei nspection of the el evator

evi dencing the correction
Section 11. Section 399.07, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

399.07 Certificates of operation; tenporary—opetration
permtsfees. --
PIUIR e : . e I
ey I . . £ e
. I I I . r I
. I . . Lot ey I .

(1) tb) The certificate of operation is valid for a

period not to exceed 2 years and shall expire at the end of

t he period ef—t—year unl ess sooner—suspended—or revoked. The

departnment may adopt rules establishing a procedure for

certificate renewal. Certificates of operation nay be renewed

only for vertical conveyances having a current satisfactory

i nspection. The owner of an elevator operating with an expired

certificate of operation is in violation of this chapter

Certificate of operation renewal applications received by the

departnent after the date of expiration of the |last current

certificate nmust be acconpanied by a late fee of $50 in

addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by

| aw. The departnent shall adopt by rule a fee schedule for the

renewal of certificates of operation. The fees nust be

deposited into the Hotel and Restaurant Trust Fund. The

24

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(2)te)y The certificate of operation nmust be posted in

a conspicuous |location on the elevator and nust be franmed with

a transparent cover.

© 00 N o O W DN PP

e
N B O

N N
(G2 NN

W N N NN
O © 0o N O

w
=

25
CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

Frust—Fund-
(3) The certificate of operation shall contain the

text of s. 823.12, relating to the prohibition against snoking
in elevators.

(4) In addition to subsection (3), the designation "NO
SMXKI NG' along with the international synbol for no snoking
shal | be conspicuously displayed within the interior of the
el evator in the plain view of the public.

(5) Except for as—authortzed—by—=a tenporary use
aut hori zed by this chapter eperation—perit, the operation or
use of any newy installed, relocated, or altered elevator is

prohibited until the el evator has passed the tests and
i nspections required by this chapter and a certificate of
operati on has been issued.

(6) The departnent may suspend any certificate of
operation if it finds that the elevator is not in conpliance
with this chapter or of rules adopted under this chapter. The
suspension remains in effect until the departnent receives
satisfactory results of an inspection perforned by a certified

el evator inspector indicating determnes—by—tnspeetiont hat

t he el evator has been brought into conpliance.

26

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

Section 12. Section 399.105, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.105 Adninistrative fines.--

(1) Any person who fails to conply with the reporting
requi rements of this chapter s—399-02 or with the reasonable

requests of the departnent to deternine whether the provisions
of a service maintenance contract and its inplenentation
ensur e assure safe el evator operation is subject to an
adnmi nistrative fine not greater than $1,000 in addition to any
ot her penalty provided by | aw

(2) Any person who conmences the operation
installation, relocation, or alteration of any elevator for
which a permt or certificate is required by this chapter
wi t hout having obtained fromthe departnent the permt or
certificate is subject to an admnistrative fine not greater
than $1,000 in addition to any other penalty provided by | aw.

(3) An elevator owner who continues to operate an

el evator after notice to discontinue its use or after it has

been seal ed by the departnent is subject to an adm nistrative

fine not greater than $1,000 for each day the el evator has
been operated after the service of the notice or sealing by

the departnent, in addition to any other penalty provided by

| aw.

(4) An elevator owner who fails to conply with an
order to correct issued under s. 399.061(4) within 30 66 days
after its issuance is subject, in addition to any other

27

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

penalty provided by law, to an adninistrative fine set—by—the
departrent in an anpbunt not to exceed $1, 000.

(5) Al administrative fines collected shall be
deposited into the Hotel and Restaurant Trust Fund.

Section 13. Subsection (2) of section 399.106, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

399. 106 Elevator Safety Technical Advisory
Conmittee. --

(2) The committee nenbers shall serve staggered terns
of 4 years to be set by rule without salary, but nay receive
fromthe state expenses for per diemand travel. The conmittee
eonm-sston shall appoint one of the nenbers to serve as chair.

Section 14. Section 399.125, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399. 125 Reporting of elevator accidents er—neidents;
penalties.--Wthin 5 working days after any accident of
iRetrdent occurring in or upon any elevator, the certificate of
operation holder shall report the accident er—neident to the
division on a formprescribed by the division. Failure to
timely file this report is a violation of this chapter and
will subject the certificate of operation holder to an
adm nistrative fine, to be inposed by the division, in an
amobunt not to exceed $1, 000.

Section 15. Section 399.13, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.13 Delegation of authority to nmunicipalities or
counties.--

(1) The departnent may enter into contracts with
nmuni ci palities or counties under which such nmunicipalities or

counties will issue construction permts—tenrporary—operation
permts;and certificates of operation; will provide for

28

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

i nspection of elevators, including tenporary operation

i nspections; and will enforce the applicable provisions of the
Fl orida Building Code, as required by this chapter. The
nmuni cipality or county nmay choose to require inspections to be

perforned by its own inspectors or by private certified

el evator inspectors. Each such agreenent shall include a

provision that the nmunicipality or county shall maintain for

i nspection by the departnent copies of all applications for
permts issued, a copy of each inspection report issued, and
proper records showi ng the nunber of certificates of operation
i ssued; shall include a provision that each required

i nspection be conducted by a certified el evator inspector the
hold : e : . w I

departrent; and may include such other provisions as the
departnment deens necessary.

(2) The departnent may nake inspections of elevators
in such nunicipality or county for the purpose of determning
that the provisions of this chapter are being net and may
cancel the contract with any nmunicipality or county which the
departnent finds has failed to conmply with such contract or
the provisions of this chapter. The anendnents to chapter 399
by this act shall apply only to the installation, relocation
or alteration of an elevator for which a pernit has been
i ssued after QOctober 1, 1990.

Section 16. Section 471.003, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.003 Qualifications for practice; exenptions.--

(1) No person other than a duly |icensed regrstered
engi neer shall practice engineering or use the nane or title
of "licensed registered engi neer, ""prof essional engineer, "or

any other title, designation, words, letters, abbreviations,

29

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIRPLOO®~NO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

or device tending to indicate that such person holds an active
| i cense registrationr as an engineer in this state.

(2) The follow ng persons are not required to be
| i censed register under the provisions of this chapter as a
| i censed registered engi neer

(a) Any person practicing engineering for the
i mprovenent of, or otherw se affecting, property legally owned
by her or him unless such practice involves a public utility
or the public health, safety, or welfare or the safety or
heal th of enployees. This paragraph shall not be construed as
aut hori zing the practice of engineering through an agent or
enpl oyee who is not duly |licensed registered under the
provi sions of this chapter.

(b)1. A person acting as a public officer enpl oyed by
any state, county, nunicipal, or other governnental unit of
this state when working on any project the total estinated
cost of which is $10,000 or |ess.

2. Persons who are enpl oyees of any state, county,
nmuni ci pal, or other governnental unit of this state and who
are the subordinates of a person in responsible charge
| i censed registered under this chapter, to the extent that the
supervi si on neets standards adopted by rule of the board.

(c) Regular full-tine enployees of a corporation not
engaged in the practice of engineering as such, whose practice
of engi neering for such corporation is linited to the design
or fabrication of manufactured products and servicing of such
products.

(d) Regular full-tinme enployees of a public utility or
other entity subject to regulation by the Florida Public
Servi ce Conmi ssion, Federal Energy Regul atory Conm ssion, or
Federal Conmuni cati ons Commi ssion

30

CODING:Words st+ieken are del etions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(e) Enployees of a firm corporation, or partnership
who are the subordinates of a person in responsible charge,
| i censed registered under this chapter

(f) Any person as contractor in the execution of work
desi gned by a professional engineer or in the supervision of
the construction of work as a forenman or superintendent.

(g) A licensed registered surveyor and mapper who
takes, or contracts for, professional engineering services
incidental to her or his practice of surveying and mappi ng and
who del egates such engi neering services to a |licensed
regi-stered professional engineer qualified within her or his
firmor contracts for such professional engineering services
to be perforned by others who are |icensed regrstered
prof essi onal engi neers under the provisions of this chapter

(h) Any electrical, plunbing, air-conditioning, or
nechani cal contractor whose practice includes the design and
fabrication of electrical, plunbing, air-conditioning, or
nechani cal systens, respectively, which she or he installs by
virtue of a license issued under chapter 489, under part | of
chapter 553, or under any special act or ordi nance when
wor ki ng on any construction project which:

1. Requires an electrical or plunbing or
air-conditioning and refrigeration systemwi th a val ue of
$50, 000 or |ess; and

2.a. Requires an aggregate service capacity of 600
anperes (240 volts) or less on a residential electrical system
or 800 anperes (240 volts) or less on a comercial or
i ndustrial electrical system

b. Requires a plunbing systemwith fewer than 250
fixture units; or

31

CODING:Words st+ieken are del etions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

c. Requires a heating, ventilation, and
air-conditioning systemnot to exceed a 15-ton-per-system
capacity, or if the project is designed to acconmpdate 100 or
f ewer persons.

(i) Any general contractor, certified or registered
pursuant to the provisions of chapter 489, when negotiating or
perforn ng services under a design-build contract as |long as
t he engi neering services offered or rendered in connection
with the contract are offered and rendered by an engi neer
| i censed er—+egistered in accordance with this chapter

(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of this chapter or
of any other law, no licensed registered engi neer whose
principal practice is civil or structural engineering, or
enpl oyee or subordi nate under the responsibl e supervision or
control of the engineer, is precluded from perform ng
architectural services which are purely incidental to her or
hi s engi neering practice, nor is any |licensed regrstered
architect, or enployee or subordi nate under the responsible
supervi sion or control of the architect, precluded from
perforning engi neering services which are purely incidental to
her or his architectural practice. However, no engi neer shal
practice architecture or use the designation "architect" or
any termderived therefrom and no architect shall practice
engi neering or use the designation "engineer" or any term
derived therefrom

Section 17. Section 471.0035, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.0035 Instructors in postsecondary educati ona
institutions; exenption fromlicensure regstration
requi renment.--For the sole purpose of teaching the principles
and net hods of engi neering design, notwithstanding the

32

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N O O~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®Uu D WwNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

provisions of s. 471.005(7), a person enployed by a public
post secondary educational institution, or by an independent
post secondary educational institution |licensed or exenpt from
|icensure pursuant to the provisions of chapter 246, is not
required to be licensed tegister under the provisions of this
chapter as a professional reg-stered engi neer

Section 18. Subsections (5), (6), (7), and (8) of
section 471.005, Florida Statutes, are anended to read:

471.005 Definitions.--As used in this chapter, the

term

(5) "Engineer" includes the terns "professiona
engi neer" and "licensed registered engi neer" and neans a
person who is |icensed registered to engage in the practice of
engi neeri ng under this chapter

(6) "Engineer intern" neans a person who has graduated
f r om—er—s—+n—the—fHnat—year—of-an engi neering curricul um
approved by the board and has passed the fundanental s of
engi neeri ng exam nation as provi ded by rul es adopted by the
boar d.

(7) "Engineering"” includes the term "professiona
engi neeri ng" and neans any service or creative wrk, the
adequat e performance of which requires engi neering education
training, and experience in the application of special
know edge of the mathematical, physical, and engi neering
sciences to such services or creative work as consul tation
i nvestigation, evaluation, planning, and design of engineering
wor ks and systens, planning the use of |and and water
teaching of the principles and nethods of engi neering design
engi neeri ng surveys, and the inspection of construction for
t he purpose of determining in general if the work is
proceeding in conpliance with drawi ngs and specifications, any

33

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

of which enbraces such services or work, either public or
private, in connection with any utilities, structures,
bui | di ngs, machi nes, equi pnent, processes, work systens,
projects, and industrial or consuner products or equi pnent of
a nechanical, electrical, hydraulic, pneumatic, or therm
nature, insofar as they involve safeguarding life, health, or
property; and includes such ot her professional services as nay
be necessary to the planning, progress, and conpl etion of any
engi neering services. A person who practices any branch of
engi neeri ng; who, by verbal claim sign, advertisenent,

| etterhead, or card, or in any other way, represents hinself
or herself to be an engineer or, through the use of sone other
title, inplies that he or she is an engi neer or that he or she
is licensed registered under this chapter; or who hol ds

hi nsel f or herself out as able to perform or does perform
any engi neering service or work or any other service

desi gnated by the practitioner which is recognized as

engi neering shall be construed to practice or offer to
practice engineering within the neaning and intent of this
chapter.

(8) "License" neans the |licensing regrstration of
engi neers or certification of businesses to practice
engineering in this state.

Section 19. Section 471.007, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.007 Board of Professional Engineers.--There is
created in the departnent the Board of Professional Engineers.
The board shall consist of nine nmenbers, seven of whom shal
be licensed registered engi neers and two of whom shall be
| aypersons who are not and have never been engi neers or
nmenbers of any closely related profession or occupation. O

34

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

t he nmenbers who are |icensed registered engi neers, three shal
be civil engineers, one shall be either an electrical or

el ectroni ¢ engi neer, one shall be a nechanical engineer, one
shal | be an engi neering educator, and one shall be from any
di sci pline of engineering other than civil engineering.
Menbers shall be appointed by the Governor for terns of 4
years each.

Section 20. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) of section
471. 013, Florida Statutes, is anended to read:

471.013 Exanminations; prerequisites.--

(2)(a) The board may refuse to certify an applicant
for failure to satisfy the requirenent of good noral character
only if:

1. There is a substantial connection between the |ack
of good noral character of the applicant and the professiona
responsibilities of a licensed registered engi neer; and

2. The finding by the board of |ack of good nora
character is supported by clear and convinci ng evi dence.

Section 21. Paragraph (a) of subsection (3) and
subsection (5) of section 471.015, Florida Statutes, are
amended to read:

471. 015 Licensure.--

(3) The board shall certify as qualified for a |license
by endorsenent an applicant who:

(a) Qualifies to take the exam nation as set forth in
s. 471.013, has passed a United States national, regional
state, or territorial er—feretrgnrnational |icensing
exam nation that is substantially equivalent to the
exam nation required by s. 471.013, and has satisfied the
experience requirenents set forth in s. 471.013; or

35

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N O O~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(5)(a) The board shall deemthat an applicant who
seeks |licensure by endorsenent has passed an exanination
substantially equivalent to part | of the engineering
exam nati on when such applicant:

1. Has held a valid professional engineer's |icense
regi-stration in another state for 15 years and has had 20
years of continuous professional-Ilevel engineering experience;

2. Has received a doctorate degree in engineering from
an institution that has an undergraduate engi neering degree
program which is accredited by the Accreditation Board for
Engi neeri ng Technol ogy; or

3. Has received a doctorate degree in engineering and
has taught engineering full tinme for at least 3 years, at the
baccal aureate | evel or higher, after receiving that degree.

(b) The board shall deemthat an applicant who seeks
| i censure by endorsenent has passed an examni nation
substantially equivalent to part | and part |l of the
engi neeri ng exam nati on when such applicant has held a valid
prof essi onal engineer's |icense regist+ratioenr in another state
for 25 years and has had 30 years of continuous
prof essi onal -1 evel engi neering experience.

Section 22. Section 471.019, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.019 Reactivation.--The board shall prescribe by
rul e continuing education requirenents for reactivating a
license. The conti nuing education requirenents for
reactivating a license for a |licensed registered engi neer nay
not exceed 12 classroom hours for each year the |icense was
i nacti ve.

Section 23. Section 471.0195, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

36

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

471.0195 Florida Building Code training for
engi neers. - - EFHfectiveJantvary—1,—206006,-Al | |icensees actively
participating in the design of engineering works or systens in
connection with buildings, structures, or facilities and
systens covered by the Florida Building Code shall take
conti nui ng education courses and subnmit proof to the board, at
such tines and in such manner as established by the board by
rule, that the licensee has conpleted the core curricul um
courses and any specialized or advanced courses on any portion
of the Florida Building Code applicable to the |icensee's area
of practice or has passed the appropriate equival ency test of
t he Buil di ng Code Training Program as required estabH-shed by
s. 553.841. The board shall record reported continuing
educati on courses on a systemeasily accessed by code
enforcenent jurisdictions for eval uati on when deternining
| icense status for purposes of processing design docunents.
Local jurisdictions shall be responsible for notifying the
board when desi gn docunents are subnitted for building
construction pernits by persons who are not in conpliance with
this section. The board shall take appropriate action as
provided by its rules when such nonconpliance is deternined to
exi st .

Section 24. Subsections (1) and (2) of section
471. 021, Florida Statutes, are anended to read

471.021 Engineers and firns of other states; tenporary
certificates to practice in Florida.--

(1) Upon approval of the board and paynent of the fee
set in s. 471.011, the managenent corporation shall issue a
tenmporary license registrati+on for work on one specified
project in this state for a period not to exceed 1 year to an
engi neer holding a certificate to practice in another state,

37

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © © N O U0~ WNIRPLO O N DMWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

provided Florida |icensees regrstrants are simlarly pernitted
to engage in work in such state and provided that the engineer
be qualified for |icensure by endorsenent.

(2) Upon approval by the board and paynent of the fee
set in s. 471.011, the managenent corporation shall issue a
tenporary certificate of authorization for work on one
specified project in this state for a period not to exceed 1
year to an out-of-state corporation, partnership, or firm
provi ded one of the principal officers of the corporation, one
of the partners of the partnership, or one of the principals
inthe fictitiously naned firm has obtained a tenporary
| i cense eertifieate—of—registration in accordance with
subsection (1).

Section 25. Section 471.023, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.023 Certification of partnerships and
corporations. --

(1) The practice of, or the offer to practice,
engi neering by licensees registrants through a corporation or
partnership offering engineering services to the public or by
a corporation or partnership offering said services to the
public through |icensees regrstrants under this chapter as
agents, enployees, officers, or partners is pernitted only if
the firm possesses a certification issued by the nanagenent
corporation pursuant to qualification by the board, subject to
the provisions of this chapter. One or nore of the principa
of ficers of the corporation or one or nore partners of the
partnership and all personnel of the corporation or
partnership who act in its behalf as engineers in this state
shal |l be licensed registered as provided by this chapter. All
final drawi ngs, specifications, plans, reports, or docunents

38

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DMWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

i nvolving practices |licensed regrstered under this chapter
which are prepared or approved for the use of the corporation
or partnership or for public record within the state shall be
dated and shall bear the signature and seal of the |icensee
regi-strant who prepared or approved them Nothing in this
section shall be construed to nean that a |license certificate
of—registrat+on to practice engineering shall be held by a
corporation. Nothing herein prohibits corporations and
partnerships fromjoining together to offer engineering
services to the public, provided each corporation or
partnership otherwi se neets the requirenents of this section
No corporation or partnership shall be relieved of
responsibility for the conduct or acts of its agents,

enpl oyees, or officers by reason of its conpliance with this
section, nor shall any individual practicing engineering be
relieved of responsibility for professional services perforned
by reason of his or her enploynent or relationship with a
corporation or partnership.

(2) For the purposes of this section, a certificate of
aut hori zation shall be required for a corporation
partnershi p, association, or person practicing under a
fictitious nane, offering engineering services to the public.
However, when an individual is practicing engineering in his
or her own given name, he or she shall not be required to be
| i censed register under this section

(3) The fact that a |licensed registered engi neer
practices through a corporation or partnership shall not
relieve the |icensee registrant frompersonal liability for
negl i gence, nisconduct, or wongful acts conmitted by himor
her. Partnerships and all partners shall be jointly and
severally liable for the negligence, nisconduct, or w ongful

39

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

acts conmtted by their agents, enployees, or partners while
acting in a professional capacity. Any officer, agent, or
enpl oyee of a corporation shall be personally liable and
accountable only for negligent acts, wongful acts, or

m sconduct committed by himor her or conmmitted by any person
under his or her direct supervision and control, while
rendering professional services on behalf of the corporation
The personal liability of a shareholder of a corporation, in
his or her capacity as sharehol der, shall be no greater than
that of a sharehol der-enpl oyee of a corporation incorporated
under chapter 607. The corporation shall be liable up to the
full value of its property for any negligent acts, w ongful
acts, or msconduct conmitted by any of its officers, agents,
or enpl oyees while they are engaged on behal f of the
corporation in the rendering of professional services.

(4) Each certification of authorization shall be
renewed every 2 years. Each partnership and corporation
certified under this section shall notify the board within 1
mont h of any change in the information contained in the
application upon which the certification is based.

(5) Disciplinary action against a corporation or
partnership shall be administered in the sane manner and on
t he sanme grounds as disciplinary action against a |licensed
regi-stered engi neer

Section 26. Section 471.025, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.025 Seals.--

(1) The board shall prescribe, by rule, one or nore
forns a—form of seal to be used by |icensees registrants

het-ding—vaH-d—ecertifecates—of—regrstration. Each |icensee
regi-strant shall obtain at | east one an—inpresston—type—retal

40

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

seal in the formapproved by rule of the board aferesatd and
may, in addition, register his or her seal electronically in
accordance with ss. 668.001-668.006. Al final draw ngs,
speci fications, plans, reports, or docunents prepared or

i ssued by the |icensee registrant and being filed for public
record and all final bid docunents provided to the owner or

the owner's representative shall be signed by the |icensee
regi-strant, dated, and seal ed stanped with said seal. Such
signature, date, and seal shall be evidence of the
authenticity of that to which they are affixed. Draw ngs,

speci fications, plans, reports, final bid docunents, or
docunents prepared or issued by a |licensee registrant nmay be
transnitted el ectronically and may be signed by the |icensee
regi-strant, dated, and seal ed stanped electronically with said
seal in accordance with ss. 668.001-668. 006.

(2) It is unlawful for any person to stanp;seal ;or
digitally sign any docunent with a seal or digital signature
after his or her license eertif+eate—of—+egistration has
expired or been revoked or suspended, unless such license
certiHeate—of——regstration has been reinstated or reissued.

When an engi neer's |icense the—certitiecate—ofreg-stration-of
a—+egi-strant has been revoked or suspended by the board, the

| i censee +t shall bermantdatory—that—the+egistrant, within a

period of 30 days after the revocation or suspension has

becone effective, surrender his or her seal to the executive
di rector seeretary of the board and confirmto the executive
di rector seeretary the cancellation of the |icensee's
regi-strant—s digital signature in accordance with ss.
668. 001-668.006. In the event the engineer's license

regi-strant—s—certifieate has been suspended for a period of

41

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O WDN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UuDWNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

time, his or her seal shall be returned to himor her upon
expiration of the suspension period.

(3) No |licensee registrant shall affix or permt to be
affixed his or her seal, nane, or digital signature to any
pl an, specification, drawi ng, final bid docunent, or other
docunent that depicts work which he or she is not licensed to
performor which is beyond his or her profession or specialty
t herein.

Section 27. Section 471.027, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471. 027 Engineers authorized to enter lands of third
parties under certain conditions.--Engineers are hereby
granted perm ssion and authority to go on, over, and upon the
| ands of ot hers when necessary to nmake engi neering surveys
and, in so doing, to carry with themtheir agents and
enpl oyees necessary for that purpose. Entry under the right
hereby granted shall not constitute trespass, and engi neers
and their duly authorized agents or enpl oyees so entering
shall not be liable to arrest or a civil action by reason of
such entry; however, nothing in this section shall be
construed as giving authority to said |licensees registrants,
agents, or enployees to destroy, injure, danage, or nove
anything on | ands of another without the witten perm ssion of
t he | andowner .

Section 28. Subsection (1) of section 471.031, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

471.031 Prohibitions; penalties.--

(1) A person nmay not knrowhghy:

(a) Practice engineering unless the person is licensed

regi-stered under this chapter

42

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




ENRCLLED

2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed
1 (b) Use the nane or title "professional registered
2 | engineer" or any other title, designation, words, letters,
3 | abbreviations, or device tending to indicate that such person
4 | holds an active |icense registrat+oenr as an engi neer when the
5] person is not |icensed registered under this chapter,
6|including, but not linited to, the following titles:
7 |"agricultural engineer," "air-conditioning engineer,"
8 |'architectural engineer," "building engineer," "chem ca
9| engineer," "civil engineer," "control systens engi neer,"
10 |"el ectrical engineer," "environnental engineer," "fire
11 | protection engineer," "industrial engineer," "manufacturing
12 | engi neer," "nechani cal engineer," "netall urgical engineer,"
13 |"'m ning engineer," "mnerals engineer," "nmarine engineer,"
14 |"nucl ear engi neer," "petrol eum engi neer," "pl unbi ng engi neer,"
15 |"structural engineer," "transportation engineer," "software
16 | engi neer," "conputer hardware engi neer," or "systens
17 | engi neer";
18 (c) Present as his or her own the |icense registration
19 | of anot her;
20 (d) Gve false or forged evidence to the board or a
21 | nenber thereof;
22 (e) Use or attenpt to use a |license registration that
23 | has been suspended, revoked, or placed on inactive or
24 | del i nquent st at us;
25 (f) Enploy unlicensed persons to practice engi neering
26 | or
27 (g) Conceal information relative to violations of this
28 | chapter.
29 Section 29. Paragraph (e) of subsection (1) and
30 | paragraph (c) of subsection (3) of section 471.033, Florida
31| Statutes, are anended to read:

43

CODING:Words st+ieken are del etions; words underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

CODING:WOrds st+rieken are del etions;

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

471.033 Disciplinary proceedings. --

(1) The followi ng acts constitute grounds for which
the disciplinary actions in subsection (3) nmay be taken

(e) Making or filing a report or record that the
licensee knows to be false, willfully failing to file a report
or record required by state or federal law, willfully inpeding
or obstructing such filing, or inducing another person to
i mpede or obstruct such filing. Such reports or records
include only those that are signed in the capacity of a
| i censed registered engi neer

(3) When the board finds any person guilty of any of
the grounds set forth in subsection (1), it may enter an order
i mposi ng one or nore of the follow ng penalties:

(c) Inposition of an administrative fine not to exceed

$1,000 for each count or separate offense ant—afine—of—upto
’ : - ol violat ey
L orid e I II I |t cdietion.

Section 30. Subsection (1) of section 471.037, Florida

Statutes, is anended to read:

471.037 Effect of chapter locally.--

(1) Nothing contained in this chapter shall be
construed to repeal, anend, limt, or otherw se affect any
| ocal building code or zoning | aw or ordi nhance, now or
hereafter enacted, which is nore restrictive with respect to
the services of |licensed registered engi neers than the
provi sions of this chapter.

Section 31. Subsection (1) of section 509.036, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

509.036 Public food service inspector
st andar di zati on. - -

44

wor ds underlined are additions.




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPRER O

ENROLLED
2002 Legislature CS for CS for SB 990, 3rd Engrossed

(1) Any person perform ng required inspections of
Iicensed public food service establishnments for the division
or its agent nust:

(a) Be standardi zed by a food service eval uation
officer certified by the federal Food and Drug Adninistration

(b) Pass an approved the food protection practices
test as prescribed by s. 509.039; and

(c) Pass a witten exam nation to denonstrate
know edge of the laws and rul es which regulate public food
servi ce establishments.

Section 32. Section 210.08, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

210.08 Bond for paynment of taxes.--Each deal er, agent,
or distributing agent shall file with the division a surety
bond, certificate of deposit, or irrevocable letter of credit

acceptable to the division in the sumof $10,000 as surety for
the paynent of all taxes; provided, however, that where in the
di scretion of the division the anount of business done by the
deal er, agent,or distributing agent is of such volune that a
bond, certificate of deposit, or irrevocable letter of credit

of less than $10,000 will be adequate to secure the paynent of
all taxes assessed as authorized by the cigarette tax law, the
di vi sion may accept a bond, certificate of deposit, or

irrevocable letter of credit in a |lesser sumthan $10, 000, but

in no event shall it accept a bond, certificate of deposit, or

irrevocable letter of credit of less than $1,000, and it may

at any tine in its discretion require any bond, certificate of

deposit, or irrevocable letter of credit in an anmount |ess
t han $10, 000 to be increased not to exceed $10, 000.
Section 33. This act shall take effect upon beconming a

| aw.

45

CODING:Words st+ieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




