F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1 A bill to be entitled
2 An act relating to educational facilities; amending
3 ss. 163.31777, 163.3180, 553.415, 1001.20, 1002.20,
4 1002.31, 1002.36, 1003.621, 1011.012, 1011.6202, F.S.;
5 conforming provisions and cross-references to changes
6 made by the act; amending s. 1013.03, F.S.; revising
7 the duties of the Department of Education relating to
8 educational facilities of school districts and Florida
9 College System institutions; repealing s. 1013.04,
10 F.S., relating to school district educational
11 facilities plan performance and productivity
12 standards; amending s. 1013.12, F.S.; removing the
13 State Requirements for Educational Facilities from
14 specified standards for educational and ancillary
15 plants; removing the authority of the department to
16 inspect specified educational and ancillary plants;
17 deleting a requirement that the Commissioner of
18 Education adopt specified standards relating to such
19 inspections; removing a requirement that the State
20 Fire Marshal consult with the department for specified
21 rulemaking; amending s. 1013.20, F.S.; removing
22 specified standards for relocatables used as classroom
23 space; amending s. 1013.31, F.S.; removing the State
24 Requirement for Educational Facilities from specified
25 school district facility space projections; removing a

Page 1 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026
26 requirement that school district periodically update
27 their inventory of educational facilities; amending s.
28 1013.33, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
29 by the act; amending s. 1013.35, F.S.; removing
30 definitions; requiring district school boards to
31 submit their tentative facilities plans to the
32 department; removing specified requirements for such
33 plans; removing a requirement that district school
34 boards work with certain local governments relating to
35 such plans; amending s. 1013.356, F.S.; conforming
36 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
37 1013.37, F.S.; revising requirements for the
38 performance of life-cycle costs analyses on specified
39 facilities; removing the department and Commissioner
40 of Education from requirements related to state
41 uniform building code for public educational
42 facilities construction; amending s. 1013.371, F.S.;
43 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;
44 amending s. 1013.41, F.S.; removing the Office of
45 Educational Facilities; requiring the department,
46 rather than the office, to monitor educational
47 facilities plans; amending s. 1013.45, F.S.; removing
48 a requirement that district school boards reuse
49 specified documents and packages relating to
50 construction; removing a requirement for a protype

Page 2 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026
51 design and construction for specified district school
52 board projects; removing State Board of Education
53 rulemaking requirements; repealing s. 1013.451, F.S.,
54 relating to life-cycle costs comparisons; amending s.
55 1013.62, F.S.; conforming a cross-reference; amending
56 s. 1013.64, F.S.; authorizing certain remodeling
57 projects to be based on specified school district
58 needs; revising the requirements for requests for
59 funding from the Special Facility Construction
60 Committee; revising the membership of the committee;
61 removing requirements for a specified survey and for
62 certain projects to be survey recommended; revising
63 the calculation of the cost per student station;
64 removing specified duties of the department relating
65 to cost per student stations; amending ss. 1013.68 and
66 1013.735, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
67 by the act; providing an effective date.
68
69| Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
70
71 Section 1. Paragraphs (e) and (f) of subsection (2) and
72 subsection (4) of section 163.31777, Florida Statutes, are
73| amended to read:
74 163.31777 Public schools interlocal agreement.—
75 (2) At a minimum, the interlocal agreement must address
Page 3 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

76| the following issues:

77 (e) A process for the school board to inform the local

78| government regarding the effect of comprehensive plan amendments
79| on school capacity. The capacity reporting must be consistent

80| with laws and rules relating to measurement of school facility

81| capacity and must also identify how the district school board

82| will meet the public school demand based—en—the faeilities word

83| preogram adoptedpursvant—teo—s—3+H3-35.
84 (f) Participation of the local governments in the

85| preparation of the annual update to the district school board's

86 S5-year distriet—faeitities work programand educational plant

87 survey prepared pursuant to s. 1013.35.

88 (4) At the time of the evaluation and appraisal of its

89 comprehensive plan pursuant to s. 163.3191, each exempt

90| municipality shall assess the extent to which it continues to
91| meet the criteria for exemption under subsection (3). If the

92| municipality continues to meet the criteria for exemption under
93 subsection (3), the municipality shall continue to be exempt

94 from the interlocal agreement requirement. Each municipality

95 exempt under subsection (3) must comply with this section within

96 1 year after the district school board proposes—in—FEs—S—year

97| distriet—faecilitiesworkpregramy a new school within the
98| municipality's jurisdiction.
99 Section 2. Paragraph (e) of subsection (6) of section

100 163.3180, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

Page 4 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026
101 163.3180 Concurrency.—
102 (6)
103 (e) A school district that includes relocatable facilities

104 in its inventory of student stations shall include the capacity

105| of such relocatable facilities as—preovided—in——s-
1

106 3352 br2-Ff~, provided the relocatable facilities were

107| purchased after 1998 and—therelocatablefaecilitiesmeet—the

108 starndards—FTeor tong—termusSe pursuant—teo——sS—16843-26

109 Section 3. Subsections (12) and (13) of section 553.415,
110 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

111 553.415 Factory-built school buildings.—

112 (12) Such insignia and data plate shall be permanently

113 affixed by the manufacturer in the case of newly constructed
114 factory-built school buildings, or by the department or its
115| designee in the case of an existing factory-built building
116
117 (13) As of July 1, 2001, all newly constructed factory-

ar
[OF

1 £ + comrn Tz tra T N~z d g Ao £ o 1012 2N
[ o s 7 cO—COoOMPry WwWrtir prfoOovIoTrors—Orr S+ ——Tuoro-Z29.

@D

118| built school buildings shall bear a label pursuant to subsection
119 (12). As of July 1, 2002, existing factory-built school

120| buildings and manufactured buildings used as classrooms and not
121| bearing such label shall not be used as classrooms pgrsuant—te
122 s+—3043-26.

123 Section 4. Paragraph (c) of subsection (4) of section

124 1001.20, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

125 1001.20 Department under direction of state board.—

Page 5 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

126 (4) The Department of Education shall establish the
127| following offices within the Office of the Commissioner of
128| Education which shall coordinate their activities with all other

129 divisions and offices:

130 (~) OFF2 ~ £ DA~ g AT T~ ] 24+ o o Roarn~ar~a-l~] ESIENE
<7 s s 7 OO ottt Ot Tt &S <CSPOTSTOoTC—=TO0E

131 wealidating—allecducational plant surveys—and—verifying Florida

132 Inventory—ofSchool Houses {FISH)daota-—The officeshall provide
133 teehniecat—assistance—+topublie School districts when reguesteds

134 Section 5. Subsection (21) of section 1002.20, Florida

135 Statutes, is amended to read:

136 1002.20 K-12 student and parent rights.—Parents of public

137 school students must receive accurate and timely information

138 regarding their child's academic progress and must be informed
139 of ways they can help their child to succeed in school. K-12

140 students and their parents are afforded numerous statutory

141 rights including, but not limited to, the following:

142 (21) PARENTAL INPUT AND MEETINGS.—

143 +=)> Meetings with school district personnel.—Parents of
144 public school students may be accompanied by another adult of
145| their choice at a meeting with school district personnel. School
146| district personnel may not object to the attendance of such

147 adult or discourage or attempt to discourage, through an action,
148 statement, or other means, the parents of students with

149| disabilities from inviting another person of their choice to

150 attend a meeting. Such prohibited actions include, but are not

Page 6 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

151 limited to, attempted or actual coercion or harassment of

152| parents or students or retaliation or threats of consequences to
153| parents or students.

154 (a)*++ Such meetings include, but are not limited to,

155| meetings related to: the eligibility for exceptional student
156| education or related services; the development of an individual
157 family support plan (IFSP); the development of an individual
158| education plan (IEP); the development of a 504 accommodation
159| plan issued under s. 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973; the
160 transition of a student from early intervention services to

161 other services; the development of postsecondary goals for a
162 student with a disability and the transition services needed to
163 reach those goals; and other issues that may affect the

164 educational environment, discipline, or placement of a student
165 with a disability.

166 (b)2+ The parents and school district personnel attending
167 the meeting shall sign a document at the meeting's conclusion
168| which states whether any school district personnel have

169| prohibited, discouraged, or attempted to discourage the parents
170 from inviting a person of their choice to the meeting.

171

172

173
174
175

Page 7 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

176| +£heprovistens—ef—s—30313-35=

177 Section 6. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) of section

178 1002.31, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1795 1002.31 Controlled open enrollment; public school parental
180 choice.—

181 (2)

182 (b) Each school district and charter school capacity

183 determinations for its schools, by grade level, must be updated
184| every 12 weeks and be identified on the school district and

185 charter school's websites. In determining the capacity of each
186| district school, the district school board shall incorporate the

187 specifications, plans, elements, and commitments contained in

188 the school district educational facilities plan and—the tong

189| +erm—work—programs required under s. 1013.35. Each charter

190 school governing board shall determine capacity based upon its
191 charter school contract. Each virtual charter school and each
192 school district with a contract with an approved virtual

193 instruction program provider shall determine capacity based upon
194 the enrollment requirements established under s. 1002.45(1) (d)4.
195 Section 7. Subsection (3) of section 1002.36, Florida

196 Statutes, is amended to read:

197 1002.36 Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind.—

198 (3) AUDITS.—The Auditor General shall conduct audits of
199 the accounts and records of the Florida School for the Deaf and

200 the Blind as provided in s. 11.45. The Department of Education's

Page 8 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

201 Inspector General is authorized to conduct investigations at the

202 school as provided in s. 1002.20(4) (d) s—3664+-264+er.

203 Section 8. Paragraph (i) of subsection (2) of section

204 1003.621, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

205 1003.621 Academically high-performing school districts.—It
206| 1is the intent of the Legislature to recognize and reward school
207| districts that demonstrate the ability to consistently maintain
208 or improve their high-performing status. The purpose of this

209 section is to provide high-performing school districts with

210 flexibility in meeting the specific requirements in statute and
211 rules of the State Board of Education.

212 (2) COMPLIANCE WITH STATUTES AND RULES.—Each academically
213| high-performing school district shall comply with all of the

214| provisions in chapters 1000-1013, and rules of the State Board
215| of Education which implement these provisions, pertaining to the
216 following:

217 (i) Those statutes pertaining to educational facilities,

ar

1ot
CTIITT T

o 1012 2N real ot~ +
S  TuTro.Zuy tftoracTitg—tO

218 including chapter 1013+—exeep

+ o
CTr

oy

219 covered—walkways—for—por tes+ is eligible for exemption.

220 Section 9. Section 1011.012, Florida Statutes, is amended
221| to read:

222 1011.012 Annual capital outlay budget.—

223 43> Each district school board, Florida College System
224 institution board of trustees, and university board of trustees

225 shall, each year, adopt a capital outlay budget for the ensuing

Page 9 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

226 year in order that the capital outlay needs of the board for the
227| entire year may be well understood by the public. This capital
228 outlay budget shall be a part of the annual budget and shall be
229| based upon and in harmony with the educational plant and

230 ancillary facilities plan. This budget shall designate the

231| proposed capital outlay expenditures by project for the year

232 from all fund sources. The board may not expend any funds on any

233| project not included in the budget, as amended.

234 P2 —Faeh—district schoot boardmustprepare—TEs—terntative
235 distriet—faeilities—work program as—reguired by —s—3+01E3-35

236| beforeaodepting the ecapitatouvtlay budget

237 Section 10. Paragraph (b) of subsection (3) of section
238 1011.6202, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

239 1011.6202 Principal Autonomy Program Initiative.—The

240 Principal Autonomy Program Initiative is created within the

241 Department of Education. The purpose of the program is to

242| provide a highly effective principal of a participating school
243| with increased autonomy and authority to operate his or her

244 school, as well as other schools, in a way that produces

245 significant improvements in student achievement and school

246| management while complying with constitutional requirements. The
247 State Board of Education may, upon approval of a principal

248 autonomy proposal, enter into a performance contract with the
249| district school board for participation in the program.

250 (3) EXEMPTION FROM LAWS.—

Page 10 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

251 (b) A participating school or a school operated by a

252 principal pursuant to subsection (5) shall comply with the

253| provisions of chapters 1000-1013, and rules of the state board
254 that implement those provisions, pertaining to the following:
255 1. Those laws relating to the election and compensation of
256| district school board members, the election or appointment and
257| compensation of district school superintendents, public meetings
258 and public records requirements, financial disclosure, and

259 conflicts of interest.

260 2. Those laws relating to the student assessment program
261 and school grading system, including chapter 1008.

262 3. Those laws relating to the provision of services to
263 students with disabilities.

264 4. Those laws relating to civil rights, including s.

265 1000.05, relating to discrimination.

266 5. Those laws relating to student health, safety, and

267 welfare.

268 6. Section 1001.42(4) (f), relating to the uniform opening
269| date for public schools.

270 7. Section 1003.03, governing maximum class size, except
271 that the calculation for compliance pursuant to s. 1003.03 is
272 the average at the school level for a participating school.

273 8. Sections 1012.22(1) (c) and 1012.27(2), relating to

274 compensation and salary schedules.

275 9. Section 1012.33(5), relating to workforce reductions

Page 11 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

276| for annual contracts for instructional personnel. This

277 subparagraph does not apply to at-will employees.

278 10. Section 1012.335, relating to annual contracts for
279 instructional personnel hired on or after July 1, 2011. This
280 subparagraph does not apply to at-will employees.

281 11. Section 1012.34, relating to personnel evaluation
282| procedures and criteria.

283 12. Those laws pertaining to educational facilities,

ar
g

+

o4 TR
[ l«.Lll\_j (s

<>}

2 20N
o 2T

D

o 101
O e L UL

el
T 7 [ S .

284 including chapter 1013+—exeept

tabltes+ 1s eligible for exemption.

285 cntgarand ol lrrgasza £ ] A~
COVvVEeEETrCO—warsway s oL £ O<C

@D
@D

286 13. Those laws pertaining to participating school

287 districts, including this section and ss. 1011.69(2) and

288 1012.28(8) .

289 Section 11. Section 1013.03, Florida Statutes, is amended
290 to read:

291 1013.03 Functions of the department and the Board of

292 Governors.—The functions of the Department of Education as it
293| pertains to educational facilities of school districts and

294 Florida College System institutions and of the Board of

295 Governors as it pertains to educational facilities of state

296 universities shall include, but not be limited to, the

297 following:

298 (1) Each district school board and Florida College System

299 institution board of trustees shall establish recommended

300 minimum and maximum square footage standards for different

Page 12 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

301 functions and areas and procedures for determining the gross

302 square footage for each educational facility to be funded in

303| whole or in part by the state, including public broadcasting

304 stations but excluding postsecondary special purpose laboratory
305 space. The gross square footage determination standards may be
306| exceeded when the core facility space of an educational facility
307 is constructed or renovated to accommodate the future addition
308 of classrooms to meet projected increases in student enrollment.
309 The department and the Board of Governors shall encourage

310 multiple use of facilities and spaces in educational plants.

311 (2) FEach district school board and Florida College System

312 institution board of trustees shall establish, for the purpose

313| of determining need, equitably uniform utilization standards for
314 all types of like space, regardless of the level of education.
315 These standards shall also establish, for postsecondary

316 education classrooms, a minimum room utilization rate of 40

317| hours per week and a minimum station utilization rate of 60

318| percent. These rates shall be subject to increase based on

319| national norms for utilization of postsecondary education

320 classrooms.

321 B3 —Reguireboards—teo—submitether edueational—plant

322 EIEAN P NEANE SINE D NP~ N RPN PN I TSP S (PN SO S~V NS N SR PPN N Sl NS N n vl Az~ 4+
TTITTVCTITITCTOUITT I TO AT CTTE (@R uaw o C O C o C I TTT AT CTTE A S S N A N N S ) ) i @ N WS S N A o TV T Ry

323 o Nnat 11~ 1 n o+~ TmmrnirAtzramaant o ~ A r 14 = o ot o
\_/\JJ.J.»._)L_J_UVL__L\JJ.J., &/L/LtJ_LL_L/L_L _I_ll.ltJJ_\J \_,ll.L\_,J.J.L_\_), (@ W uaw [ S WPl Ey &) B WAL NSA W A\SZAN S )

324 (3)44)> The department and the Board of Governors shall

325 require each board and other appropriate agencies to submit

Page 13 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

326| complete and accurate financial data as to the amounts of funds
327 from all sources that are available and spent for construction
328| and capital improvements. The commissioner shall prescribe the
329| format and the date for the submission of this data and any

330 other educational facilities data. If any district does not

331 submit the required educational facilities fiscal data by the
332| prescribed date, the Commissioner of Education shall notify the
333 district school board of this fact and, if appropriate action is
334 not taken to immediately submit the required report, the

335 district school board shall be directed to proceed pursuant to
336 s. 1001.42(13) (b). If any Florida College System institution or
337| university does not submit the required educational facilities
338 fiscal data by the prescribed date, the same policy prescribed
339 in this subsection for school districts shall be implemented.

340 (4) 45> The department and the Board of Governors shall

341 administer, under the supervision of the Commissioner of

342 Education, the Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt Service
343 Trust Fund and the School District and Community College

344 District Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund.

345
346
347
348
349
350

Page 14 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

[0} D
D ~ i1y

O D >~ H (o))
¢ N ¢ O & o ¢ <
® . 0 D & b - (R h o @ h

& B ow RN O] -H g1y @ ® 0] D
jon H o L @ D # - H
D i ~ H i1y D )] -rH - 4P ~ - [on @ B
-Hoh ol D W o B (VI D 4P D @ HO)
b b @ YH D -H ¢ M & D 0] © & 0] IS D
LONENE)! -Hoh D >0 RV [ O R D & )
B — a1 9] q o -H ® o} © -H D 4D D D
H jon [s9) D D S O HOREN ()] W H - H
#H ~ T ¢ O ©oowm D -M o D N Q- ~ D,
) b - W - AU ® P d B3 o T O -
¢ £ O ¢ A L = TR O} a6 & 9 0B %
D D D ¢ - ~ O N D T W b
)] D o+ D HO)J D D R 9] @ © D 4P -H

d P -H o fFE G D © ® N D 1]
[09] ¢ @ bl ] D 4D D H H O & ¢ ¢ (] .

® D D 4 - [O2E O oo B N ® -H D D H
-Ho P LS Y A | ® g4 ()] b 0] [ [o9] ) 3]
H» - D 0n D @ D D D D -H 4 ) ® o
-H © ¢ ¢ W D © O » T O © N -t
— D P00 D X [00] D D ¢ ey D 4P < ¢ oo
-H o B ow 4 h B U H B O L O B o) -
O M D P -H oW 9 Q0 D ¢ 4 -H &
P i @ 0] b O 4 LYo B Q- P
W B B - -H D < 4D [ ) D ¢ -

& D uwH (¢ NS RS ® -H © & n ¢ O]
) D D 4P 4 & ¢ 4@ H» -H P © < 0 Q-
(V] © 1] B D D ©® & §H @ ™ D ~ D
@ W ¢ 4 OSSR} D ) EENON e O 4 B P -
D D @ D 4 P HORE Y] . D ¢ H © & D
-H - D -H 09] Ko kSl oo D -H N D ® 19} QO -H -H
NITE)| oo P ¢ P B B HoOoH P P b B -d 4 il
® & H O [ON D O, [a ] 0] @ D D [o9] o] @ -H
O ® » B D - D -d HO) D D Rty D [( ] ® )]
B - B " D - L A & 4 b & -+ & v © ®
HORER O [T - -H -H S BT 4P D -Ho D W

D NS R D i D @ o -H &£ @ D H P ~ O -

& n & o L m b -H O f o F > P < -

O, oo D < - W D oo ] ] ® [ 1S R b} b [0p)
& D O [09) © D © - ¢ H D D 1]
4P O D - @ I I SR () B - = b B - ~ W B op o

oo T -f -H N b - 4H ® [N (Y] (0] H ¢
H D - 4 sH D o D A )] B -
D & Hooa - D D ¢ D P O© 44 @ - D T 0 [OF
U H i oo o £ fd g B0 ¢ w4

be Ho- -H e B » T D -d4 -# @ ¥ P

D D ) i D ~ D [N ¢ (VI D @
RO [09) ® (. 4 W D W D D @© H N ®
D D, ® ~ U D D 9] [ I [a ] (O 5| = g1y D D
d & O (W O, O D D 4D P 0 D <~ 0

-H - [ON D bl [09] B M D ® o] @ [0} D
[ox) - Y D 4w o T 4~ Wb T A~ > ¢ ¢ -t
@ D ® ke D D D @ op -H g D @ @ ¢ - D ~
-H P P H o ¢ T © & T ¢ - D 4p -
© - D » HT 4 HORE D 4 P 0 e
- H D -l - ¥ & D H D L A -
Y JOFEE SR () D @ b ¢ T | ¥ B - @ 0]
SRV OF ¢ L 0 9 o 0 D E 0 ¢ 0 P
m P - ® ¢ ®© W m P ow HORENO) T $H & @ 4H
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O +dH4 N OO < 1N W >~ 0 O O +dA N O oW
[ToJTo NENTo IENNTo NENNTo BENNTo BENNTo NENNTo ENNT SN Vo U Vo NN Vo BNV BN o SN o SN Vo SRR Vo SRR Uo SRR No BN w U oS S SR S S S
Mm MmO MmO MO O MO O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O "N

Page 15 of 64

iions.

d are addi

Ine

words underl

10ns;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

b
® +
~ o~ #+ oo D HOj ~ 3
D ST ST () B R () N S R VR N b O &
) —H ) )] D 5 O [09) 4D H
® D @ ® D O 4w pe D D ® -fd - —H
- D 4 o)l T W T —H ©h 4 —
K (n D (0] D @ ™4 - B D [N U
[OFIEN)) ) D H e P P P P W © H H 4 D D
D - n P o) W -d - H - D & D O D
¢ o)) N o» ' OH Oxr » D P > ¢ O b !
[O TS P ® D -m D B -H D ) D o~ D
(O} D Wb W b D B D 4 4 -H T 0w N 09]
@ uH b MO ® O, 4P D 4D ® ® H D O o D
D N 4P oo o -H b O H -H D H D D [OR
0 >~ (VT n & © HOo®n D b O D D -H
® n D & D D 4D HooW P P KT ® O, W o H B
1] B O)] w b Db -H D -H N N© 4y ® 4 ® [OF
~ @ H P o] £ 4w P -H B P R D M 4P
& D ()| D @© > - & P D @& & O P n M
& [09) -H UH H D O 4 D 1] KN QO -H D -
P [o9) ) [09) D (0] i} [09] 0] D [09] & 4y
4] &y D 1] [ B ¢ B3] ¢ — D ® Hoow - © - @ ~
By -H P 4 (0] D H 1y] o - (ON D -fH G H 0] D ~
w B ® QN ¢ © -f D 4 -A b © ¥ ¢ ¥ D> P O
o8 HOREE] N 4 4 Ul D -H o B D UH B
b D ® 1] N ® i} ©h B I(] bl o -d
49 -H P jon & -f D ®m ¢ - b @ 4 Db D n 4
-rH —H D D Rty D @ D D [OREE | 0] D N k<
N (OFE. T H B b ¢ - @® OB I D -
ST o, ¢ B Uy fw H - ® P W A h ¢ D D & ~
4 ® D 4 o (0TS B ) P ) v - D O 1] -t n
be 4P nh P P NN D == ¢© & -H -H @& & 4 D
-Ho 4P n @ D D D D -m D 44 44D P D @ -
Jon (o] Ww o £ b -m O D -M ® D -H — b
Y D b D @ D D H B> > N O 4D D H -
& = @ 1y] o] > L ON D N () (O IR] s -
b - < O 4y N o, ~ Y ® =t + YH -
P4 1] HORENO) D O 4P L OB OF D @ ~ q
s P (ST < D HOREENTRERNITEE N Nk D O ¥ D O W @
#$ @ D H b D & (OIS D ® -H T @ D & H D uh
b -H  -H -H O D W & ¢ S LB P
—H b B D @ p 0] L D B b2 D E (0] D 3] he
[09) ® o P @ op H A ® D ¢ D @ @ K
I S b H b & £ -H E® D 4 Hoop ~ O D P
b = H D O D & ¢ O T N D £ -
i L O i U U L T & R T B ¢
U4 £ 0N b ¢ {0 b -m ¢ © s O 4 4 [ONNRE Y
b B H - D D D . D R L R ) U
[09) [09) D oo H N 4P K ¢ -fH W (0] b N B
$H P @ N T ) ¢ & 0 & ¢ 0@ D D h P
D N ® k< D H [09) o~ D -H o -H D Wd N (o]
=i D D H Q@ o © P A O O] +
P L F ~ W E D (I (0] ¢ D D
P Er jon D O D 4 b 4 D O D -H My D
)] D [69) D D ® o (OB D - o n @ (oI LA | DI 3] 4 ¢
@ H H -H UH U ® 9] B D g1y ({0 1] B - B b
IV OR ) 4P 0 D @ o ® E & D -
RGN ON - o) D -H S O ©@ b # & T ' m o~ D H
g ® H D K i1y ® i1y H D D D -md 9] P -H D
1b o © ® o @ A D (V)] D -H D [o9) Uy q
K [o9) 49} B [09) & -H & & o, B [0} »o-H [ ®
& D - ¢ O ¢ D & -H -H D 4P K D H B ® D @
4 uh © -H [09) P O WP H WP ® D W A ® q [09]
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1O O [~ 0w O O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
~ ™~ [~ [~ 0 oW W 0 W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O
M MmO MmO MO O MO O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O OO

Page 16 of 64

iions.

d are addi

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

ey
(OB ow 0] H
B () B & D D
-H -H [09) > uH D My (V] h b
~ ow - D HO)J P S [09]
N i1y ® 4y 09 [09] kSl R q D
& D o D D 4 4 . - U @ (V] B
D [( I )] © @ [o9] D D D D W lox
D 4O o KN D B KRN0 N D
STV OR D D D & & RIS D D D W
(0] B QL 0 D L H L
b -H D & ® H [09) &£ D ® O, 4 ®
» — [1v] KO} B [ON -H @ D D Wy
HOoO ¢ ¢ 0 P D @ o @ n
B D ~ [OREEY | W D —H D
D ©  -H 9] D O D 4P [69) ® ® [ TR &
[o9) Y] D ow T M [19] Ko My D @
D D ¢ -d Ei} ® Ris} . D 4 D nh Y D
Ho@ (0] 3] D N N » (0] My HO)j
#H P - D 4 4D E -H -f P P ®
— HORES T P @ P D [ BT S 4 W
D D -H ¢ # ¢ D 'O - D @ D D
D D (0] (OFEENOFEN )] D H [00] 4 D ®© &
NoR D © 5B © o - NO) D
)] ow EN 0] D B 0] HO)J n on -H
N P P ~ O 4 ¥ - P B q 0]
D — 9] D 4P [o9] [o9] [on ® D D -H 09}
&P Y P Q B o b O 4 -
» ¢ D & [1v] D & @ & 4w L)« P S
. i D - H i D o - s &
L F P . D - P @ p ¢ D
£ O PT O B¢ P E @ > o D
HO) D -H @ D H O ¢ ® (o] [ I ON c # F
¢ v v v & H o-H P & P b)) D D
® D ¢ B o -H H ¢ T P 4o w -H -H T
[ R O PR () B (R O () P O P « H IO ® ¢ Wb
N © MW [09) [09) (OB D ® D ® b N
b @ O n (VS L o -H " b @ g U
- 0§ B ® D - ®P P L -d E H
§O) D & D D D ¢ @ D (SN ON HORN:
- .« O D O W D D ¢ D D v QO - — D .
. ¢ - & - ORI RN | < on B B —H D 4
[09] D & N Q (0] NIVE )] ) ORI )] -H G D
$H D ey D W b @ P D n £ ®  E D
. 4 ~ O T €& ©® D © - [09] O -
[09) 1] ® >~P D B S B D b Y - H 4P o]
P o P T () b & & ¢ ORI ] D ¢ b & ®
- - PP (0] D (VI ()] D ® P D D
K3 [0} [¢ I S R © kSl [ JE1] D -H H $H o P! S R 5] D
- @ b & -f & ¢ T D O o D 4H HOREEN)| oy
- 1] o D 0] ] D D ¢ @ ® D oo D oo B SR 1)
- d F ¢ ot - & O 4 M & D T 0
4 P & D D O D 4 D & D L) 4 D4
18} HO) — .hw @ M ® — & YH — — 0 + — & @
I g = L B OE P 4 M| D D P F] N F WP D @
P b M P @ ) b & P
@y b > O & & b ® &
- . . . . . . oo [ JRY) . oo -7 . & D - O -fd (o]
® ) D UH D © ¥ ¢ O -H 4P o D LI ST o B 3
& [OTEN)] D o9} (0] ®© o - @ (o]
B © &€ ¢ O - ] -Ho o
(0] D B b &, P D O » B ®
D © @ 4 D © O o D T T B @
H D 4P 0] $H O M| EH $H 49} D W 4P
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O 4 N OO < 1N W ™~ 0 O O +dA N O oW
o o o o o o o o o A4 A A4 A 4 4 4 +H4 4 +H4 &N N N N N
ESUEEEE S S S U S LS R U SRR LS S cERES U LB RS B A LA S (RS RS VS S VS

Page 17 of 64

iions.

d are addi

Ine

words underl

10ns;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

¢ Mo} ~ Yh HOj
D ¢ ¢ D O
-t ® D H P D @ e
49} 1] -H D Riy o4 F @
-H HO)J K] D, N D [ IS [09) H
O] -t P @ D o 4 P -H P
o o-H ¢ n D W D & ¢ b 0 N & D 4 D
© D » o - ) O] D 1Y) D n ¢ & & O N
— - D D D - P & + 0] n @ g D -H HOj
o [E TR T ) H O Hh D o ) b @ { b D
] BT (R ( HooP O S, § I R R VR O} D 4P
B b ST O B ) O o P b O H T b O & ¢ 4 o ¢ & & b
h o 4 D © o P ¥ T @ Ho-H A D © -H D (O OV |
H m F -H P ¢ > D # O D E
— [ T ) (V] ~ D - o~ | D O D D H MmN — n  Q
® >~ ¢ - H D b s oo b s 4 D O D B ® B
® ) o, T KN KN 1] oo D D K D 4 N
D, b D - [T D D D -Ho s 4 o HP n
[OR B & 4 i ® [ XS] [OFEEE )] H H [o9] o — D H op}
® B YH @ D [0} ® D B D D D [99] ® @ D D 1]
N @ 0 b 2 ¢ ¢® T & @ b D - P4
b & D O 4 D © -H D, @© P PP D ® N
B b -H B o I AR ) B B P s P H & & O B A P oE
& H D@ — p © - D 4 O -H @ D D D & D 4d D
-H @ D D 4y D v v o T E B P W -
o HOREN ) H o T P W H ® ®c B b HO) ool
K H oo oo [09) D N D 4y [09] Ky oW D O D D
P - ® - D D © & -H U - b ® ¢ @ D & -f
D - » - o o A R ' 4 4 OV VN (S
NO) O, -H ! P E ™ O D #H © D D 4P P P
[OFEE o o D © D o P P D ® [y Vo
— ¢ B X D D H & ¢ ¢ © @ ™D D -H @
D . — D - [OXI M [} D - O, D UH e #
b & © T ¢ - G W H >N O @ D 4 NI Y LR O VRN O MY /R N
Koy D ® ¢ > M H -m (VI O 1] D W $H ®© @ !
o -f [{V ~ -H D 4P D O, D [OF D -md [0} D 0O B D
[T ) BP h 4 D § & T = D » O —
® [o9] ® [OREY | O Y4 4l (OB D - o~ oo >~
#$ D P @ D 1 PP D O » s D - N 4
v B @ D D ¢ 4 b @ D 4 Db > P H -
o ® P -d D ¥ b o ¢ » T o U Y D P 4 o T
HoMm o -H 4 D £ & T - D @ D a & & O o - D
b — ] - B - H D D & ® oW D ¢ )
A (O A S I N S N Hon 0 E PP E N BP
-H D b -H ® D 9] 9] ® ) i3] ¢ W [0} QN -H D B© Y4
HO)J = D be — o)l + 0] + © @ — [l D
Tl @9 O A ¢ w & o ¢ ¢ O © O ©n O T oW W
B & oo H B D D D ow B4 v - @ [o9) H D D
@ ® ¢ -H D, YW H & h 4 HOREY ) O] D D HOj
4 D L O D ~ W B P L E I . I L L I
m » E P b I O N O] ) & -t D o b 1 D @
N ® D O D @ W W H NI R L)) D -
KT 4 i L T D © T -f D D — H S W
» ¢ n ¢ 4 D -H m K o] o] N - D O, @ D
BN { VIR = R 1)} T O B 4 D © & & & PV E D q 4P
-Ho 4P )] D o P 4 D D o D D D D ® »© © -H
() 4 g b @ #» O 0O b -~ o D -H 4 g P H P
® . jon H & ¢ 0 & P b @ b W o, @
q o Q P P ® D o~ B N () < O B [ N O TR
[{V & t D D D @ o] & [0} D m D D D 4 ®
4D B - b ¢ O - B T ® b - - -p g O - n
H —H O [OFETY) D ® b D o, D 9] D b ® & D -H
D D D D ¢ -H ¢ (0N D b D D H D H D o, -fd L& @O
Yoo d © O © O © O H QO ¢ A ©o & T & H n O H b
© ™~ W O O +H N M < 1N W~ 0O O O 4 N MO <« 1O W ~ w O O
N N N N MmO MO O O O O O O oOS$§$@° SO W0
ESTEEEE S S S R S S U SR A S R S S R S S U R L S S R U A U S A

Page 18 of 64

iions.

d are addi

Ine

words underl

10ns;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

451

452

453 | eomprehernsiveplans—and development—regutations—

454 (5)4k> The department and Board of Governors shall

455| recommend priority of projects to be funded.

456 (6) 4+ The department and Board of Governors shall

457| prepare the commissioner's comprehensive fixed capital outlay
458 legislative budget request and provide annually an estimate of
459 the funds available for developing required 3-year priority
460 lists. This amount shall be based upon the average percentage
461 for the 5 prior years of funds appropriated by the Legislature
462 for fixed capital outlay to each level of public education:
463| public schools, Florida College System institutions, and

464| universities.

465 (7) 2> The department and Board of Governors shall

466| perform any other functions that may be involved in educational
467 facilities construction and capital improvement which shall
468 ensure that the intent of the Legislature is implemented.

469 Section 12. Section 1013.04, Florida Statutes, is

470 repealed.

471 Section 13. Subsection (1), paragraph (a) of subsection
472 (3), and subsection (8) of section 1013.12, Florida Statutes,
473| are amended to read:

474 1013.12 Casualty, safety, sanitation, and firesafety

475 standards and inspection of property.—

Page 19 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

476 (1) FIRESAFETY.—The State Board of Education shall adopt
477 and administer rules prescribing standards for the safety and

478 health of occupants of educational and ancillary plants as a

479| part of State Reguirements—for FdueationalFaeilities—er the

480| Florida Building Code for educational facilities construction as
481| provided in s. 1013.37, except that the State Fire Marshal in
482 consultation with the Department of Education shall adopt

483| uniform firesafety standards for educational and ancillary

484 plants and educational facilities, as provided in s.

485 633.206(1) (b), and a firesafety evaluation system to be used as
486 an alternate firesafety inspection standard for existing

487 educational and ancillary plants and educational facilities. The
488 uniform firesafety standards and the alternate firesafety

489| evaluation system shall be administered and enforced by fire

490 officials certified by the State Fire Marshal under s. 633.216.
491 These standards must be used by all public agencies when

492 inspecting public educational and ancillary plants, and the

493 firesafety standards must be used by county, municipal, or

494 independent special fire control district inspectors when

495| performing firesafety inspections of public educational and

496| ancillary plants and educational facilities. In accordance with
497 such standards, each board shall prescribe policies and

498| procedures establishing a comprehensive program of safety and
499 sanitation for the protection of occupants of public educational

500 and ancillary plants. Such policies must contain procedures for

Page 20 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

501| periodic inspections as prescribed in this section or chapter
502 633 and for withdrawal of any educational and ancillary plant,
503 or portion thereof, from use until unsafe or unsanitary

504 conditions are corrected or removed.

505 (3) INSPECTION OF EDUCATIONAL PROPERTY BY OTHER PUBLIC
506 AGENCIES.—

507 (a) A safety or sanitation inspection of any educational

508 or ancillary plant may be made at any time by the DPepartment—of

509| BEdueatien—-eor any ether state or local agency authorized or

510 required to conduct such inspections by either general or

511 special law. Each agency conducting inspections shall use the

mmm

3 = £ T
1T T g

o2 £ o
o T O CTT 0T ot

[OF
qar
|,__| -

n
OTT

B

Gy
SR w -

qar
o
R
[0)]
|,__| -
|,__|

512 standards adepted—Pb¥y

L ’

B

nz
Ty 9

B
B

E R NV
cartOaot O

He-
(0]
(0]

513 apd—to—the—-exety £

qar
-

,.
qar

E S
TeT—I

o))

2
L

He
(0]

i

T A\

+

A\

i

7 T

rspee
514| prescribed either by statute or administrative rule. The agency
515 shall submit a copy of the inspection report to the board.

516 (8) ADDITIONAL STANDARDS.—In addition to any other rules

517 adopted under this section or s. 633.206, the State Fire Marshal

518 in—econsuttatieon—with the Pepartment—of Fdueation shall adopt and
519 administer rules prescribing the following standards for the

520 safety and health of occupants of educational and ancillary

521| plants:

522 (a) The designation of serious life-safety hazards,

523 including, but not limited to, nonfunctional fire alarm systems,
524 nonfunctional fire sprinkler systems, doors with padlocks or

525 other locks or devices that preclude egress at any time,

Page 21 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

0]
i) o) . 4
1] [0) & (0] HOj
0} o) s ~H o D o
H ~ =] 0 D D < D $H W & ®
O in] O Q © #H D D B HO)j
© m © W ¢ u [00] Wh > ¢
~ P 0] 9] O [N )] D [} D . D i3] ®
n < Q, ] ORI L n P oHd $ D
c < . O 1] n D D & D T D @ & D D Ud D
o ¥ T n P - 3 - D ¥ T @ D & (1 ® H
-— - “ 9] B ~ D - » @ 4P D 18] [4p] -H
in] 1] © 0] ~ ~ 0 & 4q o] 4“4 -H D © H W 09} Uy
- o G (@) n 0] D D B D g4 0] N D D
T O O wn O Q — 4w D OTEEENTE R W D ® D - @ o~
o A M -4 O + Q D, ey D wn -H H ¢ % $ Wb o«
o o B a ] (V] D ¥ © £ PF - D - D
O -H g o + + NO] D @ 4 T T & O T e D -
O n o 3 (0] © (V) H o oo -H [\ VRT )
e -~ O +H (@] [T ST ) D ® @ e @ q B @
o O — P g 0 @) — D & @ 4 n P s @
iN) @) (0] X P — H P [1V] ® NN 0P ~ ER [N
) g o A d 0] P £ 4 D # @ b P ™ b @
> O @) = o) “ Y R P I < H @ D 4P l i
n o ) - n D e P B P Q ) P b
© = ) H Y n & = - D & ¢ P W ¢ 4
— Y O H Y o 0 ¢ o ¢ ¢ o B P D -
© O o W 0 — 4 b A A HO P 0 ] -H s <
o P 3 [®] c -H D b B 1 B & @ D # D D ©
=0 @ T T g #$P T O L ~ P o ‘S
“ 0] )] ~ (O 1] 0] & @ [0} D # ¢ ¢ KON | ~
£ T H 4 0 O O P ¢ -fd W D @© 4 ¢ D P P @ ~
O a o -H ~ O « B (O] D - D Rty @ — HO)J { [ )
o © 0, - . © D o 4 4 D ® [E NI D (o)
— P X H g o | @ 1 B ® D & > O H ©
(RN o o 0o o . b o » O Q@ P b P & oo P o
0] O a 4 < O N W Y @ B ® e -H & D o, ¢
n oY g 5 0 P o8 D P D @ 4 T & D o g P
3 i 0] D 4 Hi D @ N 4
o (@) ~ 0 o 4 n| -H D 4 = (0] D ™ T # n @ ¢
Oy T O O < O Sl P WP D b » o 4P D
“ © — [ S @] 0] ® . & M -d O, P [ow -
@ 0 Q © T P -~ D b b — ¢ b ¥ & T O D ~ 49
N - a 0 H (OTEN \ B ()] [0} D 09} Ko [} D @ D i n {
o “~ 1] 0] (@] ()] @] 9] H ® D D [0} [ I 3] D D B
G o] O n P g wm o ¢ D ¢ & & D & 4 Ej) D T 4
“ o, O gc of -1 ¥ T ® L 4 O W b ¢ -Hoo D4
~ B O 0o A > 0] ® oo N 4P ® D [09] D, iy} ® [09]
n P 4 O © . ol o P Ef Ex B9 ORI
n] O 0, ®© & o< — D W ¥ D @ Rty D & 4o D () D
- 3 . O O [99] D [N (Y] ¢ 4 » [a g ¢ q
X 4 O o O [0} [oN © D oo D 4P D ® D
(OS] 4 Qg c g o &« (@) o, 4 > © @ N H {00 B S R« D H UH
n @ H @ H 4 0 N n B oo [09] D D Ko ] D [o9) 4P D D
0] N o, A . -H ® S & D . D ® Ky
2 4 ®© (0] e ™M™ g Qo A b D P E £ 0 iy b
(] g S ~ 4 ~ -4 0 e O 4~ W 0] ® Houd H » w o 4P
35 - Q O O d W © O H -H < 4P D @ D D W ¢ -
o' i) 0] ~ i) ~ 0 [/)] [\] — | ~x — [¢p] =il ® 4P 4P (s} D -t It
0] a “ O 0] Q 9] D ® D 0] nh P HO)j My H» -
o O -H (0] o 1] (] ® D D H D H @ b n D
© P in] T © Rty D @ ® ® ¢ - ® - ®
o @) Q 0] (o] — 09] [09] () D D D D [ I 4 b 4P
- o, © io) =z P 0 D B [09) H oD UM [o9) D D [09]
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N OO < O O [~ 0w OO0 O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
N N N N MmO MmO MO O O O O O oOS$@°° SO W
[To T Vo B To N Vo B To NN Vo NN Vo NN To NN o BN o NN To NN o BN To NN o NN Te NN o NENNTe NN To NNNTe NN o NN Te NN o NNNNTO NN o BENNTO)

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

z

D @h o
My D D oo fH 0]
W H 4P D D 0 o

D ORI 4 0] < Q =

4 & P P o — O P © ) Q
[( Iy -HoHD PO D O M s s + o) P
-H H © 4 ® D D » © © > 0 < © ) 0 ©

KT Q PO P v oo iS) P 4 P 0 “ >
O, W e -H D ® Q H © n -4 QO -A @] (o] n “
D D H )] ' 9] ® o ~ © | — i) O
4 [4)) D b S| ® o g o O 0] c]) o O W

(O} ~ ¢ @© $H O 4 T O — 0O O -4 T 4 0} o
©, 4P 4 & i D - O T L 4 0 ~ g O o
® @ @ D D D il KN S 3 c o, 0] L (9] — o
D D P D & D ® D D ooH Qo H > ™M 0 — C
N F g - 49 ¢ @ H O >0 © A . o) O ®©
o b NS (OTEE Y — in} ™M 0 O Y
D K ) D [o9) k< Qh 4 D O > © 0] O — (9] IS
-H - S H P n P D P 4 +HA Q 0 o 0] © ©

P B U T B O N OB ) & O] S Q, L ie]
((VENON o, v &« O -m O @ T P ~ — 0 <© -~
—H D s v O O H o0 O O 4 0 [= Q 9 -
-H HooHH ® B o8 n H 3 g © Y [o) Q O ©
+ ® ~ 0P - = o 4 4 g c o a — g
& e« s A D D D L2 3 P QO »w g o P |

o D LI s S O T ) B <} T O wn g O 0 0 e~

B4 Yo & ® -H oo n O 5 »n © A4 @ > g 0o
o -fH -H D — D O ~ 4 P 0 L n Q |G I
O T ¢ oo P fH A — no9 Y O > © ©
¢ P 1] D, ® © 4 — o < o g T W S o O
T Ao O O ~ & 4O P T S =2 e~ O A o ) Q

® B [ JS) oo 4D [ pJT Y] - o 0] 0] 0 ~
b o} D (OFEH N 4 O T © M T P> -~ _ 0>
4 — b O O D o Q | (@] O -+ - i) LI S N
-H P o H B & H T H o -A N R c o © -d
—H @ )] Ho D D B K @ [ | “~ >0 O oo © a 0] n
c P n T W O ¢ P D nw O » P P O O g M™”W ~H A >N -«
B - —H - ® 4P o) o) a O - Q, ~ (o] ()] 0, T [0)
o 1SR R H ¢ & P O O -~ 0 94 A 0 o omon P>
D, D -H ® ~ (O ()] (O 1] - 9] n -4 -4 T o ¥ Y] — 3 -
H &£ oo B PP D D 4D 9] in] ] c o Q c O 0 o Y >
-t D o P £ ¢ A | (@] (0] -4 @© » O < ~ 3

[ I ) ® D p O E A e~ 0 O n P O P O
f 4 qd o9 4 g O £ U w T L Q = 0 > 0
O] ® D > O o D nw O ©® & O 4 © 8 ™Y L O O P
o jon D -+ 4 u g W 4 c 4 T > O © L 0 a@ @ M ©
D @ n h o - 0} - w g - O 0O -A T O O P P
-t — D —H T 1 (4 . n 3 S Q (=] S5y n n

NN H P H - D D 4 @© —H © O e~ - + 0 O o ©
) Ko b O 44 » ¢ n ¢ © H YW o T ~H 0O 1n m F o T
® e ¥ &£ e B ¢ £ A © 3 O & & O ®© o —~ g
# ¢ Hh @ W P OE b B e -4 ®©® O W O ©

b @ e B O D ¥ 1 P b © Y 4 Y < g u - = P
H H [0} & b ¢ @ D [0 I IS O O O o~ O O O A o Ay < a
O, o D H D 0] ® @ HoH @] > n P A . O
-H — [69) D [09) ® o IS $ ~ M o~ -
N P D 4@ 0 ¢ D T O & 0 P 4 0O O 4 © ~ P
H H H & O P T D -md D 0] 0] g0 W O 0] Q Q © 4 3
B4 (ST { I () D D D T @ g 4 0 © +H4 T n P A 4 = P
4 MO )] [ N O N U o +H 9 n o4 Yy 3 Q -
© P Ko oo oo D )] - 5 P 0 PO P i) IS
-H @ ® D - D » O D n o @ 4 w (0] - )
D - . T T D ¢ ¢ u o o0 O A H S + ~ a
& ® ® ©h W E ® O ¢ D T H 2 Y T A /)] @) -
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O +dH4 N OO < 1N W ™~ 0O O O +H N M T oW
[To T To NENNTo IENNTo NENNTo BENNTo BENNTo NENNTC NENNT NN Vo U Vo NN Vo BNV BN o NN o SN Vo SN Vo SRR Uo SRR No BN SN w NN S SR S S S
[To N Vo R To NN Vo N To NN Vo NN To NN o BN To NN o NN To NN o NN Te NN o NN Te NN o NENNTe NN To NN Te NENTO NN o NENNTo NENNTO NN To BENNTO)

Page 23 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

576| educational plant survey, to aid in formulating plans for

577| housing the educational program and student population, faculty,
578 administrators, staff, and auxiliary and ancillary services of
579| the district or campus, including consideration of the local

580 comprehensive plan. The Department of Education shall document
581| the need for additional career and adult education programs and
582 the continuation of existing programs before facility

583| construction or renovation related to career or adult education
584| may be included in the educational plant survey of a school

585 district or Florida College System institution that delivers

586 career or adult education programs. Information used by the

587 Department of Education to establish facility needs must

588 include, but need not be limited to, labor market data, needs
589 analysis, and information submitted by the Florida College

590 System institution.

591 (a) Survey preparation and required data.—Each survey must
592| Dbe conducted by the Florida College System institution or state
593| wuniversity board or an agency employed by the board. Surveys

594| must be reviewed and approved by the board, and a file copy must
595| be submitted to the Department of Education or the Chancellor of
596 the State University System, as appropriate. The survey report
597| must include at least an inventory of existing educational and
598 ancillary plants, including safe access facilities;

599 recommendations for existing educational and ancillary plants;

600 recommendations for new educational or ancillary plants,

Page 24 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

601 including the general location of each in coordination with the
602 land use plan and safe access facilities; campus master plan

603| wupdate and detail for Florida College System institutions; and
604 such other information as may be required by the Department of
605| Education. This report may be amended, if conditions warrant, at
606| the request of the department or commissioner.

607 (b) Required need assessment criteria for district,

608 Florida College System institution, state university, and

609 Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind plant surveys.—

610 Educational plant surveys must use uniform data sources and

611 criteria specified in this paragraph. Each revised educational
612 plant survey and each new educational plant survey supersedes
613| previous surveys.

614 1. Each survey of a special facility, joint-use facility,
615| or cooperative career education facility must be based on

616| capital outlay full-time equivalent student enrollment data

617| prepared by the department for school districts and Florida

618| College System institutions and by the Chancellor of the State
619| University System for universities. A survey of space needs of a
620 joint-use facility shall be based upon the respective space

621 needs of the school districts, Florida College System

622 institutions, and universities, as appropriate. Projections of a
623 school district's facility space needs may not exceed the norm

624 space and occupant design criteria establtishedby—theState

625| Reguirements—for Eduecational Faeilities.

Page 25 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

626 2. EBach Florida College System institution's survey must
627 reflect the capacity of existing facilities as specified in the
628| 1inventory maintained by the Department of Education. Projections
629| of facility space needs must comply with standards for

630| determining space needs as specified by rule of the State Board
631 of Education. The 5-year projection of capital outlay student
632| enrollment must be consistent with the annual report of capital
633 outlay full-time student enrollment prepared by the Department
634 of Education.

635 3. Each state university's survey must reflect the

636| capacity of existing facilities as specified in the inventory
637 maintained and validated by the Chancellor of the State

638 University System. Projections of facility space needs must be
639 consistent with standards for determining space needs as

640 specified by regulation of the Board of Governors. The projected
641 capital outlay full-time equivalent student enrollment must be
642 consistent with the 5-year planned enrollment cycle for the

643 State University System approved by the Board of Governors.

644 4. The district educational facilities plan of a school
645 district and the educational plant survey of a Florida College
646 System institution, state university, or the Florida School for
647 the Deaf and the Blind may include space needs that deviate from
648 approved standards for determining space needs if the deviation
649| 1s justified by the district or institution and approved by the

650 department or the Board of Governors, as appropriate, as

Page 26 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA

H O U S E O F

HB 1321

R E P R E S ENTAT I

V E S

2026

651 necessary for the delivery of an approved educational program.
652 (c) Review and validation.—The Department of Education

653 shall review and validate the surveys of school districts and
654 Florida College System institutions, and the Chancellor of the
655 State University System shall review and validate the surveys of
656 universities, and any amendments thereto for compliance with the
657 requirements of this chapter and shall recommend those in

658 compliance for approval by the State Board of Education or the
659| Board of Governors, as appropriate. The commissioner may

660 condition the receipt of fixed capital outlay funds provided

661 from general revenue or from state trust funds by district

662 school boards until such time as the district school board

663 submits a survey that accurately projects facilities needs as
664 rndieated Py —the FleoridaInvernteoryof—Sechoot—Housess as compared
665| with the district's capital outlay full-time equivalent

666 enrollment, as determined by the department.

667 teh—FPeriodie—updateof FleoridaInventory—of—Schoot

668 Heuses—Sehoot—distriets—shaltl periodiecalty update—+theisr

669 nvernteoryof eduecationat—faceitities as new capacity becomes

670

671

672

673 Section 16. Subsection (3) of section 1013.33, Florida

674 Statutes, is amended to read:

675 1013.33 Coordination of planning with local governing

Page 27 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

676| bodies.—

677 (3) A board and the local governing body must share and
678 coordinate information related to existing and planned school
679| facilities; proposals for development, redevelopment, or

680| additional development; and infrastructure required to support
681| the school facilities, concurrent with proposed development. A
682 school board shall use information produced by the demographic,
683 revenue, and education estimating conferences pursuant to s.
684 216.136 when preparing the district educational facilities plan
685| pursuant to s. 1013.35, as modified and agreed to by the local
686| governments, when provided by interlocal agreement—and—the

687 6fficeof BFdueatieonat Faeidtities, in consideration of local

688| governments' population projections, to ensure that the district
689| educational facilities plan not only reflects enrollment

690| projections but also considers applicable municipal and county
691 growth and development projections. The projections must be

692 apportioned geographically with assistance from the local

693 governments using local government trend data and the school
694 district student enrollment data. A school board is precluded
695 from siting a new school in a jurisdiction where the school

696| board has failed to provide the annual educational facilities
697| plan for the prior year required pursuant to s. 1013.35 unless
698 the failure is corrected.

699 Section 17. Section 1013.35, Florida Statutes, is amended
700| to read:

Page 28 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

o —H
ey -H s}
OF bl jon .
KT} ® Ko g1y D 49}
= §0] 4 (0] (0] -Ho4p
S D [ox) ~ — 4 - D 1Y) @
<~ O o D (VI =t (. o ® D O
a P o D O ¢ P - D 4 4+ OB <
© | £ O W -H P (0] HOREEN )| B @ s
— o a4 H [OFEENOR oo B -H [09) §O) 4
0, G D D 4P ® #H T oo M D H
O i [69) oo n©h P 09] [09] ® he (@)
n iy N L D P D D 4 )
J] b @ T P -f o SR & b o
e oy D ol + 1y HOooR O
SRS WoE ) D z b -
- o ¢ L —H 4P W oo ) ® )
— Q0 ~ = b H  +~ - ¢ D D 1y -0 Q,
- =] @ @ & ® 0] ® ® — YH D O
O © D P - b — YHod4p (OB YH ol i®)
© -H A s O 4~ oF o f q ©
oo WP & q S ) oo D
IS ()] e v T+ — #H & D D @ Q
— © D 4 D (0] ® © - <A D <
@ N D ORI R F < @ 0 4 D i)
c O - b o I D D D -t 4
o g n P L b © -H - W W — D B
= ® i T TR O B R + D ¢ - NN OF
iE) £ D ® [N (Y] ® D (0]
[ ~ #$ -H - b X ®© (0] 0] Ko ® HONES |
O a 0] H H n K B B D Rty Yy D ®
S O ¢ P B D ¥ © T g0 ORI P -
T - -Ho 4l n o O O D D & D — 4 D
v 4 P R PP P A f
0, W H - W M P W o D oo - oo & D
i} O D ® @ D D 9] 0] D @ Rty D D ™M )]
0 T n oo (VY 5| fH -HooHp P D 09} -H B ~
- [ B D H P [OFEE M H CI1S) i} ©h P (@)
“ - O, -H -H 4P Y @ 4P ® o) ® D 4
iS] < Q4 —H bt N D -H (0] B D (0] HOJ) [0)
n  c L P H -H B P H P B -H O 4P B O] Q
-H O )] T O D ¢ ¢ ™ D O © 1] D
T - - B ¢ © O D & H O D D Y ~
) w P D 4 B -d D -Hn @ HOREI >
— © Zd - D Lo & P A D D H P —
O 4 q NIV} b H - & TV & ¢ » 1] —
O © H P ® (O | H © [OR - D D ©
e Q, EH v -H © O, W b D 4 ROREEN M =]
O 0] H P B Hoop D D 1 @ D D ® g . a
%o B N > A OF T b -H | B O 4 l q
Q, ¢ H D D © o ¢ 4 - D -Ho4p CO ¥ D P <
n L v - ® o] B [OFE ie [o9] D D @
0~ £ M@ b A © T ¢ O O D b ¢ & FEp 4P
™ (9] © @D = €= o] (0N D 8] 8] D ¢ = )
. o “ i YH ® o A N A Y K [o9) [99)
™ @] o)l D D 9] D o)l D
—~ 4 O 4+~ -+ n A~ O ()} -H N D K W+ -H —
o P oY P ¢ o o - L "R ) (OJE) —
— -4 O ¥ T - -H ¥ & H o~ UL e b O - - ~
aq P - D @ 4@ - - oo
-~ 4+ + b 1T O -t £ q ¥
ooy @ n 4 4~ - 0} (VIS n P
0 O - D o OB« VI o b -Ho P
T = 0] S IO N G Y n M T A
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O 4 N OO < 1N W ™~ 0 O O +dA N O oW
o o o o o o o o o A4 A A4 A 4 4 4 +H4 4 +H4 &N N N N N
~ 0~ o™~ o™~ ™~ o>~ ™~ >~ 0~ >~ 0~ >~ 0~ >~ ~ >~ ~ >~ ™~ >~ >~ >~ ©>~ >~ >~

Page 29 of 64

words underlined are additions.

)

CODING: Words stricken are deletions

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

0] HO)J ®© & D
“ 0} D i () D &
@ 0 ~ G [00] D @ o y B
o, O 4 P W o® (o] VO] - D
O T ®© D - D D [0 N0 .
Y S0 P D Q4P T P & n P
o~ > A I B O D '@ W D D D D D
O 1 g b ¢ & N0) D o & o P $ -hH P
— o O Q H -H o o-H P HOj ~ D ¥ B B B
— -4 i} ® n it @ W [OF D -d @ Rty @ N - D
(] n ) -H -H [09) @ on D O 4 D [09] <L 44
i ] ~ D wv @ D nM sl — -H H mm — [« ﬂm
n © 44 — D B 4 & < . D 4d D @& . D D &
< o - 4 & D W B Ul O, ¢ (0] [o9) D T -
T L O «© D OV )| T © B D ( OF D - b £ -f
“~ > C n D D D ¢ [oEEe HO)J ® ie H - [« D
© o | 0n D H o -H ¢ D D D D 4D 1b N D H
(@] T [OR D Rty D M b . ¢ ¢ D [OXI )] -H D [ON
Qo © 4 W o - -H o 4b D 0 D 4 O -t -
O, 4 Y B ¢ @ #H D W ) -H & !
— 0 © o M ¢ 1 P sH D D T T H P LN I B
o wn > 0O ¥ P ¥ & b -m N~ # b ¢ @©® ¢ ® oH P D
O 0] o Q al — D & D, D [0} 9] ® B D D UH N & H
o A ol ® D, D D, 9 o-H PP £ D - ®
o P n - g $H ()N O] e & & & DL | iy — b N
n -A T O P D N O, @ NIVE )] D O D D T 4
— 0] O “ @ - - 9] D ® BP o ¢ @ 991 D D D
£ +H4 0 g © D NN (] ¢ & $H o o© 0 D D Loud -
o o0 o U 9 o H © ¢ b B o ¢ - E - N D { b &
- © n|l o ® - D -H D B ¢ W & @ [o9) D @
“ n T D D YH TR () B} . & o, 4P $H [} D 4D 0p} D, D
is) (OS] a N0 D 5 © D [00] D D [ox) D i
n 4 -4 O O] # - H - D © ®© -d > M W P jou Y Y N
- c L -4 O — h (0] B p D O D D o - B (V] n
T g -+ dH Pl @ b ¥ ¢ & & ¢ D O (O D @ HQ D D
o —H 4 D b & - D H & & D (OTN ) [09] D >N @
< A A ® O] -d on D (OR ay b & @ P -H )
o P O Hl | = O @ s — . ) D © # q D P
@ ®© © O [09) & nh PP b D o @ 0P D e
O O WY al D b B & O L YW X O B @ T H o
=] 0| © D - D ¢ ¢ F D D ¢ Qo - 4 b T ¢
~ O 4 <o | -f L W T H P D T ) B O} D o
iE) 0] O H o 4P Er oo B D (O NEO) D N [09] oo N (V] D
(0] Uy ® RIS O LI VIR3} D O D @ D @ D >~ ¢ HO)
o P 0l 4 . b ¢ 4 o <« B O -fd P - H s D ~ P
T O O n O -4 o O -d O P f W woa 4w D -
3 A & T A P ¢ & O © D -d -H & -H 4P DT ¢ N« N ¢
Q 4 A4 o P & ® ¢ 0 O WP oH o P N foef WP T & ¢ 4«
L2 o o+ A D s I o T T S ( A O VI b - -fd  E 4 . b B > -
— n o 4 D D, O S KO & £ ' O D ¢ » &
o -H © o - [0} B D bR (I I 19 O E W oo b D 4
O T 4 O O D & N Y S D ¥ n W M H D P - D @
g Q | @ q €L D / A © ¢ & ) DN O) B
O o H | - U ) b ¢ @ 4P D b 1 @® ¢ ~ f
0 > 0 © wn H - -H A v @ < & (VI ()] D #H D Y
—H O 0 O v @ D ¢ 4P - E ¢ D D ¢ - P & 1 DR VI
im] i} a > > D D D -H ow H D D D @ D D P D H
O © © | -~ [OR £ @ [99] 0] . [OR D -d D 4“4 -H o, P & . [OFEE. S D
- P 4 O P D D v -H a1 . 4 P ® [N ® - Q - Ry
“ o | N ©| K h P oo H oo (VI ] ® ® H H q ) @
i} 0] o i} D (ON ® [N T [T | [0} [OLI(] D -H D
n L S T g » £ x D @ D P © T P D © 4 D}
- o a o D D D @ W b @« T » & O D D @ ¢ 4 ¢
T © 4 ®© | P O & 0P () D D ® ®© M O D (VISR
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1O O [~ 0w O O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
N N N N MmO MO O O O O O O oOS$§$@° SO W0
~ 0~ o©™~ o[>~ ™~ o>~ >~ >~ 0~ >~ 0~ >~ 0~ >~ ~ >~ ©~ >~ ©~ >~ >~ >~ ©>~ >~ ™~

Page 30 of 64

words underlined are additions.

)

CODING: Words stricken are deletions

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

9] . D
4 < © h H uH
@ HO) D N P @ B D 4
D 4P D T A QL P D D 4P 0}
i P HO)J D Ny @ ® D D -md B o - P
oo oo [o9] ® o D - oo R | D o] N oo
> ® H -H D i) KT} ® @ K3 D ®
D e P bl D - D D O 4y D +#
H ~ D, B Q (1Y) HOREENOFEEN )| D b & ¢ - D
(OFE O] -H & ® ® 0] D © D ® [T ]
i T D + (OS] ) D D 0 D
-H P -H - on [99) . [09] Ko D & Moo @ - [OFE] ®
B ] [0} D 09] H» (O | (0] ® D B D [N
o D D @ - D O 991 D 4D ® Hoo-m (0N D D D
b & & @ ol VI D ¢ H D 4 b » 4 ®
YH [OR K-S b4 - O, W D o ®© T (0] ®
n n q - ® [§ 1] D [} [09] [o9] D
HO)J [69) D 4 ~ D ¢ [09) [09) D -H o)l D ™ ¢ H
[09) ) N P - D - —H o — oo D kY]
[ | HOJEEEY | v RiY) D D - oo D
oo ) ¢ M D 4 ® (0] D O = & oHd D 4y D
® D D © M T - NolNe h #H © -H W% &
15 Ky @ @ kS (0] — K3 [09] O] D
O [\ IO ¢ ®© P nh P D D & oo D
S ) b O ¢ n o8 D & ¢ D D O
® & @ v -H @ ~ - 0] ¢ 4 - D D [N |
W D [ I )) D T O -t (O SN () D Hwm
D o - D, D - D —H N [o9] D on D ® @
> P4 ©h P P ¢ D OB R T O N A () D
oo ¢ ® ® [ I B © P N D Qh 4 D -H
DI R TR n P 0 D (O] D -}
-H P D D @ BT NN ¢ D @ D,
4 B o -t (V) () Uy D I b & -f D D
¢ H O R TR 1] ~ @ D @ o ¢ o-fH P D
O O B - P ORI L b & 4P T (VI
-H oo —H [0} H D 4P ¢ H ® [N D - D o~
W -H L () o =M » D 9] 0] D ~ o, P [0} D - H
-H @ oo ) D 4H ® B - H @ - 0] [OFEE M o
4b ~ ¥ B | @ D O P D ® 4w P -d D D D -
[ o Y T @ A ¢ ® D & -t b o & - iy
P oo 99) D, @ D 0] N bR [09] D (ORI
§O) B o L T I )] D R A O P O PR P I
-Houh g -f D D O T I e ) VI D
® & ¢ F D & fH D [0} D HO)J -H Rty
HOJ [09) D O, 4P [99) () D ¢ D —H D ®  -H D ¢ & uh - .
jon ()] jon [ BT D uH (O IS (O ON OB D -M i
® ~ H Yy D o " -H &Y + @ ® 4] 4y + -H
D - [4p] B 4P P D -rH )] - 4P A~ o It -
n ¢ 4 ¢ iy RO D ¢ o HOJEE ) (V] D D
7 B w0 P O & O g @ b ¢ © W ¢ B T O P D
D H -m D D K ~ fH P [O2I. - D ® £ T @ - D
b ®© & ¢ -# m O D b 4 D O P -
ow B - & K D oo D 4d N D [{ O] ©h T T D 1Y)
(O JY s #H @ D N R O N (N OF D o+~ -H & D
[ p IR [ oI O, A D ® EH D e . A BB @
© @ D L P D P o O D -H H
™ @ D 4w ® O @ - D © o HO)
¢ o -1 O 4 . c 4 CO Y I D . D . D . .
- W W @ oo P D I @ W P FE O H p P WD D
¥ &« - - b @ ) # P P ® D W - @
O - PP W b D n D
-l ¢ 0 0] — T O T O 4@ D 4
D D - b3 o D b & ¢« £ O + ¥ B
H v D D - $H v -f ® EH 4] 9] [ON RO
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O +dH4 N OO < 1N W >~ 0 O O +dA N O oW
ToRNNNTo NN To NENNTo NN To NENNTe NENNTo NENNT o NENNT o U o NN e NN Ve BRNNNe RN Vo BENNE Vo BN Vo JENNN Vo SRR e BN Co TN w S o S N S SR DS DN
~ 0~ o©™~ o[>~ ™~ o>~ [~ >~ 0~ >~ °~ >~ 0~ >~ ~ >~ ~ >~ ™~ >~ >~ >~ ©>~ >~ >~

Page 31 of 64

iions.

d are addi

Ine

words underl

10ns;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

D D
Ky oy
A bt i} P
&y &y
D ® H D D @
D D K (49} Imil D D — @ ey -t
&4 D | 4 il 4P 4y - D B °
#H @ LN} D v - © -t HO) ) <
P BT £ B D (0] n D 1Y) . D (V] X}
b Y] N B m F H ¢ 4 [0 BRI SR T3} .
O ) (V] D @© (0] D O [y VR ()R H 4P on
@ ) D . H @ -H [09] -H - D @ H
T H B W T (O n oy SR TN D P
b & O D & D © @ -H 4P ) & i
(oI, s (VI ST ¢ P (O 9 W iy
-H & O o+ D D @ @ B - — .
& & — D -HoQ o B HOZEEN )| D N
S TR I PO P v P i
D Hiy) D - ® -H [¢p] @ . D D [on [on
4 D D © & p D 4P D ¢ @ ~ D -t
D © & & ¢ D -H O T E [ RN ()
HO) v @ D ¢ D B P ® D 3] (V]
H o 0 4 D - ™ U U1 oo -
b I O) - HO0 b ©n P (OFEO) P D B
R L L T ) ® H D -H §O) &
b - HORY] (O T © QO B 4
jon < ® © oo H D, oo D - 4 D
Y U O] c b D (VI | ) N U
9] D Ky P D $H ® T H O 3] ®
e m g &P O HOoq I ~ -H U + j(u
-H D B4 - D ) ® Qo o D
e ~ P D | ¢ - I D - D -t
n P FICEE ORI O, 4 D ® -H O W% — b
H D oo ® D ® - oo i [19] D 1] B
o D 4 -H 40 - P - -Ho W 4D ] D
@ P D @ o)l B ® ® 0] » -H -H
I~ OB b & D D D H 0 Hn P P H P B $H
[09] ¢ U £ O &£ N D D o - o D, @ ud o} iy
— (VI (v} [ I OFES I OR ‘T B O D B & ® D )
N o P b P T ¢ v ¢ O £ P o - -H
D o o~ @ b Y £ 4 - ) — - D §O)
Lo P 4 D 4 ¢ 4 > ~ 4 P E
)] D 4 RIS 09] D Y 4w D D n ¢ 0 -t D
[09) D D ® ® D B ® o D oo [09) D -H H ¢ (0] 1Y) My
4 b ®» o T T F D -d - o F b B P +
HO)J o 4 - H @ n P D (VI ()] D -d D - HO)J @ —
¢ © O W b ¢ T & D B H 4P ] 1P D - — YH
B 9] O, D ¢ -H B @ D P (o 1)) ® i B D
o~ D 4 - i1y n D v ¢ -A Koo HOREST! @ 0] + n YH
& 1S (O B T b & -7 & b @© 4P D -H D b & - o
4D O] VR OF L LA £ A R o VOB s | D 7 be D
- KT KT ¢ & D D -H 0] 4y ) > B D 4 D ® -t
T B D Q D & ¢ @« O W n D D © @ 4 P D — 4P
n 1] B4 H O, E¢ ® [09) i} ©h -H O B U4l 1b ®
o U S M Ep D W B n D h B D B —H
oo & >0 B ) B 5 D B
D D +~ ¥ a -H P D D 4y b q
. . . . . . o)l D 0] & . ® D . i1y [0} . D — —
© Y4 P T H o+ H P N H D O ® -H ® (V]
— 0] K & N & D 9] v - H ¢
® P P D - P oh D ¢ -H
[ONEOF n D (ONEN() n b ¢ £ o, D
D & -H H D @ o [ c P ® My
-  -H T ¢ W D & 0 s O q P
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1O O [~ 0w O O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
~ ™~ [~ [~ 0 oW W 0 W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O
~ 0~ o©™~ o[>~ ™~ o[>~ >~ o>~ ™~ o>~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ >~ o

Page 32 of 64

d are additions.

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

C .
HO) O &
$ uk o ~H D 4p -H D
D B . - ¢ -H P
& [0p) - ¢ 4 HORIY) D
#$ 0w ~ D K] ® D [ ( R
¢ A . -H b . - — @ H P D B
4P b T D D P oy L O Y SR ST O n P
' P T 1] - o @ (T = T & ¢ @ D
o, ¢ (V] — 4P D -H @ N D -H @© & ® © @
< D 4 N -H D -H -H P & ¢ BN E D H -
[09) D W [ S TR O H QO 4P oo ® o)l o H D - O, @ [09]
b N2 O, Q ® D D ® ® D D @ D 4 a1y
-H o-H D D @ 4d p p Y] P ¢ ORI} .- n HO)
O & P op - Hoo4D D -H O N ONENOR PP D T ¢ D & @
-H @ b -m o o ¢ o H P N - P b D - - D P
— b -H P . - [OFEEN()) D (o1 R [T 3 [00] ¢ & b P
- 4m PP op (V] D D D & & @ 4 ¢ ™ H D> -fd - -H & P
)] D @ - H £ T ¢ D n D #H @ D - — B D
T ¢ P P P [09] D O ¢ D ¢ ©® -H K3 O H B D - -H -H
YH [OFEE ¢ ® H N 4 4P ] nh P - H [09) ¢ HOj H
&€ O P ™ HOW P oo} “oPp s P ¢ O -
§o} b & . ~ 44§ P @ D D #H T & D 4o P
[0} & [69) @ D D ~ v & -f [09] ® D UH [OFEE
oy D D 49} ® iy ORI ST 3] 1 D - [09) KSR )] St D D
oo D [( 1Y) — @ H @ D @ D -H HO)J D o)l HO) (VI )] D
(VI Ui e o ¢ o Ho@ ¢ O & O p S VIR, |
U S ] D -H 8 4 ¥ ¢ ¢ -4 - Y P M D D B
o} 4P L R B O T s N PR B ) DI, (AN O PR o« B IS (- R
LT F oo i) g ¢ H 0P - §o; PP
L U 5 DR b O P D & ¢ o - W D -1 X ™ 0 P
b - ® & D ® D ¢ 4 D b © & NN O N (Vs { o P
k3 -t = L ] @, P P P b & O B D )
[09) < [09) D [09) N o 0] 4y E [09) HOj Hoo
¢ H o D -H KRN0} ~ o oo D -H oo b D O, g
D @ # P H & O ¥ o P -H ] D D @ # ®
-H0 & 0 e ¢ P -d4 & & O K o ¢ ¢ -f -d NI !
¥ b & § Y -H P b & — @ o -Hd 0 q HOE
® 49} & -H D, D D 3] H B D - D ® 3] [ I - D D
O -H 4@ O o-HoWP T b 0D D o W oH D P HoOE D
D ®© $H ¢ QN B - - D -H ¢ P e H ¢© & o 4
@ & H L LB Y () D @© D T O -H O WP n @ 0
b » & E P b » 4 © T O H ow ¢ b O L - b 0
o)} [} D 4b D @ ® B [09) ® o -H [( ] [{OJR] & T -H ®
AN . DI VT V5 @ 44 D 4 @ D b
[09) [09) 4 H D P H H D D HOJEEEY | q
D ¢ H P oD = T O b -d O D P T W D
[OFEEEN (Y] ® o - D D D D 41 o KO] oo (0] B 49} A D
D [()) ® N1y W N Y —H ® D D & - -d + [4p] O, 4 H
[T o} D -H 0 ® OREE O B SRS R B 4 @ D © @
o ¢ —H H [09) D ® D ® [ O B3] - HORECE! ®
D a4 - -H @ @ N D D H D D o9} ~ O ® Rty
-Ho P B [4)) Uy ® ® ¢ ¢ 4 ow D 4 -f [09) S ®
£ 4P 4 @ —H < D oo (1Y) o c P D D q
EH [ ) O uH D M N 4 A D Hi D B (0] D £ - D
()] ] B on D Ha - 4y B D D @ Eiy) K —H
D LT ) 4 -H (V1 - ORI SN iy D
. M 4 b ¢ . D < N . P - . D -H 4 W ®h© ¢
RO YH @O - oo o -d T - D D [y Y] UH 4P D @ D -
[V 1 ] - — oo (0] -H D © ¢ O HO) D
9] SH n ey -H ® P — B EOREIS] B D kY 09}
b W - 4D O] (OANNO} - (O 1 e O O
£ @ - ® fH D Rty D D D B D D @ 4
$H ¢ -H E UH D W B B W H ™o B
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O 4 N OO < 1N W ™~ 0 O O +dA N O oW
o o o o o o o o o A4 A A4 A 4 4 4 +H4 4 +H4 &N N N N N
0 o © o © o 0 o0 W o0 W o W o0 W o0 W o0 W o0 W o0 W o

Page 33 of 64

iions.

d are addi

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

N D b [
b ¢ @ <M 4b g0} D
— >~ ® oo - D ¥ D
EOREEN ()] iy D h P h @ P ¢ oy
-H D -H ® oo P h @ @ oo B 4 D D
[ pJE) be )] -H P D D D ® ® ~ D D ®
® 1] D X ® D 4P oo »oo-d - — D [OJNE 1| @
D LU U o 4o ¢ 0P o b T [OFEN ) -Ho4 ! -t
S B ON D D [( IS D B -H P D (0] o 4 D
O TR S (¥ ) b O] D D — 4 - (L ION T N HO)
N4 P D & D @ © -H @ H @ n D D ¢ b D
& [99] H P DB -7 P D D - N g D - -
— B P K ® ) H D D (V1Y) (OB N ™ -H H
® D @ -rH ® B HO K - — D Y @ Rty P 5} P D H -H -
v P 4 D -f D >~ ¢ (0 R A O TR ( 4P
) )] P T D ¢ < W H P D b » D P P @
¢ HOREES [ (VO] b o ¢ B » & & -d T E W D
P L O - D T w T 0 B & H ¢ O -H D w - B
@ X R () 4 b - & & O n B O ® g 4 -
L 1 TR [(V I k3 -t n P ~ 4 o D ™
W D 4 oo P D ~ D - e & g - P
(VIO [09] HORS | D D W P H O D D ud iy D & ()]
~ @O [ IS ® D 1y} 0p] oo D (0] v D ® D D D ™ 44 D
P [69) v i ] D @O -H B [19] D H 4 @ Y ® N -m
D IR s s () R R I D H T M 0] D k b - D
b & -H W - D & & 4 ¥ D @ Hh 4 [ IO} $H
[OFE (] L D @, P D # W O up P P IS N OR OX
D K & Q© ) o] (OB D H 4D D ow n D H D D
T O P -fH D D [T O X () B ) R D ¥ @ B by © @ oy
® D q P ® D O, ¢ [09) oo - D @ ® —H 1b [)
KT ol 1Y) D D ® -H s T 1S kY] ® « O ®
HORENON D ® D W @ P D 4P D uH D PP D & D
& 4 @ O HORNO] H B D @ YW O uw D -4 ¢ -d -
P ¥ ¢ H D @ T O H ¢ -f D & b o, Ho & $H
D — [( 1Y) D (N O RN ()] -H P D D ® -Ho 4P D
D b & U L D T b & $HooH D ¢ - 0] ~ ¥ - Y
®F % -H & & ¢ ¢ H - D D B T B +~ & F
- D D b D b £ 4o T O @ - Koo NN () +
D [o9) k< ~ 4 >4 1y] ~ & B & D D )] [ONE D 4 0]
D H @ [o9) ® 1 SR D10} BT 4 ¢ ® -H g -H N D
4 - 4 ™ & D ® ¢ CR S (OJE oo -H ()
v @ > n ) D > ™ D 4 ® . D
@ - 4P §ol Q = ¢ £ Qo H O £ 4 O ¢ (OO} v
— ¢ D & D -H @ D B 4O ¢ 4 b D
¢ - D b @ A D b © T O H O D 4 4P b ¢ /4 4
)] & T P D ® H ® D ® ® & 4y b H -H )
oo ® - HO)J s B —H [09) (O T St ® $oud HO)j ® 4 D
-H Yy H . D 9] @ — [ON ® © W [OR D D 9] @ My D Hip)
HO)J m B o - — D D [OJEE: 5| D & YH Riy) B o -f D
#$ 4P K oo @ [( IS S ¢ KT By s ® oo (0] 4 4
¢ 4 P P -H H @ #H @ 0] D D o T ¢ D,
p -f 4P D 4 0} D c M OOH 4 D H 4 & -f n ¢ D
& W« HOREN ) HO) v @ D D D D D D © # D -H h 4 D
P4 D D D uH T -H W ¢ A A 4 BB &
[0} 49} © 9] q a0 - N B ol 9] ol H D B
®  -H D -H D @ D P T Rty P A D )] D -m
s U < ) L PP ) D b @© @ b @ (OR (VO] D
o W & @ 4P & D 09 B o 4P . [09] . ® H .
L D © D ® ¢ © B © & ] D O -H o D P on
H T O © ¢ D © HOZEN (o] HOZEE1S) HO)J [ J1S)
® ol 4 D [OXIN )] D 0] ] oo D HO)j ®
H B O D — D -H @ 4 4P [ I D H @ D
D [ I H D D o4 ) P [OJE ] O ¢ D B K] @
ST B () N S ON [T /SN (0 FRRT DI ¢ N () WA« B ) W ¢ ) 13 UH W @ D
© ™~ W O O +H N M < 1N W~ 0O O O 4 N MO <« 1O W ~ w O O
N N N N MmO MO O O O O O O oOS$§$@° SO W0
0 o O 0 © o 0 0 W o0 W o W o0 W o0 W o0 W o0 W o W o

Page 34 of 64

d are additions.

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

el ~
® D H P
oy b y ¢ O .
jon ~ @ — & D ¢ - c
@ Ko} D &L4p D W P G
oo D ) ® H i oo -H o -H D —
D 4 -H B B W D I N ()] [oF
4y i [( IS D oo H - @ oo P o
[OA ) n @ n ey -H M © D B (0] D 0
R i b ¢ o T T -H - IR0
e L L 3 (V] P D T 0 o - [ M1 ) o -
D) K] D ¢ oo oo D i1 i} ® (OS]
¢ #H H P b ¢ -H T & hoon O N E g -
™ & ¢ - p P B D D 4 @ -H W e -

PR < 4P ) §0 o () T O o -
H D T ¢ B ® KT ()] D (OB @ D D U O O
[OFEEEN )] D JTY] D 4 D O oo D -1 D @ 0]

4 &£ P o B o O I OB P - 0 W
TP b P P P © D HH - -

LoD s & O n P I I O P H o4 ~

N Ok b & #$ - @ ¢ H () P D Q 9 ©

D P ~ ¢ O P v B b & - P 3 G
o O & O F -H D © D UH o D ¢ O Q, O

D L R SR & D 0 T D ® D D -
4 @ k< — 4P D D () D | | [T
[OFEEEN O PR ()] B ()] ® [09] 0] HD & & ® O (o)

® fH #» - D (OB D B ® D @ H O
H = 4P D - M — . ey 4P Y ey 3

D D O uH [OFEEH D R - [ox P D O O

ER 4 B (VI OB v - © D D - T 0O
— D D H Ky [ I | Q, -H K H o H N o 0]

S D 4P 1) . Koo [ | D D D, D op e P
£ ¢ L0 9 T o O & ¥ £ 4 Dy o H 0
(VT D & ™ D L@ (o] G LI O T (V) - O A
K Q©h O v D - P N ORI N D W N ¢© & O® Q -
(o)) ® v (V) () SR () o D T o+ ®Q L i)

D #» ¢ (] & 9 ¢ D - D D # k3 ¢ - q — 0
Hoo D o N » -H B D HooW fH -H D B ® oo —~ -
Q, B D - [09] 4P D D, ¢ D WM W o W P « @© O

P 4 £ -H - [0p) [09] D 0] D, D [ I N C
A4 MUl D g4 XX -H X D 4 -H H O, 0 O
4 ROREE W B O T H (O} n D >
D )] H [ ) YH D 4P D oo D Y4 - - H @ N H a -
kS n © © - fon D b - ww -H ww D Y =il . - D D o] +
B [4)) D D T WA [ 1§ R P A (]
Qh ¢ P ~ © O D & & D D @ O K 4P ¢ n P
[09] 4y D oD D D D H -H P 0 D - s H o
-H < H " 5o O -H P -f "W 4 & l B> 0
P P P HOZEN( S SR () B 10] © D D - n O P
- @ oo HO)J D B D D -d D -d D D Riy) D @ » kY S|
— b ¢ -d ) L o L Y (N O] H o P P A0
- - & H w 0] — fH - 0] - 0] + -rH [49] YH [ON <
)] H H n & 9] + D 0] 9] 0] 9] s 9] D S
® ® n N D @ W ® ® N T B A 09}
44 D ™ O D <L D W & uw L€ Q@ ®h — ® D o
[09) ) K] My 5] D - @) @ ¢ a
P [( I R} KT U P ©h P A~ D o o~ -H
O PP D TR B O B O] S ()} . D b © -h D |
-H @ o - o)l N [0} c -H o -H X ] D w + 4 4~ oy
H © b & ¢ o H ©oo@ B P D Q
R I R - - L - 4P 4 D 4D — ) Yy 0
[99] B ® HO)J & (0] ® [09) [09) b )] B oo G
L i U T s o» -d - b & @ i) D o}
O ORENOR ® T D ® O o ¢ -H - D ( 0
— N O < N O ™~ 0 O O +dH4 N OO < 1N W >~ 0 O O +dA N O oW
[ToJTo NENTo IENNTo NENNTo BENNTo BENNTo NENNTo ENNT SN Vo U Vo NN Vo BNV BN o SN o SN Vo SRR Vo SRR Uo SRR No BN w U oS S SR S S S
0 o © 0 © o W o0 W o0 W o W o0 W o0 W o0 W o0 W o W o

Page 35 of 64

words underlined are additions.

)

CODING: Words stricken are deletions

hb1321-00



876
877
878
879

\ il Al at g~ o~ 1 branrd o117 ~ r A2 AN 2o+ o~

\ 7 LI |\ N SRS I WS SR S W Sy [\ I W W g VAW LG B ER W § [S5J i Iy & Ry S AU U S W R i B i @ B Wy W I CTT o oTT
S L L~~~ T ol A~~~ N1 O oT ot A~ heot o +
€% N S =T A8 [N SN Ny @ Ry \juV T TTTIT T [ a IO T oCUThHho 1o T J.J.\_/_Y Ly T T CTIT
ot 4 2o Al ot g ~+ P EEWENE S B AN N N =NV T B A I AN T N BT~ NS NP R = leoeaal
[ ITCTO T 1TV |\ N ER D I WS SR S W Sy A\ LW B Uy @5 ) WP SN i i @5 R J S € N W S N Sy WS =] LJ_LLA.ll I CTITC [N SN A Ny @ S )
aoroarnmant ~arnesa b A o0 < N1 an £ + S L L~~~ T ol Az A o
\juv T TTTIT T \_/VJ.I.I.LJJ_ T o1V LJ_LLA.J.J.U g CTIT €% N S =T A8 [N SN WY @ Ry \juv T TTTIT TTCTWO
At~ Aaxzal A~ £ + ot 4 2o Al ot g ~+ Azt g AT
\AuJ__I_J.J.\j CTIT A8 \4 _LVLJJ.I.I. T g CTIT (= J N ) PN @ Ry WP S v |\ N SRS I WS SR S W ey O T T T I UTIT

880
881
882
883
884
885
886
887
888
889
890
891
892
893
894
895
896
897
898
899
900

3 o o
EEASTS S e s ¥

(3)4£> Not less than once every 5 years, the district

school board shall have an audit conducted of the district's
educational planning and construction activities. An operational
audit conducted by the Auditor General pursuant to s. 11.45
satisfies this requirement.

(4) 43 SHRMITTAL OF TENTATIVE DISTRICT EDUCATIONAL
FACTEETIES PEAN—TO—LEOCALT—GOVERNMENT-—The district school board
shall submit a copy of its tentative district educational
facilities plan to all affected local governments before prier
£o adoption by the board. The affected local governments shall
review the tentative district educational facilities plan and
comment to the district school board on the consistency of the
plan with the local comprehensive plan, whether a comprehensive
plan amendment will be necessary for any proposed educational
facility, and whether the local government supports a necessary
comprehensive plan amendment. If the local government does not
support a comprehensive plan amendment for a proposed
educational facility, the matter shall be resolved pursuant to

the interlocal agreement when required by ss. 163.3177(6) (h),

Page 36 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00

V E S




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

901 163.31777, and 1013.33(2). The process for the submittal and
902| review shall be detailed in the interlocal agreement when
903 required pursuant to ss. 163.3177(6) (h), 163.31777, and

904 1013.33(2).

905 (5) 4 ABOPTEDBIESTRICT BEBDUCATIONAL FACELETIES PEAN—

906| Annually, the district school board shall consider and adopt the
907| tentative district educational facilities plan complteted

908| pursuant—tesubseetieon—{2). Upon giving proper notice to the

909| public and local governments and opportunity for public comment,
910 the district school board may amend the plan to revise the

911| priority of projects, to add or delete projects, to reflect the
912 impact of change orders, or to reflect the approval of new

913 revenue sources which may become available. The adopted district
914| educational facilities plan shall:

915 (a) Be a complete, balanced, and financially feasible

916 capital outlay financial plan for the district.

917 (b) Set forth the proposed commitments and planned

918| expenditures of the district to address the educational

919| facilities needs of its students and to adequately provide for
920 the maintenance of the educational plant and ancillary

921 facilities, including safe access ways from neighborhoods to

922 schools.

923 (6) 5y EBXBECUTION—OFADORTEDBISTRICT EDUCATIONAL

924 | FACEFEEFIES—PEAN-—The first year of the adopted district

925| educational facilities plan shall constitute the capital outlay

Page 37 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

926| budget required in s. 1013.61. The—adepted—district—eduecationat

927 faeilities—plan—shaltl include—+the information reguired—an

928 2 ~7

929| funded—in—theplan-

930 Section 18. Section 1013.356, Florida Statutes, is amended
931| to read:

932 1013.356 Local funding for educational facilities benefit

933 districts or community development districts.—Upon confirmation
934| Dby a district school board of the commitment of revenues by an
935 educational facilities benefit district or community development

936| district necessary to construct and maintain an educational

937 facility eerntained—within anindividual districtfacilities—work
938| pregram—eor proposed by an approved charter school or a charter
939 school applicant, the following funds shall be provided to the
940| educational facilities benefit district or community development
941 district annually, beginning with the next fiscal year after

942 confirmation until the district's financial obligations are

943 completed:

944 (1) All educational facilities impact fee revenue

945 collected for new development within the educational facilities
946| benefit district or community development district. Funds

947| provided under this subsection shall be used to fund the

948 construction and capital maintenance costs of educational

949 facilities.

950 (2) For construction and capital maintenance costs not

Page 38 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

951 covered by the funds provided under subsection (1), an annual
952 amount contributed by the district school board equal to one-
953| half of the remaining costs of construction and capital

954| maintenance of the educational facility. Any construction costs
955| above the cost-per-student criteria established in s.

956 1013.64(6) (b)1. shall be funded exclusively by the educational
957 facilities benefit district or the community development

958 district. Funds contributed by a district school board shall not
959| be used to fund operational costs.

960
961 Educational facilities funded pursuant to this act may be

962 constructed on land that is owned by any person after the

963 district school board has acquired from the owner of the land a
964 long-term lease for the use of this land for a period of not
965 less than 40 years or the life expectancy of the permanent

966| facilities constructed thereon, whichever is longer. All

967 interlocal agreements entered into pursuant to this act shall
968| provide for ownership of educational facilities funded pursuant
969| to this act to revert to the district school board if such

970 facilities cease to be used for public educational purposes

971| prior to 40 years after construction or prior to the end of the
972 life expectancy of the educational facilities, whichever is

973 longer.

974 Section 19. Subsection (5) of section 1013.37, Florida

975 Statutes, is renumbered as subsection (3), paragraphs (a) and

Page 39 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

976 (e) of subsection (1) and subsections (2), (3), and (4) of that
977 section are amended to read:

978 1013.37 State uniform building code for public educational
979| facilities construction.—

980 (1) UNIFORM BUILDING CODE.—A uniform statewide building
981 code for the planning and construction of public educational and
982| ancillary plants by district school boards and Florida College
983 System institution district boards of trustees shall be adopted
984| Dby the Florida Building Commission within the Florida Building
985| Code, pursuant to s. 553.73. Included in this code must be flood
986| plain management criteria in compliance with the rules and

987 regulations in 44 C.F.R. parts 59 and 60, and subsequent

988 revisions thereto which are adopted by the Federal Emergency

989| Management Agency. It is also the responsibility of the

990 department to develop, as a part of the uniform building code,
991 standards relating to:

992 (a) Prefabricated facilities or factory-built facilities
993 that are designed to be portable, relocatable, demountable, or
994 reconstructible; are used primarily as classrooms; and do not
995 fall under the provisions of ss. 320.822-320.862. Such standards
996| must permit boards to contract with the Department of Business
997 and Professional Regulation for factory inspections by certified
998| building code inspectors to certify conformance with applicable

999 law and rules. Fhe—standards—must—ecomply withthe reguirements

1000 £ o 1012 2N £~ 1 a1 E N B o 2t A AN N T A~
Or— S+ Toro-2Z2vu rtor rtCTroCtaotalrC—TrTatTrrrocrC o Tt o oG —cCTItt

Page 40 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

ad The relocatable facilities shall be

1001 13 ENPOR BN v Mmoo~
jeye] TS CcTraoo L o0 S pPpatty

@D

1002| designed subject to missile impact criteria of Section

1003 423(24) (d) (1) of the Florida Building Code when located in the
1004| windborne debris region.

1005 (e) The performance of life-cycle cost analyses on

1006| alternative architectural and engineering designs to evaluate

1007 their energy efficiencies.

1008 1. The life-cycle cost analysis must consist of the sum
1009| of:
1010 a. The reasonably expected fuel costs over the life of the

1011| building which are required to maintain illumination, water

1012 heating, temperature, humidity, wventilation, and all other

1013| energy-consuming equipment in a facility; and

1014 b. The reasonable costs of probable maintenance, including
1015 labor and materials, and operation of the building.

1016 2. For computation of the life-cycle costs, the department
1017 shall develop standards that must include, but need not be

1018 limited to:

1019 a. The orientation and integration of the facility with
1020 respect to its physical site.

1021 b. The amount and type of glass employed in the facility
1022 and the directions of exposure.

1023 c. The effect of insulation incorporated into the facility
1024 design and the effect on solar utilization of the properties of

1025 external surfaces.

Page 41 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1026 d. The variable occupancy and operating conditions of the
1027 facility and subportions of the facility.

1028 e. An energy-consumption analysis of the major equipment
1029| of the facility's heating, ventilating, and cooling system;
1030 lighting system; and hot water system and all other major

1031| energy-consuming equipment and systems as appropriate.

1032 2 I F oszoe ] cnatr Ayt Ang o e N T e A sy Do asrtman+ +
e J I [ N i L/_YL/_L\., \SZA Sy w |\ S Hi U WPR S Sy @ § t/uM_L_LQJ.L\.,\A LJ_Y T J_/\_,t/(_A.J_ CITTCTTT O g

1033| FBdueationfor uvseirnevaluating proiects

1034 .4— Standards for construction materials and systems

1035| based on life-cycle costs that consider initial costs,

1036 maintenance costs, custodial costs, operating costs, and life
1037 expectancy. The standards may include multiple acceptable

1038| materials. It is the intent of the Legislature to require

1039| district school boards to comply with these standards when

1040| expending funds from the Public Education Capital Outlay and
1041 Debt Service Trust Fund or the School District and Community
1042 College District Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund and
1043 to prohibit district school boards from expending local capital
1044 outlay revenues for any project that includes materials or

1045 systems that do not comply with these standards, unless the
1046| district school board submits evidence that alternative

1047 materials or systems meet or exceed standards developed by the
1048 department.

1049
1050 It is not a purpose of the Florida Building Code to inhibit the

Page 42 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1051| wuse of new materials or innovative techniques; nor may it

1052| specify or prohibit materials by brand names. The code must be
1053 flexible enough to cover all phases of construction so as to
1054 afford reasonable protection for the public safety, health, and
1055 general welfare. The department may secure the service of other
1056| state agencies or such other assistance as it finds desirable in
1057| recommending to the Florida Building Commission revisions to the
1058 code.

1059 (2) APPROVAL.—

1060 (a) Before a contract has been let for the construction,
10061 the department, the district school board, the Florida College
1062 System institution board, or its authorized review agent must
1063| approve the phase III construction documents. A district school
1064| Dboard or a Florida College System institution board may reuse
1065| prototype plans on another site, provided the facilities 1list
1066| and phase III construction documents have been updated for the
1067| new site and for compliance with the Florida Building Code and
1068 the Florida Fire Prevention Code and any laws relating to

1069 firesafety, health and sanitation, casualty safety, and

1070 requirements for the physically handicapped which are in effect
1071 at the time a construction contract is to be awarded.

1072 (b) In reviewing plans for approval, +the—departments the
1073| district school board, the Florida College System institution
1074| Dboard, or its review agent as authorized in s. 1013.38, shall

1075 take into consideration:

Page 43 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026
1076 1. The need for the new facility.
1077 2. The educational and ancillary plant planning.
1078 3. The architectural and engineering planning.
1079 4. The location on the site.
1080 5. Plans for future expansion.
1081 6. The type of construction.
1082 7. Sanitary provisions.
1083 8. Conformity to Florida Building Code standards.
1084 9. The structural design and strength of materials

1085| proposed to be used.

1086 10. The mechanical design of any heating, air-

1087 conditioning, plumbing, or ventilating system. Typical heating,
1088 ventilating, and air-conditioning systems preapproved by the
1089| department for specific applications may be used in the design

1090 of educational facilities.

1091 11. The electrical design of educational plants.

1092 12. The energy efficiency and conservation of the design.
1093 13. Life-cycle cost considerations.

1094 14. The design to accommodate physically handicapped

1095| persons.

1096 15. The ratio of net to gross square footage.

1097 16. The proposed construction cost per gross square foot.
1098 17. Conformity with the Florida Fire Prevention Code.
1099 (c) The district school board or the Florida College

1100 System institution board may not occupy a facility until the

Page 44 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA

1101
1102
1103
1104
1105
1106
1107
1108
1109
1110
1111
1112
1113
1114
1115
1116
1117
1118
1119
1120
1121
1122
1123
1124
1125

H O U S E O F R E P R E S ENTAT I

HB 1321 2026

project has been inspected to verify compliance with statutes,

rules, and codes affecting the health and safety of the
occupants. Verification of compliance with rules, statutes, and
codes for nonoccupancy projects such as roofing, paving, site

improvements, or replacement of equipment may be certified by

the architect or engineer of record, and verification of

compliance for other projects may be made by an inspector

PR -l IR [ N, N 4
C 11T Ly T A8

epartment—or certified pursuant to chapter 468

The board shall

ooy
A g -

7
who is not the architect or engineer of record.
maintain a record of the project's completion and permanent
archive of phase III construction documents, including any

addenda and change orders to the project. The boards shall

provide project data to the department, as requested, for
purposes and reports needed by the Legislature.

(2 PEN/ITODW DDACTNIDL Th Coamma oo n r £ T Aa~a o n ah 11

\ = INLTV ITLIvV =1 |\ B B W B W ) [ N o N ) UITIHIT 10 O TUTT T = L ENAW B U 5 WPy @ B U S W i § [ & = ==
o rnorat R+ ] rada DPaaa 7T 3~y D oo n 2 AN~y T 1
\.z\J\JtJC-LCALl—C W ITCTT T (LI S U s S SR W 4 @& § Uu_L_L\J._Lll\j A7 B ) 1 A STND RS S N i 3 1T QL\J.\J._LCOO_LLL\j @ g
o517 ot o no A3 a4+ o EVSE B rie At N+ o no Tz lxza e~y nroszil og no
\-iLACQL—_LullQ, \J-_LQtJLAl—CQ, A\ = _Llll—CJ_tJJ_CL_uL__LULLQ _LllV\J_LV_Lll\j T tJ_L\JV_LQ_LUllQ

+ 1 ] rr1da DPaaa 1 A~y A wah 1 oh o~z oot e~ o n £

O T (LI N U g S SR W 4 @& § J._)LA_L_L\J._LLL\j A AW AW & w WITITCTTT \j\JVC.Lll T CUTT o C IO OCTIUIT A\ -
kbl o~ Adrroaat+ o na] ENEA B NE NP i B TS T N I B I o A Sy oot na
tJLalLJ_L_L\.z ASPAW L U L Uy 5 N USl S W i i @ R ) ATTE u.11\./_|__|__|_u..1__y [ NI & 1) U Ep Sy wrpn B W Ry aATTE u.11_y \JLJJC\./L_LULLQ

Page 45 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00

V E S




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

1126
1127
1128
1129
1130
1131
1132
1133
1134
1135
1136
1137
1138
1139
1140
1141
1142
1143
1144
1145
1146
1147
1148
1149
1150

bl 3 o PPN S EPE NN NN N N i B NV ol 2+~ il nartmandt

LJUJ\J_L_L\./ O T T T I UTIT T ull\./_L_L_LLAJ__Y J S € N W S N Sy WS =] T oL LJLA.J_ CTIT T

aha1 1 o~ 2 o N N sz 1 a1 + o~ hoaarA 4+ -~ oot A~~~ )

[SSJ N Iy & Ry S LJULJ_L_LUJ.J. AT T VOO T TTOOT ja [y LA L Iu mpw § T I OO T \/ULJ_L [=J
£ + Q4 Reomiid ramaeanrnt o £ TAa b g AT T~ ] 24+ 2 o~ A o~

g CTIT T CTHCT S %U_LJ_ TIT TTCTO [ S N [ BN AN 5 U B WY @ N UPR S N iy i @ R Y [ S @ N N S S S U =] I o oTT

A~ A~ o A 73 o2 n + rat m Aornartmandt W17 o]

LTTT TTOTITT T AT - VIO ITUTT CITCT T T T J N A By \A\,LJLAJ_ CITTCT T T [SSJ5 &> iy S =y TTTTO IO

WA B S N BN NP R N T N 2N | + S 11 Tt oaractad Ao e S o oo

[ S\ 5\ U I S U SN i ) &P R \/ULJ_L =] VOO T TTOO T ja | g [ E N Ay Wy - [ A8 T O UITTO g T (& LJJ__L\./

ISEEE oF o B SN S roasATIAY Aot o

[V N N S S W i P i ) W) ja [ S N W) N VA W A\ AW e ey

Section 20. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) and subsection
(2) of section 1013.371, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1013.371 Conformity to codes.—

(1) CONFORMITY TO FLORIDA BUILDING CODE AND FLORIDA FIRE
PREVENTION CODE REQUIRED FOR APPROVAL.—

(a) Except as otherwise provided in paragraph (b), all
public educational and ancillary plants constructed by a board
must conform to the Florida Building Code and the Florida Fire
Prevention Code, and the plants are exempt from all other state
building codes; county, municipal, or other local amendments to
the Florida Building Code and local amendments to the Florida
Fire Prevention Code; building permits, and assessments of fees
for building permits, except as provided in s. 553.80;
ordinances; road closures; and impact fees or service
availability fees. Any inspection by local or state government
must be based on the Florida Building Code and the Florida Fire
Prevention Code. Each board shall provide for periodic
inspection of the proposed educational plant during each phase

of construction to determine compliance with the Florida

Page 46 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1151 Building Code andy# the Florida Fire Prevention Code—and—the

1152 Q4 Remiidroamaeant o £ TAa ot g AT T~ ] 240 A
T CTHCT S %U_LJ_ TIT TTCTO [ S N I TUO O T T T UTITT T [ S @ N N S S S U (2K}

1153 (2) ENFORCEMENT BY BOARD.—It is the responsibility of each
1154] Dboard to ensure that all plans and educational and ancillary
1155| plants meet the standards of the Florida Building Code and the
1156| Florida Fire Prevention Code and to provide for the enforcement
1157 of these codes in the areas of its jurisdiction. Each board
1158 shall provide for the proper supervision and inspection of the
1159| work. Each board may employ a chief building official and such
1160 other inspectors, who have been certified pursuant to chapter
1161 468, and a fire official and such other inspectors, who have
1162| been certified pursuant to chapter 633, and such personnel as
1163| necessary to administer and enforce the provisions of such

1164 codes. Boards may also use local building department inspectors
1165| who are certified by the department to enforce the Florida

1166| Building Code armd—the—State Reguirements—for Fduecationalt

1167| ZFaeitities. Boards may also use local county, municipal, or
1168 independent special fire control district firesafety inspectors
1169| who are certified by the State Fire Marshal to conduct reviews
1170 of site plans and inspections and to enforce the Florida Fire
1171 Prevention Code. Plans or facilities that fail to meet the

1172 standards of the Florida Building Code or the Florida Fire

1173 Prevention Code may not be approved. When planning for and

1174 constructing an educational, auxiliary, or ancillary facility, a

1175| board must use construction materials and systems that meet

Page 47 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1176 standards adopted pursuant to s. 1013.37(1) (e)3. are—4= If the
1177| planned or actual construction of a facility deviates from the
1178 adopted standards, the board must, at a public hearing, quantify
1179| and compare the costs of constructing the facility with the

1180| proposed deviations and in compliance with the adopted standards
1181| and the Florida Building Code. The board must explain the reason
1182| for the proposed deviations and compare how the total

1183 construction costs and projected life-cycle costs of the

1184 facility or component system of the facility would be affected
1185| by implementing the proposed deviations rather than using

1186| materials and systems that meet the adopted standards.

1187 Section 21. Subsections (3) and (4) of section 1013.41,
1188 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1189 1013.41 SMART schools; Classrooms First; legislative

1190| purpose.—

1191 (3) SCHOOL DISTRICT EDUCATIONAL FACILITIES PLAN.—It is the
1192| purpose of the Legislature to create s. 1013.35, requiring each
1193 school district annually to adopt an educational facilities plan
1194 that provides an integrated long-range facilities plan,

1195 including the survey of projected needs and the 5-year work

1196| program. The purpose of the educational facilities plan is to
1197 keep the district school board, local governments, and the

1198| public fully informed as to whether the district is using sound
1199| policies and practices that meet the essential needs of students

1200 and that warrant public confidence in district operations. The

Page 48 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

0] Y
+ th D o O Y
a iy 0] H O
Q - s ® — .
g 4 P H 4 [} — n o o o
Pl -H o8 D wn el O 0} o o
[ —H H P E - @) T 0 Y - O
© [OR - 18} @ P D 1Y) a ] O (8] ] ~
(OF IENOR ) ¢ N P © & & (o) ] © T O
O @ ® D & D © ~ O (0] <~ Y9 o> 0
o [ - ® @ - £} - a Q i) O O Ur —
D N T ) BT I I )} Y O @ @ ©
Ol ® —H ¢ o -fd - D @ ~ T O —H P 0O n O g @
<l H ® P b ® ~H -H © To] a P n g O 44 © O
Y o B & D -H » < © o 3 0O O < -H
D HORENOFEE ORI} D ~ . O g O H 4 P P
> - M ® D (4] o O 0 S > O ©
Qo 4 3 D W H — o o P 4 g w O
-H ® Uy KT N H ] o - ] n O ~ o A (] 3
T O b ¢ - O 4P — 2 - 0 g wn g o o
0} - E £ O Yoo O ®w <SP0 — O
q @ ) D - e L o] @ D 2 0 ©
O ) . [E1] ) [09) K H D [09) (o] S O < ~ 0 [0)
D - -H D © 4 T -f - 2 -H a O o BH o4 A
= G U 4 -H F£ © -H + o oM -4 4 O @) Q
S Ok D 4o -d P D 0 o @ - c H P ©
0 O -4 O P O h 0] CIIO o] P> n P
= ~ 4 $H (7] - O U 0O £ T O ©
N . 0] D - | &9 (ONNe} g O O +H O O O
0] - NI (R )] D o “ 0} e T I I R O
o -H Uy EH @ D D T 4 (o] -~ > 0 0 H H o
1b YH 4 - O @ in} (@) o O 3 O 0]
—  -H d . PP @ N — -4 O 4 w O ®© O A 4
—~ o -H ] 4 < — g Q 4 o YW oo P
-~ -H D O & I~ D ~ -H 0 o P 4 O W
z 0 o P -H B OO O & [ O I ()} O o — 5 0O
® 4 -HoSH o 4b D W ¢ g °”Y © no4 4 © P Y
(o R R P $H H ¢ D O ® wH Y - O & O P O
© D | D D ¢ » - 0 ¢} Z ®© H O & wn 3
s H e o4 & » O D P 4 W Y - oM
o, ¢ -H H T & O 4 O 0] © O W w L O O O
o - o, D T © 9 O < S O & © 4 O O
(0] D o k3 4P D n P O 0O iS] T O ®© <
o -f e L R < T N s Q —=- 3 |1 o wn 4 3 (o}
-~ 4b & ® -H W 4 3 ©W » O . O O T L S Y
2P ™ P fd O O e 0 © -4 n ©n O O O P 0
-~ 0P D - D #H ¢ O D @ T O ¢ © © A H 0}
— P 4 T N N L ) D o] S S O > 0 > p»o oo B
-~ P 4 D » ¢ - . @ T O H P Y ac 4 0O a
O M P P B OE N P N m Mm 0o L o 0 P © g 4 0
© H T ® -4 ® U & ¢ P 3 0 v G 0o < £
oo B ¢ P D b O L0 O H 4 = 0
D 4P e & ¢ & 4w 4 PP G W O g H4 X O £ O ®© O
— ® o b ® #H T O0 A o P @b o O o ]
© —H H ® @ -f D ¢ M A e H W Y 0 ¢ T O
a0 0o} ® D N O )] + ~ m P G — O O wHW o
o -f -H [ ) N ) ¢ 44 0 n 4 0O A ~ ~ O H Y
o~ uh fop) D 4 P B & D D @ @ O 3 S e B L () S N ()
D W S L R R VIR (VB n P 4 4 g - N 0O © P O g
o HA P D #H ¢ & O a} L0 N O 4 wn 0 P
O v -H - h o)) D H P n v . O 4 -m
-3 @ [0} D @ D 0] ® L) q 9] — o P o O “
T @ o o B (VI D D D +H o ™ ©w o ~H O Y4 O
o ¥ i) T = N O P () N O P F e n O w0 LIS B« B N PR
— N M N O ™~ 0w O O 4 N O < 1 W >~ 0w O O 4 N O < W0
(@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) — — — — — — — — — — [QV] [Q\ [Q\ [Q\ [Q\ N
N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N NN N NN
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

Page 49 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

©
[4p] Y 4y @] HO)J
. D [09) D ~ O ¥ in} Ko a
~ -H HOREEI ') o - ® o
™ > 1] D & L0 a © @] n 9] D - -
. — $H - D T P O O 4 O -+ D M 0
™ 0] 0] D -H O D D o - P g 0] o] 0]
— T -H 0] h @ N o~ ] a @] o -H D o O
o O (] [o9) D) [09) ® B 0 0] 0 n 0 =] ©
— O 3 H ® H N O @] © KT ® “ .
o' ¢ P w4 D D P g D 4 ~ 0
. o O D @ D [0} D @ . 0] o O @] (/oI Y)] @]
0 a T & ® —H @ B & 0 < c - 9 D 0
- © B ® [09] [0} @ B “ 3 D D c
“ o) O D @ D 9] D o + + o, & ey Q ©
O —H o b H o $ -H g 9 wn on B
T 4 M P f Q9 & H P A O A H O -—H o Q
a 3 © 2 -H iy & ® 0] P T W X T g ~ YH )
5 Q © @ n ® q o -H B a 0] P O D O 0]
[ ] D ® » fH [T K © n © “~ a n -
T < 0] - D B D D ¥ #H P 0] a + © 9] @]
(OS] “ > W WP H [09) 09] n 0 ] > © @) D P G
P2 A4 5 Q9 0 D b & 7 ¢ o -H Q o Qo 4 3 0=
0, = + B on k3 © D > “ + B @]
O 0 O [T VIR ()] v A o O O o $H <o O
io] 0] 3 0] H ® @ D = o T —+ T a + “~
C O 4 4 @© ¢ ¢ 4y ¢ & P L o og O O A P A O
[ L I S )] NI e 35 ¢ O wn O = O
9] © 9] 3 D B Q, T = - - © 0]
T - o D up & B < T n wn > < W P Y
a4 - 0] 0] H D D @ . “ 0] 0] O O D O
(0] [OTIN )] “ o)l @ -H H D ™ ®n S oH @) o O] o Y
c° g 0 s 1 AN B T TR 1§ RS [t A o P = B o
a o <o 0w  -f » H 0] on 9] D o A > O, n
© O in] © D B » B D () D D [OR ] “ ~ o A )
s} N ®n -4 H O © T ¢ L A O © O Y @)
n (OS] o -f TR ® v A @] n T g D Q Q
T ®© O Wb o ¢ @ D @ <G © -—H P W n P
o 4 o g -H & P O O H +H Y o, 5 -+ .
in] > i} © - D -H b D ~ © O Y o g T
(@] n] © P [0} D i1y 9] © >~ o - O o] “~ @] 0]
g 4949 0 n 0 D £ D D 4 O M KO 4 0
“~ o, 4 -A B o D ® H »q 0] © - QO & < © 3
O 3 () ® D @ 09] D b H o n o @ O [0)
Yy n] 1] (0] HoOX D H N )] @] o P ] 0] S
a )] a “ » on D ~ O, Y - 0] i) @ n G
@] 3 0] —H ® » N ¢ D D 0] O Y 0] a ® i) o
[OJN = T O, 0 D 4 H 4P n O P @ P T o
T < (V] © O VIR @ @© Y © > h o [
Q2 n ¢ H & B B¢ B & T L b 4 Q L T T £ 0
@ T ®©® = O -H e L s B | LR H O B S 0 © D O Q
e “ Y 4y 0] & i1y ~ @] “ Koo ~ “~
in] © 9] [ () D HH @ 9] D [0} 3 O 0] o ¥ & Y 0]
o o) bo4b -Ho4b <~ ] o 4 H o A D S
n Q g wHW ¢ - . o R | @ P g ¢ H o ©
0] Q D q o oo D H B4 >~ o P o ¥ O
- N <] T D )] ® [( I )] ® [0} 9] © @] a a q . ¢ - ©
P4 0 0 O H P D ¢ & H O H O & O ©n -A
—H 0O 49 Y9 H & H o W o@m ¢ D L8 O H B 0 Y
— > -+ O D O 4 o ¢ O - © O T O O W H O
- O 3 g b -H © ¢ £ 4 4 O O M W m g P
o B O O & © @ ¢ ¥ D © D © S 4 ®© O ¢ g A
© O O a [0} D H D D B A o T oo O <o D U4 O r
“H m 9 © n© P O r W D & # O O © QO L 0O D O ©
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1O O [~ 0w O O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
N N N N MmO MO O O O O O O oOS$§$@° SO W0
N N N N N NN N N N N N N N N N N N N N NN N NN
B = T = T = TR B e B L B = T == T R e e L B = TR e L e

Page 50 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1251| buitdpreeess+ This section does not supersede any small, woman-
1252 owned, or minority-owned business enterprise preference program
1253| adopted by a board. Except as otherwise provided in this

1254 section, the negotiation procedures applicable to construction
1255| management contracts and the design-build process must conform
1256| to the requirements of s. 287.055. A board may not modify any
1257| rules regarding construction management contracts or the design-
1258 build process.

1259 Section 23. Section 1013.451, Florida Statutes, 1is

1260 repealed.

1261 Section 24. Paragraph (a) of subsection (3) of section
1262 1013.62, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1263 1013.62 Charter schools capital outlay funding.—

1264 (3) If the school board levies the discretionary millage
1265 authorized in s. 1011.71(2), the department shall use the

1266 following calculation methodology to determine the amount of
1267 revenue that a school district must distribute to each eligible
1268 charter school:

1269 (a) Reduce the total discretionary millage revenue by the
1270 school district's annual debt service obligation incurred as of
1271 March 1, 2017, which has not been subsequently retired, and any
1272 amount of participation requirement pursuant to s.

1273 1013.64(2) (a)5. s+—30E3-642r+ta)r8+ that is being satisfied by
1274 revenues raised by the discretionary millage.

1275

Page 51 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1276| By October 1 of each year, each school district shall certify to
1277 the department the amount of debt service and participation

1278 requirement that complies with the requirement of paragraph (a)
1279| and can be reduced from the total discretionary millage revenue.
1280 The Auditor General shall verify compliance with the

1281 requirements of paragraph (a) and s. 1011.71(2) (e) during

1282 scheduled operational audits of school districts.

1283 Section 25. Paragraph (e) of subsection (1), paragraphs
1284 (a) and (b) of subsection (2), paragraphs (b) and (d) of

1285 subsection (3), paragraph (b) of subsection (5), and paragraphs
1286 (b) and (d) of subsection (6) of section 1013.64, Florida

1287 Statutes, are amended to read:

1288 1013.64 Funds for comprehensive educational plant needs;
1289 construction cost maximums for school district capital

1290| projects.—Allocations from the Public Education Capital Outlay
1291 and Debt Service Trust Fund to the various boards for capital
1292 outlay projects shall be determined as follows:

1293 (1)

1294 (e) Remodeling projects shall be based on the

1295 recommendations of a survey pursuant to s. 1013.31 or, for

1296| district school boards, as indicated by the relative need as the

1297 capital outlay full-time equivalent enrollment in the district.

1298 (2) (a) The department shall establish, as a part of the
1299 Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund, a

1300 separate account, in an amount determined by the Legislature, to

Page 52 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

1301
1302
1303
1304
1305
1306
1307
1308
1309
1310
1311
1312
1313
1314
1315
1316
1317
1318
1319
1320
1321
1322
1323
1324
1325

HB 1321 2026

be known as the "Special Facility Construction Account." The
Special Facility Construction Account shall be used to provide
necessary construction funds to school districts which have
urgent construction needs but which lack sufficient resources at
present, and cannot reasonably anticipate sufficient resources
within the period of the next 3 years, for these purposes from
currently authorized sources of capital outlay revenue. A school
district requesting funding from the Special Facility
Construction Account shall submit one specific construction
project, not to exceed one complete educational plant, to the
Special Facility Construction Committee. A district may not
receive funding for more than one approved project in any 3-year
period or while any portion of the district's participation
requirement is outstanding. The first year of the 3-year period
shall be the first year a district receives an appropriation.
The department shall encourage a construction program that
reduces the average size of schools in the district. The request
must meet the following criteria to be considered by the
committee:

1. The project must be deemed a critical need and must be
recommended for funding by the Special Facility Construction
Committee. Before developing construction plans for the proposed
facility, the district school board must request a
preapplication review by the Special Facility Construction

Committee or a project review subcommittee convened by the chair

Page 53 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1326| of the committee to include two representatives of the

1327| department and two staff members from school districts not
1328| eligible to participate in the program. A school district may
1329| request a preapplication review at any time; however, if the
1330| district school board seeks inclusion in the department's next
1331 annual capital outlay legislative budget request, the

1332| preapplication review request must be made before February 1.
1333| Within 90 days after receiving the preapplication review

1334 request, the committee or subcommittee must meet in the school
1335 district to review the project proposal and existing facilities.
1336 To determine whether the proposed project is a critical need,

1337 the committee or subcommittee shall consider, at a minimum, the

1338 capacity of all existing facilities within—the distriet—as

1339| determined by —theFlorida—TInventeory—of—SechoolHeouses; the

1340 district's pattern of student growth; the district's existing
1341 and projected capital outlay full-time equivalent student

1342 enrollment as determined by the demographic, revenue, and

1343 education estimating conferences established in s. 216.136; the
1344 district's existing satisfactory student stations; the use of
1345 all existing district property and facilities; grade level

1346| configurations; and any other information that may affect the
1347 need for the proposed project.

1348
1349
1350

Page 54 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

O H
h O u ~
4b ) ™ YH ¢
O o] T e ) ¢ D 4p a ¢
-H 4 ™ HoOE -t -H @ D D
Hoop O Lo D & b @ P D -H D
1D T, 3 O O D D 4P (VO] @
O P - () > L@ QL O W% H0B D @ -
- [o9] 0] ©) ) - D D 0 4 -H PP
HO) 0} — S . N D N HO) N P P
K 0] 3 Q, 0 ow op] D o 4P D H D
® D K < ~ o, D D 4 B o & HooH oW
P © 0] 0¥ D 9 v ¢ N -
YH 0] s ) D T n 0 -fd !
i D S G T o HOoQ I OB B -4 P4 U
b o ¥ @ = 4P D S P T P g Y
< H N < n 0 P & 0 Q € § D
¢ P D S M Q - n - D b @ P
D [( I ) T O ] D (o (0] 4 0 oy (VI ()
-H © o O o o c @ Y ® D 1P H D
PP o, < T @© O @ ¥ - D 4d D, D D T 4
® bl o, B -~ A D [o9] @ B R (O PR (8 ®
D4 D ® T - L T & B0 Q L 4 ¢ VI .
B D P 0] O, ®© D n ¢ [09) Eib D n
o (OB £ 0 L2 E O O 0 ~ B 4 D T S ) B I X =
Mmoo &£ 0 - o 0 5 ¢ W Q o ¢ b O @ 8
D 5 o O T A b ¢ D b O & ¢ S
Y4 - = — ] D 4b i s U 0 iy D D <+ S
D 4P > (O @ B O P ® 4b D H © ©
(O] PP n A Y D ¢ Hoo-H 4P H D -H & N ‘S o
HOR O A o T L Y D £ 4P D o <
KA [ IS bR Y o P -H E b & T ¢ 7o) -
B & O O > O T ¢ 0 v 3B D b T B Q@ ® @
D oo P o -H © 0] ~ > D ® & [99] D o € D & ()] =
an H s ~ r < @ [( I ¢ EN D ey D ¢ D © =
OFI. S QO O O & 4 “ 0 P o O & o 3
D (] 99} iu] 4 M - — D (] [99] D b - D =
4b & o P 0 (o} —H [( I (OB . P - D H =)
| o O B o o -f o n & & 4 bRt (%)
$oWh b &+ . E < L B O D B D ()N DR (VIR - = =
wm oo R ©) © QO ® - [ - ~ B (V] £ - o
¢ & O e} O v HA P O 4h 4 D ._L [99] Hoo@ =
-Ho 4P b =) 9 A O P nm ©  -H ® 0] H H4b [09] D Py
o —H KON e NS s TS 4 (R ) D 0 D c
T + T 4 5 0 0 D B P W H O ¢ © -fd - o
¢ n v nw T O P 4 o -f ORI D P ¢ D 4 ! 5
YH ® oy G ) o] n P P Hoop [E IR [99] D € QN - o)
b H O T O > T A W P Q000 o D H Ul 3
o0 ¢ 0O o Mm T S YW un -d HOOE @ b O b I O, D ®
n B D M o o - D b B (RN # q =
h £ 0 Q Y 0 O go} Wi 0 . ¢ Hoo N B4 ©
o & @ £ < o O <O 0 HO) B T R S (V] — D W @
B D 4P D H [ = 0] Q D D N [OJES | D b & - D D
4 O » §e} e ] 1 Y, - B! | R PR O] O 4P A .
~ 0 ~ + S B D, ¢ ¢ P D (VIS (V]
(V] H ¢ - © Af “ D D © P P ox & T L D
o o 2 0 Y P £ & L @ & v @ 3
N1S T )] D o . 7 0O M . 7 o o P D & & D o M - & D 4b =
N O N o\ g W ¢ 8 3 P 0 T s O N Q
o0 P SN D o) o -5 S SR Y =
U iR L P 0} H PO H @ — P () e
G T V) D n  ®© Do @ o O X ¢ ) b ¢ ¢ O )
f & £ G oD —H G D b & ¢ 0 & Q& 0 ¢ =
B ® [ON T W0 n © Q [a g o & )] -H [ I R P v )
o
(&)
— N M T O~ 0 O O 4 N MO < 10 W ~ o O O A N O < 0
0N 1 0w wn www N YW LW YW YW VW VW Y WY Y v~~~ >~
M M MmO M MmO MO O MO MO O MO O O O O O O O O O O 0 O O "
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1376| improvements,—the<cost—of complying with publie shelter and

1377 hiterara ~ o haordarm -~y on -~ ramandt o oanat orriinme St AA =
T T 1T 1T OTTT ITTO T OO J.J._I_J.J.\j - %H_I_J_ TIT J.J.L_,u, A\ Ay w A v 1T UTThO |\ o T oL J\J_Y &
1378 Aia~at+r~nr S A~Afa A o o 20692 224 (D) oot o £ AL I S
1o Tho T - 4O oL [ S A oL [ S =] v ~ I\ VAN A\ A S i ey ) g =] \./UJ__LL,_Y
1379 Aharm s~ o S A A sy +1h o 1 PSS S A~ o o o Al
TTTITTTT O TIT TTCTO LA.LJLJJ_UV oL J\J_Y CTIT [\ I W W g [ & gu = L.,_Y ULJ \./_LLA._L_LUL.,, AW N
1380 mrforaa Sl la o~ oo EFoanoaa = A3 ot At Ve Aot
|\ I A A S N =] (&% 3 g o LTI O UITo CTTITO =] Ly _Yullu CTIT |\ N SRS I WS SR S W Sy =] SN i R U S N S
1381 4.7 There shall be an agreement signed by the district

1382 school board stating that it will advertise for bids within 30
1383| days of receipt of its encumbrance authorization from the

1384 department.

1385 5.8+ For construction projects for which Special

1386 Facilities Construction Account funding is sought before the
1387 2019-2020 fiscal year, the district shall, at the time of the
1388 request and for a continuing period necessary to meet the

1389| district's participation requirement, levy the maximum millage
1390 against its nonexempt assessed property value as allowed in s.
1391 1011.71(2) or shall raise an equivalent amount of revenue from
1392 the school capital outlay surtax authorized under s. 212.055(6).
1393| Beginning with construction projects for which Special

1394 Facilities Construction Account funding is sought in the 2019-
1395 2020 fiscal year, the district shall, for a minimum of 3 years
1396| before submitting the request and for a continuing period

1397 necessary to meet its participation requirement, levy the

1398| maximum millage against the district's nonexempt assessed

1399| property value as authorized under s. 1011.71(2) or shall raise

1400 an equivalent amount of revenue from the school capital outlay

Page 56 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1401 surtax authorized under s. 212.055(6). Any district with a new
1402| or active project, funded under the provisions of this

1403 subsection, shall be required to budget no more than the value
1404| of 1 mill per year to the project until the district's

1405| participation requirement relating to the local discretionary
1406| capital improvement millage or the equivalent amount of revenue
1407 from the school capital outlay surtax is satisfied.

1408 6.9+ If a contract has not been signed 90 days after the
1409 advertising of bids, the funding for the specific project shall
1410 revert to the Special Facility New Construction Account to be
1411 reallocated to other projects on the list. However, an

1412 additional 90 days may be granted by the commissioner.

1413 7.30+ The department shall certify the inability of the
1414 district to fund the survey—recommended project over a

1415 continuous 3-year period using projected capital outlay revenue
1416 derived from s. 9(d), Art. XII of the State Constitution, as
1417 amended, paragraph (3) (a) of this section, and s. 1011.71(2).
1418 8.3+~ The district shall have on file with the department
1419 an adopted resolution acknowledging its commitment to satisfy
1420 its participation requirement, which is equivalent to all

1421 unencumbered and future revenue acquired from s. 9(d), Art. XII
1422 of the State Constitution, as amended, paragraph (3) (a) of this
1423 section, and s. 1011.71(2), in the year of the initial

1424 appropriation and for the 2 years immediately following the

1425 initial appropriation.

Page 57 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1426 9.32~ Phase I plans must be approved by the district

1427 school board as being in compliance with the building and life
1428 safety codes before June 1 of the year the application is made.
1429 (b) The Special Facility Construction Committee shall be

1430 composed of the following: one representative £we

1431 | <xepresentatives of the Department of Education, a representative

1432 from the Governor's office, a representative of the Legislature,

1433 a representative selected annually by the district school boards

1434| who is from a school district that is not eligible for special

1435 facility funding, and a representative selected annually by the

1436| superintendents who is from a school district that is not

1437| eligible for special facility funding. A representative of the

1438 department shall chair the committee.

1439 (3)

1440 (b) The capital outlay full-time equivalent membership
1441 shall be determined by counting the reported unweighted full-
1442 time equivalent student membership for the second and third
1443 surveys with each survey limited to 0.5 full-time equivalent

1444 student membership per student and comparing the results on a

1445 school-by-school basis with—+theFleorida—TInventory—ofSchoot
1446| Heuses.

1447 (d) Funds accruing to a district school board from the
1448| provisions of this section shall be expended on needed projects

1449 aS—shewn by sugrveyor surveys—under—+the rules—of +the State Board
1450 of Fdueation.

Page 58 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1451 (5) District school boards shall identify each fund source
1452 and the use of each proportionate to the project cost, as

1453 identified in the bid document, to assure compliance with this
1454 section. The data shall be submitted to the department, which
1455 shall track this information as submitted by the boards. PECO
1456| funds shall not be expended as indicated in the following:

1457 (b) PECO funds shall not be used for the construction of
1458 football fields, bleachers, site lighting for athletic

1459 facilities, tennis courts, stadiums, racquetball courts, or any
1460 other competition-type facilities not required for physical

1461 education curriculum. Regional or intradistrict football

1462 stadiums may be constructed with these funds provided a minimum
1463| of two high schools and two middle schools are assigned to the
1464 facility and—the stadiums—are surveyrecommended. Sophisticated
1465 auditoria shall be limited to magnet performing arts schools,
1466| with all other schools using basic lighting and sound systems as
1467 determined by rule. Local funds shall be used for enhancement of
1468 athletic and performing arts facilities.

1469 (6)

1470 (b)1. A district school board may not use funds from the
1471 following sources: Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt

1472 Service Trust Fund; School District and Community College

1473| District Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund; Classrooms
1474 First Program funds provided in s. 1013.68; nonvoted 1.5-mill
1475 levy of ad valorem property taxes provided in s. 1011.71(2);

Page 59 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

i)
a .
© H
— 0] D D H D
o, O ow ¢ H 4P D My 4P
O e “ H ® [{ D, il [«
o~ O >~ © @] B ® D D
[T) g o ®© g L F 4P b @ 0 o —
™ . @M © a O n i D (0] oo D oy 4y
~ 0 s} (@) 0] - - ® D [¢p] 4P -t ® D
. n 4 A4 O n o - E b Ky b D kS Y
™ a - o P e © D ¥ 4 D () JRT) P
— - n Y o -H 0] X @ ke 0] @ D [0} D
o () 0 T S O] D D > O D © 4 D iy
— O & > 3003 O O H H H D » B @
Q o T c Gl Wb H oW [09) ® [09) Ky D b
+ O >~ O 0 O -~ - 0] ® D ® B Y 8 D N —H
n - © a ¢ 4 H B D B Q@ i
> 4 0 WHoo-H N - N ) oo D » O P D ®
a O i} i} @] @] Q| - D [ O] ® —H i) B
- “ 3 ~ O A @ ~ 4P ® — —H [on
o O o o a — ~ D @ — D D D @ @
o) ™M O O o~ H © O h P H P P ) P
o n A o~ -A -+ — o £ [T R v (R L D Y
T O © . P i} @] “ “ o e -d [ I ' D ® HOj
-~ a P ™M O @ @] @] O| -H D i) 9] D on D D
> 3 A4 5 0P < o -H @O -H N W» H [o9) Eib
o W Q, O “~ 9] @] 1IN R ~ D H O @ ® ® ® D 9]
“ © — i) [99] — - i1y a9 q D + o a e B
0, g O n P O ~ > O @& ¢ D -H D R
© - o g >~ O — O D O D 1p -H H O HO) .
(9] [ SIS (9] O Q 4 C (@) — ol & -H A ® D 4 [(V I | (V] b
io] o O 0 O © O @] © nl 4 4@ Rty ~ QO v £ ¢ D
c O -4 g 3 »Pon o 3 VRO PR (VIR A N1 S I s B B O N ~ O
85y [ 2 P a @) c o ® © 4 H ® [« I
H o P 0] 0 0] 0] 0 a O O, [69) 5T 1 D V1 E ] D T ] 4 q -H
n T G s - o -A D @ D © & D
E o 4 0 Y 0o T < LT 0 O o O 0 ) o
T O AN T > 0 —~ T O T O &FE ¢« P O & -4 & & D
9 - = g o A o B9 ¢ ¢ ¢ P OO PP ~ -f
o P o > © g < Pyl e AP g B H @ H 4
o A P O iE) c n | E B n 4 (0] ® q
& a S [ [9) e © © ®© 50w HOREEY] s ¢ & P > P
[a T o O o, O @) [9) — g . oo N O 4D D D @ K 4
@] ~ 0 T “ “ “ O @] ® HO] D B §0) ® ® H
n o O 1] n] 0] O @] @] © @] H (OFEEEN O TR | B 09}
T 0] o] )] — O Y 4y 4y 0] D n & D D )] @ @
4 M £ g 0 © O n o TR T O SR (R S ¢ ¢
NG o 3 0 P X N O ] & [op] [69) (0] EH & ) [«
N L O O W o o o D 4 D D o D
“~ “ jan 0] in] AN M — a @ 9] 0] 0] H D . [ ba D
O O g < S ~ ~ ~ N D D D - A~ D ORI
Qo “~ © in] @ O -~ O N o n 0] [0} ¢ P W P )] H
4 O o -H = (@) 3 [E1] D D ¢ T H b
0 o o YW o <o wvr vr Ur e\ D -H 4 b b D ¢
= « O O b = 0 (V1 A DR o NN S N« S R 1 1 w -
(@] N NG 1S - >y QO D Rty [0} B D [ON D @
O U O™ M~ c = ~ . . . “ 0 B -m £ P P HH N
[T T @] 0 T Q @] © © D 4P qoP P @ Ky D D
0 “~ . | 0] H 3 0] 0] 9] 4P ® H D o O D [o))
n P o g P O O o -t 1 S ) T v P - q o
© n © “~ @ O © @] Y -m ¢ D [OFEE) Hooud - (V]
— H O Yy o O Y B0 Y P D @ D 4 @ UH 4 G
o N 4 v 9 wn O ~ O d s O BH T O O d ol q
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1O O [~ 0w O O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
~ ™~ [~ [~ 0 oW W 0 W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O
ESTEEEE S S A S SR LS R S SRR LS S cERE S U LS RS I AR LR LS IS RS (IS LR S LR To)
R = T B L B = T = T = I B L B L e e e R R R

Page 60 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026

1501 2. School districts shall maintain accurate documentation
1502 related to the costs of all new construction of educational
1503| plant space reported to the Department of Education pursuant to
1504| paragraph (d). The Auditor General shall review the

1505| documentation maintained by the school districts and verify
1506| compliance with the limits under this paragraph during its

1507 scheduled operational audits of the school district.

1508 3. Except for educational facilities and sites subject to
1509 a lease-purchase agreement entered pursuant to s. 1011.71(2) (e)
1510 or funded solely through local impact fees, in addition to the
1511 funding sources listed in subparagraph 1., a district school
1512| board may not use funds from any sources for new construction of
1513 educational plant space with a total cost per student station,
1514 including change orders, which equals more than the current
1515 adjusted amounts provided in sub-subparagraphs l.a.-c. However,
1516| 1if a contract has been executed for architectural and design
1517 services or for construction management services before July 1,
1518 2017, a district school board may use funds from any source for
1519 the new construction of educational plant space and such funds
1520 are exempt from the total cost per student station requirements.
1521 4, A district school board must not use funds from the
1522 Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund or
1523 the School District and Community College District Capital

1524| Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund for any new construction of

1525| an ancillary plant that exceeds 70 percent of the average cost

Page 61 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 1321

b th U D
4 By D D My
® D 9] 9] + on] © 4
- ™M D P W D RS H @
o H —H ® )] -rH D ey [4p] ® D D
e P -Ho £ O D D D b P
H ¢ D E P - D o 4 O H H P
D B » D @ ¢ 4 v o H uh ® n
b - ® ® - ® D oo —H [09) D D [OaIEY ] q
[V ")) c 4 © D ® D © # O D W @
] §O) D [(ON. ] B P A b @ & n & b 4 D -
B @ HO) D B D + - ® @ 9] D D ®
. T & e -H P ¢ oL o B 4 D D o, D p ~ o4
()] sHo 4D k< D D ®© -H [\ TRIS) D U D © ¢ D D
— k< [09) H b D 09] . g 4P i D oo H H B D @
O @ D Ky H @ RiY) D (O 1] ¢ F D ~ B -H D
O b H W B B D L O b O W D &F D ¢ IS R () N1 R ¢
Nef ® H ® v - QO -H [09] [ IS [09) - @ ¢ - D
@) #H @ ~ [99) o Moo H H D [99] o - B N D
(] h O @ -H D T # ® D 4 D @© @ D & Y HO)
® [0} D -H D [09] D @ 09 @ oW [OTRT)) [} 1 SR R DR ()}
— - ¢ o PP - v P A D D U D N D D
— @ #$ ¢ PO D O T P ™ O D . P ¢ ¢ 0w
© i} o - B — 9] B D o) o] O Y D (VI |
¢ $H D ¢ & H @© P H H -d D - D ® D @ — ®
4 4 -H - D 4 H  F D B D D @ ~H & » @ H p D
(@) ® P O @ B ®n D D 4P D D -H Ef D D 4D D D Y o
4 H ¢ & ¢ © «© O D 4@ H D HooO ¢ @ T @ D
b2l YH D & -H 0] ® K ) D ® . [OFEE. D D o4l -
o [69) D —H [09) D [09) (O P B (0] ) @ D 4
(@] 4 —H H [ ® —H -H o D Q, D fH ®
-~ ® 9] ® D 0] B4 ® N D 4b ~ o] D -H D # P
s} © ¢ W o @ P O H ®W £ © ! (VI D & H# U n 0
@) o & - D — D O ¢ D $H 4 D = L@ D T WP D
5 - HOJ ® ® D Rty D 0] + [ON N -f B H D )] Eiy)
4 o d -H P & £ ¢ © ~ v @ 4P H P 4 @
) ® (VI ® ® [o9] D D oo D 4 4~ H A ()] ®© 0] @ -t D D
n q [T | O 4H & -H @ D @ ® kel [N M [0} @ ® i) n 4 O
[ N L B ~ 4P 4P ~ - 4P 0] o -H -rH [y 4D )
O n [( I )] [o9) oo N N D 4P [09) H 4y N D D 1b
O ¥p D u D D D ¥ b ¢« © ¢« O -4 P ©n - E P 4 ¢ on
(] -H O - b d © & & ¢ T O W W D & B 4P D
= D H H H #H - p - ® ® H D - D H K3
O & D —H -H H ® b -1 4L 4 $H D o D b ab D ®© < D
(ST D I S T L (VR | U )N - TR S () B () N R O . (A OF | & [HE SR OF
H D ¢ - [OFEEN )] M- . 4P D D & W -H ¢4 -H b
4 ¢ 4H [0 JRT S R ()} D O ¢ o o P D nh D n N 4P
O [ON 4D ® [( I O B} BTV | oo [ IS (0] D 4 @ [OFEEEN(V D N
[o9) [OJ] @ H Y -H [OFEE Y O & @O 4 D D [0} D
N )] D D D D D T D 991 [ORE | @ oo q
O B O b & P P H O B & & b -H B P D T © D
e) N » B OB 0B ¢ of A d LG H N W T D} .
QW @ & oy R i oo ¢ H (0] a4 4 D D ] ¢ d D - [09]
Ep D D 4 LI < D #H @& T P ® H & P RIS
Q d - KT ® [o9) & - [ I | D D, ¢ P A D [09) [09) . o P o
“~ H D Ky D fH #H - Koo D D 9] [( ) i B @ kY D
VS O w4 -H D (VO] < @ T 4 D o O & -fd W F
5P . B n H [OR . 0] @ - Riy) $H D D D 09} 09} D
o+ o W ~ -fd -f Q B D D & ©® O D D, b & ® - b
(9] # ¢ [09) © D - O ¢ b D D -t o, @ o D
[o9] R L ) D b H ¢ B @ g - oo - ¢ - H
r ¢ > £ O @ LPp 4P P £ T P h O B OH E D
) D LR VIR W v o o O O -d O 3B b Y O B T &
Q, O H ® W 0 D n w b # ¢ o O o ® b & © -d
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1O O [~ 0w O O 4 N O < 10O O~ w O O
N N N N MmO MO O O O O O O oOS$@° SO oo W0
[To R Vo B To N Vo B To NN o NN Vo NN o BN To NN To BN To NN o BN To NN o NN Te NN o NENNTe NN To NNNTe NN o NN TO NN o NNNNTO NN To BENNTO)
R = T B L B e R T R L B e B T = T T B L B I = T = B R

Page 62 of 64

d are additions.

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb1321-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

1551
1552
1553
1554
1555
1556
1557
1558
1559
1560
1561
1562
1563
1564
1565
1566
1567
1568
1569
1570
1571
1572
1573
1574
1575

ot o o Naaaad PN S R o P P NN N N SIE S SIP DN 11 bhd 2~
\SZA Ny w [ S N =] AR g _Lll\j [ N S WP S = o1IT A LJU_LllL_, Ul T L UuUcT U 1UlTy _L_I_\jJ.J. L_,_I_J.L\j
arm~ae~a £ ~71 doar o~ £ nt AWNE IR~ NP L I~ a1 g cg

ULJ \./_LJ__L\./LA._L_L_Y A8 U_L\jll oL [ S N llL.,J__Y LJU_LllL., =] \./UJ__LL.,_Y, =] \./UJ__LL.,_Y

oM o EEEE I e SI I | clea A ] Aalea ey AAxza A~ ] ot prae o o~

CCTIT L TLOoy O C U T 1O O T AT O T _Lll\j A8 AV Sy = - - C T UTTI 10T
FNPTE S I = aszat Arme foan~arme~y A~od ~n A raszant 2ot anaa A o nt
=] \./UJ__LL.,_Y U_YUL, J.I.I.U, J.J.\./_Ll.l\j oL U_L\jj.l. oL ja LJJ_ \4 T LT TT T COCr - J.J.L_,J__Y
1t N ST N IS E RS il let e £ ~Taaa + EPSP N PNE I N

LT TT T & J\JU_L_L\A_Lll\j, [P\ R S (= LJJ_VVJ_ \j_l_uuu, o T CTT T \./LA.LJ_LL,LA_L

PN SR T S GO I S Y G NS = B SN T T 2N acnh 1 oo fat+ JSEENENPE BN I P SR 5
CUTho C I OCTTITUTT LT CCTTINOS ut/t/J_UV\.,\A. LJ_Y T [N I L W A W g u(.A.J_\.,L.,_Y ut/\.,k/_l_u_l__l_uk., \a
PP | I N N D =T RN I S TS S-NESP . Azt 2 A~ — E NP

CTITo U J\JU_L_L\A._Lll\j Q\JVUJ__LL.,_Y [ S N TV A=A AT A & i e i W i & a mpy O _L_L_L(./LJ__Y, o

Section 26. Subsection (6) of section 1013.68, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

1013.68 Classrooms First Program; uses.—

(6) School districts may enter into interlocal agreements
to lend their Classrooms First Program funds as provided in
paragraph (2) (c). A school district or multiple school districts

that receive cash proceeds may, after considering their own new

construction needs ewttined—in—their S—year distrietfaeilities
work—pregram, lend their Classrooms First Program funds to
another school district that has need for new facilities. The
interlocal agreement must be approved by the Commissioner of
Education and must outline the amount of the funds to be lent,
the term of the loan, the repayment schedule, and any interest
amount to be repaid in addition to the principal amount of the
loan.

Section 27. Paragraph (b) of subsection (3) of section

1013.735, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

Page 63 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 1321 2026
1576 1013.735 Classrooms for Kids Program.-—
1577 (3) USE OF FUNDS.—In order to increase capacity to reduce
1578 class size, a district school board shall expend the funds
1579| received pursuant to this section only to:
1580 (b) Purchase or lease-purchase relocatable facilities +hat
1581 aFre—Fr—execess—of retocatables ddentifieddnthe distrietts—5
1582| wyear—work program adeoptedprior—+to Mareh15—2003.
1583 Section 28. This act shall take effect July 1, 2026.

Page 64 of 64

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1321-00



